| Roll    | Call Nu   | mber              |                    | -                   |                | Agenda Item Num  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|---------|---|-------------------|--------------------|---------------------|----------------|--|--|--|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Date    | te January 22, 2007   |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | WI<br>of various r  | HEREAS<br>eplacem | S, the Ponent vehi | lice De<br>cles; ar | partment<br>nd | requested the Purchasing Division to solicit bids for purchase |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | WHEREAS, the Purchasing Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V07-059 to twelve (12) potential bidders with five (5) bids received; and  |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids for ITEMs 1, 4 and 6 were received from Charles Gabus Ford, 4545 Merle Hay Road, Des Moines, IA 50310, at a total cost of \$513,757.15; and  |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids for ITEMs 3, and 5 were received from Bob Brown Chevrolet, 4224 Merle Hay Road, Des Moines, IA 50310, at a total cost of \$39,240.62; and  |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM 2 was received from Stivers Ford, 1450 E. Highway 6, Waukee, IA 50263, at a total cost of \$40,416.00; and   |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | WHEREAS, funding for ITEM 6 (\$73,814.40) is available from POL070300/School Resource Officer Program, and funding for all other ITEMs (\$519,599.37) will be secured through the City's master lease-purchase agreement; and   |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator, the Police Department and the Fleet Maintenance Manager recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids;   |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the aforementioned low dollar compliant bidders for various replacement vehicles at a total cost of \$593,413.77, subject to obtaining the necessary financing through the City's master lease-purchase agreement with Bank of America, Supplement B8. |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         |   |                   |                    |                     |                | Moved byto adopt   |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | Approved  | as to for         | m:                 |                     |                | wioved by  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | 1.1   |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | anno  | Or Dor            | ulo                |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | Ann DiDonato Assistant City Attorney  |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | Assistant   |                   | <del> </del>       |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| COUNC   | IL ACTION   | YEAS              | NAYS               | PASS                | ABSENT         | CERTIFICATE  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| COW     | NIE   |                   | -                  |                     | <u> </u>       | I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby                  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| COLE    | MAN   |                   |                    |                     |                | certify that at a meeting of the City Council of               |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| KIERI   | NAN   |                   |                    |                     |                | said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,               |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| HENS    | LEY   |                   |                    |                     |                | among other proceedings the above was adopted.                 |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| MAHA    | AFFEY   |                   |                    | <u> </u>            |                | IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my                     |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| MEYI    | ER  |                   | ļ                  |                     |                | hand and affixed my seal the day and year first                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| VLASSIS |   |                   |                    |                     |                | above written.   |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         | TAL   |                   | <u> </u>           | J                   | APPROVED       |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
| MOTION  | CARRIED   |                   |                    | ,                   | MI ROVED       |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         |   |                   |                    |                     |                |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         |   |                   |                    |                     | _ Mayor        | City Clerk   |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |
|         |   |                   |                    |                     | _ mayor        |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |  |

NO RESPONSE:
Karl Chevrolet
Crescent Chevrolet
Deery Chevrolet
Quality Ford
Holmes GMC
McKenna Truck
Bob Brown GMC

| ž   |
|-----|
| 8   |
| ≅   |
| ≧   |
| G   |
| ᇎ   |
| ≊   |
| ᇙ   |
| Z.  |
| ₹   |
| ni. |
| ☲   |
| ₹   |
| Ž.  |
| LL. |
| ō   |
| 눋   |
| 핃   |
| É   |
| ¥   |
| 品   |
| ቯ   |
| Ġ   |
| 빚   |
| ₹   |
| Σ   |
| 띮   |
| Ĭ.  |
| 0   |
| E   |
| Ö   |
|     |

|                   |                       | Stew Hansen Dodge Dewey Ford, Inc. 12105 Hickman Rd. 3055 SE Delaware Des Moines, IA 50323 Ankeny, IA 50021 Net Net Net Des Moines Des Moines |                   | \$23,875.00 \$453,625.00 \$21,604.27 \$410,481.13<br>Ford Crown Vic, 2007<br>3 yrs/36,000     | NO BID  | NO BID  | NO BID   | NO BID NO BID   | NO BID NO BID  |
|-------------------|-----------------------|---|-------------------|---|---|---|--|---|--|
| Bid No. V07-059   | Req.#                 | Ed Siivers Ford, Inc.<br>1450 E. Hwy. 6<br>Waukee, IA 50263<br>Net  | ТВО               | \$21,678.00 \$411,882.00<br>Ford Police Interceptor, 2007<br>3 yrs/36,000                     | \$20,208.00 \$40,416.00<br>Ford F150, 2007<br>3 yrs/36,000                            | NO BID  | \$16,410.00 \$32,820.00<br>Ford Fusion, 2007<br>3 yrs/36,000                         | NO BID  | \$24,793.00 \$74,379.00<br>Ford Escape, 2008                                     |
| Police Department | Opened by: mv         | Bob Brown Chevrolet<br>4224 Merle Hay Rd<br>Des Moines, lA 50310  |                   | NO BID  | NO BID  | \$21,802.17<br>Chevrolet Express, 2007                                      | NO BID   | \$17,438.45<br>Chevrolet, 2007<br>3 yrs/36,000 5 yrs/100,000 drivetrain       | NO BID   |
| Vehicles          | Date Opened: 01/03/07 | Charles Gabus Ford<br>4545 Merte Hay Road<br>Des Moines, IA 50310   | 90-120-180 days   | \$21,440.15 \$407,382.85<br>Ford Crown Victoria, 2007<br>3 yr./36,000 5 yr./60,000 powertrain | \$20,438.49 \$40,876.98<br>Ford F250, 2008<br>3 yr./36,000 5 yr./60,000 powertrain    | NO BID  | \$16,289.95 \$32,579.90<br>Ford Fusion, 2007<br>3 yr.J36,000 5 yr.J60,000 powertrain | NO BID  | \$24,604.80 \$73,814.40<br>Ford Escape Hybrid, 2008<br>3 yr./36,000              |
|                   |                       | Bidder<br>Address<br>City<br>Terms  | FOB:<br>Delivery: | ITEM 1<br>19 Each - Marked Patrol Cars<br>Make/Model/Year<br>Warranty                         | ITEM 2<br>2 Each - Full Size Extended Cab Pickup Truck<br>Make/Model/Year<br>Warranty | ITEM 3<br>1 Each - All Wheel Drive Cargo Van<br>Make/Model/Year<br>Warranty | ITEM 4<br>2 Each - Midsize Sedan<br>Make/Model/Year<br>Warranty                      | ITEM 5<br>1 Each - Front Wheel Drive Cargo Van<br>Make/Model/Year<br>Warranty | ITEM 6<br>3 Each - Special Utility Vehicle Hybrid<br>Make/Model/Year<br>Warranty |