

★ **Roll Call Number**

Agenda Item Number  
34C

Date February 11, 2008

WHEREAS, the Fire Department requested the Finance Department Procurement Division to solicit bids for various fire fighting supplies; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V08-042 to thirteen (13) potential bidders with eight (8) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids were received from the various vendors as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from FIR040700/Operations; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fire Department recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the low dollar compliant bids for various fire fighting supplies as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form at a total cost of \$67,837.48.

Moved by \_\_\_\_\_ to adopt

Approved as to form:

Ann DiDonato  
Ann DiDonato  
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
<b>TOTAL</b>				

**CERTIFICATE**

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

MOTION CARRIED APPROVED

\_\_\_\_\_  
Mayor

\_\_\_\_\_  
City Clerk

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

34C

Bidder Address City Terms FOB: Delivery:	Fire Fighting Supplies	Fire Department	Bid No. V08-042	Req. # -	Danko Emergency Equipment 109 Ash St. PO Box 218 Snyder, NC 68664-0218 Net 30
Date Opened: 12/20/07	Opened by: mv				
FireGuard 4404 S. 76th Circle Omaha, NE 68127 Net 30 15 - 30 days	W.S. Darley & Co. 2000 Anson Drive Melrose Park, IL 60160 Net 30 30 days or less	EDM Equipment Co. 500 East Scott Ave. Des Moines, IA 50309			
8 Each - Self-Contained Breathing Apparatus Tanks	\$1,342.99	\$1,458.00	\$11,664.00	\$1,587.40	\$12,699.20
60 Sections - 1-3/4" Angus Red Chief Fire Hose	No Bid	\$141.00	\$6,460.00	\$171.28	\$10,276.80
30 Sections - 2-1/2" Angus Red Chief Fire Hose	No Bid	\$195.00	\$5,850.00	\$230.31	\$6,909.30
24 Sections - 5" Angus Hi-Vol Yellow Fire Hose	No Bid	\$547.00	\$13,128.00	\$621.73	\$14,921.52
24 Each - Cast products SD0302 Siren Drivers	\$91.31	\$104.00	\$2,496.00	\$115.06	\$2,761.44
48 Each - Spanner Wrenches	\$17.40	\$18.50	\$688.00	\$16.93	\$812.64
Make/Model	Elkhart T-464	Elkhart T-464			Akron Akrolite #10
12 Each - Irons Shoulder Strap	\$33.33	\$38.50	\$462.00	\$44.74	\$35.40 \$424.80
Make/Model	Fire Hooks Unlimited ISS-82	Fire Hooks Unlimited Model 115582			Fire Hooks Unlimited Model 11SS82
12 Each - Water Fire Extinguishers	\$74.11	\$87.00	\$1,044.00	\$77.63	\$79.00 \$948.00
Make/Model	Ansul Model K01-2 430847 w/AD-24	Amerex #240			Amerex M# 240
2000 Gallons - Cherguard Class A Fire Fighting Foam	\$12.09	\$11.65	\$23,300.00	\$13.89	\$71.26 \$28,504.00
12 Each - Fire Extinguishers, 20lb. BC	\$111.19	\$151.00	\$1,812.00	\$111.54	\$132.75 \$1,593.00
Make/Model	Ansul Model C20 429017	Amerex #A412 & #864 Bracket			Amerex M# 4412
12 Each - Fire Extinguishers, 5lb. ABC	\$29.26	\$31.00	\$372.00	\$31.02	\$32.40 \$388.80
Make/Model	Ansul A05VB 429102	Amerex B500T			Amerex M3 B402T
12 Each - Fire Extinguishers, 2 1/2lb. ABC	\$20.40	\$24.00	\$288.00	\$24.19	\$26.75 \$321.00
Make/Model	Ansul A02VB 42101	Amerex B417T			Amerex m# B417T
8 Each - Hydrant Adaptors	\$165.44	\$182.00	\$1,456.00	\$109.88	\$122.64 \$981.12
24 Each - Pop-Up Flashing Cones	No Bid	\$99.00	\$594.00	\$44.80	\$94.00 \$2,016.00
		per case of 4			

Murphy's Fire & Rescue 900 S. 66th Terrace Kansas City, KS 66111 Net 30	Heiman Fire 2320 NW Blvd. Ashton, IA 5 1232 Net 30	Ed M. Feld Equipment Co., Inc. 113 N. Griffith Rd. Carroll, IA 51401 Net Destination 30 - 90 days	First Due emergency Supply Co. 444 Hurffville Crosskeys Rd. Sewell, NJ 05096 Net 30	"NO BID" FROM: Whelen Engineering
4 - 6 weeks	40 - 40 days	30 - 90 days	30 days	NO RESPONSE FROM:
No Bid	Not Available	N/A	No Bid	Clarey's Safety EQ. Hagemeyer Government Sales Municipal Emergency Services Sandry Fire Supply
No Bid	\$154.95	\$148.30	No Bid	
No Bid	\$209.95	\$202.50	No Bid	
No Bid	\$559.95	\$560.00	No Bid	
No Bid	\$114.95	\$99.50	No Bid	
\$18.25	\$16.95	\$18.50	\$22.00	\$1,056.00
Elk T-464 Elk-O-Lite	Elkhart T-464	Elkhart T-464	Akron Akrolite #10	
	\$31.95	\$35.50	\$39.00	\$468.00
	IRS 125	ISS-82	Fire Hooks Unlimited ISS-82	
\$140.00	\$67.95	\$72.00	No Bid	
	\$1,680.00	\$864.00		
Ansul/Sentry 430847	Ansul #22346	Badger 16888B		
\$55.30	\$58.85	\$11.45	No Bid	
\$22,120.00	\$23,540.00	\$22,900.00		
\$190.00	\$149.95	\$121.00	No Bid	
\$2,280.00	\$1,779.40	\$1,452.00		
Ansul/Sentex 429017	Ansul Sentry	Buckeye 12220		
\$60.00	\$29.45	\$37.50	No Bid	
\$720.00	\$353.40	\$450.00		
Ansul/Sentry 429103	Ansul Sentry	Buckeye 26414		
\$49.00	\$21.45	\$27.50	No Bid	
\$588.00	\$257.40	\$330.00		
Ansul Sentry 429101	Ansul Sentry	Buckeye 13315		
No Bid	\$167.45	\$165.00	\$192.50	\$1,540.00
\$1,339.60	\$1,339.60	\$1,320.00		
No Bid	\$31.99	\$35.00	\$28.00	\$624.00
\$767.76	\$767.76	\$840.00		