



**Roll Call Number**

**Agenda Item Number**

**56B**

Date February 12, 2007

WHEREAS, the Fire Department requested the Purchasing Division to solicit bids for various fire fighting supplies; and

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V07-060 to ten (10) potential bidders with nine (9) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids were received from the various vendors as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from FIR040700/Operations; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fire Department recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the low dollar compliant bids for various fire fighting supplies as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form at a total cost of \$128,683.64.

Moved by \_\_\_\_\_ to adopt

Approved as to form:

Ann DiDonato  
Ann DiDonato  
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				

MOTION CARRIED APPROVED

\_\_\_\_\_  
Mayor

**CERTIFICATE**

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

\_\_\_\_\_  
City Clerk

56E  
56C

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION  
PAGE 1 OF 2

	Fire Fighting Supplies		Fire Department		Bid No. V07-60			
	Date Opened: 01/04/07		Opened by: mv		Req. # -			
Bidder	Sandry Fire Supply, LLC		FireGuard, Inc.		Municiple Emergency Services		Clarey's Safety, Inc.	
Address	618 6th Street		4404 South 76th Circle		1751 North County Rd. 20th Ave.		3555 9th St. NW	
City	DeWitt, IA 52742		Omaha, NE 68127		Fremont, NE 68025		Rochester, MN 55901	
Terms	Net		Net		Net			
FOB:	Des Moines		Des Moines		Des Moines			
Delivery:	20 days		45 - 90 days		30 - 45 days			
10 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	\$3,554.00	\$35,540.00	\$3,352.35	\$33,523.50	No Bid		No Bid	
5 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	\$3,554.00	\$17,770.00	\$3,352.35	\$16,761.75	No Bid		No Bid	
50 EA-MSA Heads Up Display Bracket, #10037791	\$19.50	\$975.00	\$17.85	\$892.50	No Bid		No Bid	
30 EA-Self-Contained Breathing Apparatus Tanks-MSA	\$657.95	\$19,738.50	\$659.00	\$19,770.00	No Bid		No Bid	
60 EA-1 3/4" Hose-Angus Red Chief in 50' lengths	No Bid		\$158.40	\$9,504.00	No Bid		No Bid	
40 EA-2 1/2" Hose-Angus Red Chief hose in 50' lengths	No Bid		\$217.20	\$8,688.00	No Bid		No Bid	
18 EA-Forcible Entry Tool-Ziamatic SQB30C	No Bid		\$247.90	\$4,462.20	\$231.00	\$4,158.00	\$267.88	\$4,821.84
6 EA-Hose Adapter-Double Male, 2 1/2" by 2 1/2" NST Make/Model	\$33.60	\$201.60	\$27.70	\$166.20	\$46.43	\$278.58	\$55.00	\$330.00
	Elkhart M327		Eikhart Model M-327		South Park DMA3806 AC		Akron	
6 EA-2 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles-Elkhart 4000-24 Chief Tip	\$635.40	\$3,812.40	\$614.90	\$3,689.40	\$522.00	\$3,132.00	\$344.01	\$2,064.06
6 EA-High Rise Nozzles - Elkhart	\$535.20	\$3,211.20	\$517.94	\$3,107.64	\$488.40	\$2,930.40	\$286.39	\$1,718.34
5 EA-1 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles - Elkhart	\$450.60	\$2,253.00	\$436.06	\$2,180.30	\$396.15	\$1,980.75	\$459.84	\$2,299.20
2 EA-Nozzle Stream Straighteners - Elkhart	\$62.40	\$124.80	\$60.39	\$120.78	\$55.30	\$110.60	\$73.74	\$147.48
4 EA-Nozzle Stacked Tips - Elkhart	\$216.60	\$866.40	\$209.61	\$838.44	\$197.65	\$790.60	\$228.18	\$912.72
2 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA6 200 Watt	No Bid		\$369.03	\$738.06	\$381.00	\$762.00	No Bid	
1 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA7 Dual 200 Watt	No Bid			\$502.58		\$512.00	No Bid	
24 EA-Cast Products SD0302 Siren Drivers-100 Watt	No Bid		\$80.33	\$1,927.92	\$83.00	\$1,992.00	No Bid	
48 EA-Spanner Wrenches - Elk-O-Lite/Akrolite Make/Model	\$15.60	\$748.80	\$12.86	\$617.28	\$14.25	\$684.00	\$29.19	\$1,401.12
	T464		Elkhart T-464 Elk-O-Lite Spanner		Elkhart T-464			
12 EA-Sledge Hammers Make/Model	\$45.35	\$544.20	\$41.93	\$503.16	\$27.00	\$324.00	\$48.00	\$576.00
	FSY-10		Akron FSY-10		Nupla 27109		Akron #FHY-10	
12 EA-Tri Locks Make/Model	\$61.20	\$734.40	\$26.02	\$312.24	\$55.00	\$660.00	\$40.00	\$480.00
	Elkhart 653		South Park #GL48225C		Elkhart 653		Tri-Lock	
2 EA-Positive Pressure Gas Blower	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,581.00	\$3,162.00	No Bid	
12 EA-Water Extinguisher Caring Strap with Pouch	No Bid		No Bid		\$29.50	\$354.00	\$38.00	\$456.00
12 EA-Ladder Safety Belt	No Bid		No Bid		\$128.00	\$1,536.00	No Bid	
12 EA-Water Fire Extinguishers	\$82.75	\$993.00	\$51.97	\$623.64	\$58.75	\$705.00	No Bid	
160 EA 5-Gallon Pails Chemguard Class A Fire Fighting Foam	\$54.80	\$8,768.00	No Bid		\$56.00	\$8,960.00	No Bid	
6 EA-Leader Line Wye-Akron 1581	\$426.25	\$2,557.50	\$474.84	\$2,849.04	\$360.25	\$2,161.50	\$385.00	\$2,310.00
6 EA-Hydrant Valve-Akron1828	\$554.00	\$3,324.00	\$604.36	\$3,626.16	\$464.00	\$2,784.00	\$485.00	\$2,910.00
12 EA-Flashlights-Streamlight SL-20X	\$89.45	\$1,073.40	\$84.66	\$1,015.92	\$79.75	\$957.00	\$80.00	\$960.00
12 EA-Pike Poles-New York Roof Hook Design Make/Model	\$77.20	\$926.40	\$69.89	\$838.68	\$72.25	\$867.00	\$85.00	\$1,020.00
			Firehooks Unlimited #RH-5		Fire Hooks RHS		FireHooks Unlimited	
12 EA-Pike Poles-All Purpose Hook Design Make/Model	No Bid		\$59.14	\$709.68	\$61.25	\$735.00	\$75.00	\$900.00
12 EA-Hand Held Spot Lights Make/Model	No Bid		\$179.89	\$2,158.68	\$14.00	\$168.00	No Bid	
			Collins Dynamics CD-Magnum		Koehler XL 1000			
16 EA-Fire Extinguishers-10 lb. ABC Make/Model	\$58.60	\$937.60	\$32.76	\$524.16	\$34.25	\$548.00	\$67.50	\$1,080.00
	Amerex B456		Ansul		Ansul		Badger	
12 EA-Flat Head Axe - 6 lb. Make/Model	\$63.50	\$762.00	\$36.77	\$441.24	\$27.25	\$327.00	\$37.50	\$450.00
	FHY-6-SF		Akron		Nupla 33661		Akron	
6 EA-Hydrant Adaptors Redhead Style 54 or equal	\$165.70	\$994.20	\$150.86	\$905.16	\$111.00	\$666.00	\$155.00	\$930.00
6 EA-Redhead Style 37 or equal Hydrant Adaptors	\$133.50	\$801.00	\$71.29	\$427.74	\$85.00	\$510.00	\$145.00	\$870.00
1 EA- Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #40B02ZCR Blue LED		\$76.00		\$76.00		\$76.00	No Bid	
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #40R02ZCR Red LED		\$76.00		\$76.00		\$76.00	No Bid	
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #70RC6FCR Red/Clear LED		\$156.70		\$151.61		\$157.00	No Bid	
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #90BB5SCR Blue LED		\$220.00		\$212.26		\$219.00	No Bid	
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #90RR5SCR Red LED		\$220.00		\$212.26		\$219.00	No Bid	
4 EA-Redhead Style S36 or equal Hard Suction Adaptors	\$119.75	\$479.00	\$112.90	\$451.60	\$95.00	\$380.00	\$129.00	\$516.00
1 EA-Roof Ladder-Duo Safety Model #875A	No Bid			\$356.61		\$350.00		\$350.00

1 EA-Portable Flow Meter

No Bid

\$1,337.57

\$1,275.00

No Bid

1 EA-Battle Fogger Smoke Machine  
Make/Model

\$770.00

\$764.52

\$641.00

No Bid

Teletite BattleFogger CFL4200

Tele-lite Battlefogger

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION  
PAGE 2 OF 2

Fire Fighting Supplies      Fire Department      Bid No. V07-060  
Date Opened: 01/04/07      Opened by: mv      Req. # -

Bidder	Whelen Engineering Co., Inc.	Murphy's Transportation	Ed M. Feld EQ. Co., Inc.	
Address	Rt 145 Winthrop Rd.	900 S. 66th Terrace	113 N. Griffith Rd.	
City	Chester, CT 06412	Kansas City, KS 66111	Carroll, IA 51401	
Terms	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	
FOB:			Destination	
Delivery:	30 days	30 days	15-60 days	
10 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA		No Bid	No Bid	
5 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA		No Bid	No Bid	
50 EA-MSA Heads Up Display Bracket, #10037791		No Bid	No Bid	
30 EA-Self-Contained Breathing Apparatus Tanks-MSA		No Bid	No Bid	
60 EA-1 3/4" Hose-Angus Red Chief in 50' lengths		No Bid	\$132.50	\$7,950.00
40 EA-2 1/2" Hose-Angus Red Chief hose in 50' lengths		No Bid	\$186.00	\$7,440.00
18 EA-Forcible Entry Tool-Ziamatic SQB30C		\$295.00	\$5,310.00	\$234.00    \$4,212.00
6 EA-Hose Adapter-Double Male, 2 1/2" by 2 1/2" NST Make/Model		\$45.00	\$270.00	\$46.25    \$277.50
6 EA-2 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles-Elkhart 4000-24 Chief Tip		\$714.82	4288.92	No Bid
6 EA-High Rise Nozzles - Elkhart		\$602.10	\$3,612.60	No Bid
5 EA-1 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles - Elkhart		\$506.92	\$2,534.60	No Bid
2 EA-Nozzle Stream Straighteners - Elkhart		\$70.20	\$140.40	No Bid
4 EA-Nozzle Stacked Tips - Elkhart		\$243.67	\$974.68	No Bid
2 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA6 200 Watt	\$343.20    \$686.40	\$500.00	\$1,000.00	No Bid
1 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA7 Dual 200 Watt		\$467.40	\$680.00	No Bid
24 EA-Cast Products SD0302 Siren Drivers-100 Watt		No Bid		No Bid
48 EA-Spanner Wrenches - Elk-O-Lite/Akrolite Make/Model		\$17.55	\$842.40	\$15.90    \$763.20 Akron #10
12 EA-Sledge Hammers Make/Model		\$65.00	\$780.00	\$37.95    \$455.40 27810 Nupla
12 EA-Tri Locks Make/Model		\$76.00	\$912.00	\$28.50    \$342.00 Elk-653    South Park QL48225
2 EA-Positive Pressure Gas Blower		No Bid		No Bid
12 EA-Water Extinguisher Caring Strap with Pouch		No Bid		No Bid
12 EA-Ladder Safety Belt		No Bid		\$155.00    \$1,860.00
12 EA-Water Fire Extinguishers		\$102.00	\$1,224.00	\$65.00    \$780.00
160 EA 5-Gallon Pails Chemguard Class A Fire Fighting Foam		\$69.05	\$11,048.00	No Bid
6 EA-Leader Line Wye-Akron 1581		No Bid		\$391.00    \$2,346.00
6 EA-Hydrant Valve-Akron1828		No Bid		\$490.00    \$2,940.00
12 EA-Flashlights-Streamlight SL-20X		\$140.00	\$1,680.00	\$87.95    \$1,055.40
12 EA-Pike Poles-New York Roof Hook Design Make/Model		\$90.00	\$1,080.00	\$81.95    \$983.40 Hooks DL RH-5    Fire Hooks RH-5
12 EA-Pike Poles-All Purpose Hook Design Make/Model		\$80.00	\$960.00	\$68.95    \$827.40 Hooks UL APH-6    Fire Hooks APH-6
12 EA-Hand Held Spot Lights Make/Model		No Bid		No Bid
16 EA-Fire Extinguishers-10 lb. ABC Make/Model		\$69.00	\$1,104.00	\$53.10    \$849.60 Ansul #429003    Buckeye 11340
12 EA-Flat Head Axe - 6 lb. Make/Model		\$49.00	\$588.00	\$33.95    \$407.40 Apollo 3FH06    Akron FHY6
6 EA-Hydrant Adaptors Redhead Style 54 or equal		No Bid		\$143.00    \$858.00
6 EA-Redhead Style 37 or equal Hydrant Adaptors		No Bid		\$114.00    \$684.00
1 EA- Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #40B02ZCR Blue LED	\$68.40		\$98.00	No Bid
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #40R02ZCR Red LED	\$68.40		\$98.00	No Bid
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #70RC6FCR Red/Clear LED	\$141.00		\$211.00	No Bid
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #90BB5SCR Blue LED	\$197.40		\$290.00	No Bid
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #90RR5SCR Red LED	\$197.40		\$290.00	No Bid
4 EA-Redhead Style S36 or equal Hard Suction Adaptors		No Bid		\$117.00    \$468.00
1 EA-Roof Ladder-Duo Safety Model #875A			\$450.00	\$341.00

1 EA-Portable Flow Meter

\$1,623.94

No Bid

1 EA-Battle Fogger Smoke Machine  
Make/Model

\$915.00

No Bid

Battle Fogger

**Fire Fighting Supplies**                      **Fire Department**                      **Bid No. V07-060**  
**Date Opened: 01/04/07**                      **Opened by: mv**                      **Req. # -**

Bidder	First Due Emergency Supply Co.	W.S. Darley & Co.	NO RESPONSE FROM:	
Address	444 Hurfville-Crosskeys Rd.	2000 Anson Drive	Heiman Fire EQ.	
City	Sewell, NJ 08080-2339	Melrose Park, IL 60160		
Terms	Net 30	Net		
FOB		Des Moines		
Delivery:	45 days	14 days		
10 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	No Bid	No Bid		
5 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	No Bid	No Bid		
50 EA-MSA Heads Up Display Bracket, #10037791	No Bid	No Bid		
30 EA-Self-Contained Breathing Apparatus Tanks-MSA	No Bid	No Bid		
60 EA-1 3/4" Hose-Angus Red Chief in 50' lengths	No Bid	\$155.05	\$9,303.00	
40 EA-2 1/2" Hose-Angus Red Chief hose in 50' lengths	No Bid	\$204.75	\$8,190.00	
18 EA-Forcible Entry Tool-Ziamatic SQB30C	\$287.77	\$5,179.95	\$242.00	\$4,356.00
6 EA-Hose Adapter-Double Male, 2 1/2" by 2 1/2" NST Make/Model	\$50.12	\$300.72	\$30.50	\$183.00
	Red Head Brass Model BF36	Darley #B24301		
6 EA-2 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles-Elkhart 4000-24 Chief Tip	No Bid	\$322.50	\$1,935.00	
6 EA-High Rise Nozzles - Elkhart	No Bid	\$264.00	\$1,584.00	
5 EA-1 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles - Elkhart	No Bid	\$433.00	\$2,165.00	
2 EA-Nozzle Stream Straighteners - Elkhart	No Bid	\$65.00	\$130.00	
4 EA-Nozzle Stacked Tips - Elkhart	No Bid	\$219.00	\$876.00	
2 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA6 200 Watt	No Bid	\$421.00	\$842.00	
1 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA7 Dual 200 Watt	No Bid		\$575.00	
24 EA-Cast Products SD0302 Siren Drivers-100 Watt	No Bid	\$89.50	\$2,148.00	
48 EA-Spanner Wrenches - Elk-O-Lite/Akroliite Make/Model	\$15.53	\$745.44	\$16.80	\$806.40
	Akron #10	Akron #10		
12 EA-Sledge Hammers Make/Model	\$35.29	\$423.48	\$38.50	\$462.00
	Fire Hooks Unlimited SHF-10	Darley Fire Hooks Unlimited		
12 EA-Tri Locks Make/Model	\$63.33	\$759.96	\$35.00	\$420.00
	Akron #373			
2 EA-Positive Pressure Gas Blower	No Bid	\$2,066.00	\$4,132.00	
12 EA-Water Extinguisher Caring Strap with Pouch	\$36.25	\$435.00	\$47.00	\$564.00
12 EA-Ladder Safety Belt	\$135.00	\$1,620.00	\$142.00	\$1,704.00
12 EA-Water Fire Extinguishers	No Bid	\$66.00	\$792.00	
400-Gallons Chemguard Class A Fire Fighting Foam	No Bid	\$57.90	\$9,264.00	
6 EA-Leader Line Wye-Akron 1581	\$398.40	\$2,390.40	\$398.00	\$2,388.00
6 EA-Hydrant Valve-Akron1828	\$513.00	\$3,078.00	\$513.00	\$3,078.00
12 EA-Flashlights-Streamlight SL-20X	\$98.41	\$1,180.92	\$96.00	\$1,152.00
12 EA-Pike Poles-New York Roof Hook Design Make/Model	\$76.47	\$917.64	\$87.00	\$1,044.00
	Fire Hooks Unlimited RA-5	Fire Hooks Unlimited QH-5		
12 EA-Pike Poles-All Purpose Hook Design Make/Model	\$64.70	\$776.40	\$70.00	\$840.00
	Fire Hooks Unlimited AP4-6'	Fire Hooks Unlimited APH		
12 EA-Hand Held Spot Lights Make/Model	\$15.45	\$185.40	\$22.00	\$264.00
	Optronics QH100	Illuma-Light #PR 100		
16 EA-Fire Extinguishers-10 lb. ABC Make/Model	No Bid	\$59.00	\$944.00	
		Amerex B441		
12 EA-Flat Head Axe - 6 lb. Make/Model	\$36.12	\$433.44	\$43.00	\$516.00
	Akron FHY-6	Council # C60F 36		
6 EA-Hydrant Adaptors Redhead Style 54 or equal	\$165.06	\$990.36	\$184.00	\$1,104.00
6 EA-Redhead Style 37 or equal Hydrant Adaptors	\$134.53	\$807.18	\$98.00	\$588.00
1 EA- Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #40B02ZCR Blue LED	No Bid			\$1,015.00
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #40R02ZCR Red LED	No Bid			\$1,015.00
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #70RC6FCR Red/Clear LED	No Bid			\$186.00
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #90BB5SCR Blue LED	No Bid			\$249.00
1 EA-Whelen LED Warning Light-Model #90RR5SCR Red LED	No Bid			\$249.00
4 EA-Redhead Style S36 or equal Hard Suction Adaptors	\$122.35	\$489.40	\$133.00	\$532.00
1 EA-Roof Ladder-Duo Safety Model #875A		\$367.76		\$355.00

1 EA-Portable Flow Meter	\$1,463.46	\$1,375.00
1 EA-Battle Fogger Smoke Machine Make/Model	\$929.00 Battle Fogger CFL4200	\$892.00 Battle #CFL420