

.....
Date February 23, 2009

WHEREAS, the Fleet Maintenance requested the Finance Department Procurement Division to solicit bids for purchase of various replacement vehicles for city-wide use; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V09-064 to sixteen (16) potential bidders with seven (8) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEMS 3, 6, 10, 11, 14 and 21 were received from Dewey Ford, 305 SE Delaware Avenue, Ankeny, IA 50021, at a total cost of \$245,439.00; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM 13 was received from Charles Gabus Ford, 4545 Merle Hay Road, Des Moines, IA 50310, at a total cost of \$35,919.58; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEMS 1, 8, 12, 15 and 19 were received from Ed Stivers Ford, 1450 E. Hwy 6, Waukee, IA 50263, at a total cost of \$533,056.00; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM 5 was received from Wilson Toyota, 2212 S. Duff, Ames, IA 50010, at a total cost of \$45,362.00; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEMS 7 and 9 were received from Stew Hanson Dodge City Jeep, 12103 Hickman Road, Urbandale, IA 50323, at a total cost of \$85,270.00; and

WHEREAS, all bids for six-cylinder Chevrolet Police Patrol/Pursuit vehicles were rejected for ITEM 7 in favor of lower pricing from Karl Chevrolet, 1101 SE Oralabor Road, Ankeny IA, 50021, per State of Iowa Contract MA3450-09, at a total cost of \$38,904.00; and

WHEREAS, Municipal Code section 2-726© provides for the purchase of goods and/or services from contracts established by the State of Iowa Department of General Services, the Iowa Department of Transportation, or the Iowa Communications Network pursuant to procedures established by chapter 18 Code of Iowa and rules and regulations promulgated thereunder, without conforming to the competitive bidding requirements of the Procurement Division; and

WHEREAS, funding in the amount of \$827,374.00 is available from CMO010407/Equipment Replacement, \$77,665.82 is available from PWK071000/Sanitary Sewers, \$63,544.76 is available from PWK071600/Storm Sewers, and \$15,366.00 is available from PWK100101/Solid Waste Enterprise Fund; and

★ Roll Call Number

Agenda Item Number
44

Date February 23, 2009

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fleet Maintenance Manager recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the aforementioned low dollar compliant bidders for various replacement vehicles at a total cost of \$983,950.58.

m

Approved as to form:

Moved by _____ to adopt

Ann DiDonato
Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				
MOTION CARRIED			APPROVED	

CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

Mayor

City Clerk

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

Bidder
Address
City
Terms
FOB:
Delivery:

Karl Chevrolet
1101 SE Orablaor Road
Ankeny, IA 50021
Net 30

6 - 8 weeks

Ed Stivers Ford
1450 E. Hwy. 6
Waukee, IA 50263
Net 30

TBD

Charles Gabus Ford
4545 Merle Hay Road
Des Moines, IA 50310
Net 30

120 days

ITEM 1

19 Each - 8 Cylinder Patrol Cars
Make/Model Year
Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MGP Rating:

Alt. Bid-2WD Tahoe CC10706

Ford, 2009
3/36K

Ford Crown VicP71, 2009
3/36K

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

14 CMG Only Engine
\$26,740.00
Hood only paint
\$508,060.00
\$350.00 Each

\$415,910.00

N/R
\$23,394.64

\$444,498.16

ITEM 2

3 Each - Standard Hybrid SUV
Make/Model/Year
Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MGP Rating:

Ford Escape, 2009
3/36K

Ford Escape 4WD Hybrid, 2010
3/36K

E85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

29 MPG
\$30,183.00

34 MPG
\$33,870.00

\$90,549.00
\$101,610.00

ITEM 3

3 Each - Standard SUV
Make/Model/Year
Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating

Chevy Trailblazer CT15506, 2009

Ford Explorer, 2009
3/36K

Ford V93 Escape XLT 4WD, 2009

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

14 MPG
\$23,832.00
N/A

13 MPG
\$21,996.00

17 MPG
\$20,855.98

\$71,496.00
\$65,988.00
\$62,567.94

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

N/A

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

Bidder: Stew Hanson Dodge City Jeep
Address: 12103 Hickman Rd.
City: Des Moines, IA 50323
Terms: Net 30
FOB: 7 - 9 weeks
Delivery:

Holmes Honda
11206 Hickman Road
Des Moines, IA 50325

Bob Brown Chevrolet
4224 Merle Hay Road
Des Moines, IA 50310

ITEM 1

19 Each - 8 Cylinder Patrol Cars

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Dodge Charger V8, 2009

3/36K

16 MPG

\$22,927.00

\$435,613.00

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 2

3 Each - Standard Hybrid SUV

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 3

3 Each - Standard SUV

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Jeep Grand Cherokee, 2009

3/36K

16 MPG

\$23,139.00

14 MPG

\$23,139.00

\$69,417.00

\$69,417.00

Honda Pilot LX 4WD, 2009

3/36K, 5/60K power train

16 MPG

\$25,973.11

\$77,919.33

NO BID

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

Bidder

Address

City

Terms

FOB:

Delivery:

Dewey Ford
3055 SE Delaware Avenue
Ankeny, IA 50021

Wilson Toyota
2212 S. Duff
Ames, IA 50010

ITEM 1

19 Each - 8 Cylinder Patrol Cars

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MGP Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Ford Crown Victoria, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
16 MPG

NO BID

12 MPG
\$22,909.00
\$435,271.00

ITEM 2

3 Each - Standard Hybrid SUV

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MGP Rating:

E85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Ford Escape Hybrid, 2010
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
N/A

NO BID

N/A
N/A
34 MPG
\$28,872.00
\$86,616.00

ITEM 3

3 Each - Standard SUV

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Ford Explorer, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
13 MPG
\$20,533.00
N/A

NO BID

\$61,599.00

N/A

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 4

2 Each - Mid Size Sedan

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Chevy Impala 1WB19, 2009

19 MPG

\$20,033.00

Alt. Bid: 17MPG, Impala 1W519

\$19,847.00

Manuals

Ford Fusion, 2010

3/36K

TBD

\$16,677.00

Ford Fusion SE, 2010

3/36K

18 MPG

\$19,226.98

\$38,453.96

\$33,354.00

ITEM 5

2 Each - Hybrid Mid Size Sedan

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Ford Fusion, 2010

TBD

TBD

\$26,101.00

Add \$550.00 for 5 extra keys

\$52,202.00

41 MPG ?

\$25,377.98

\$50,755.96

ITEM 6

1 Each - Small 4WD Extended Cab Pick Up Truck

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Chevy Colorado CT15653, 2009

16 MPG

\$19,402.00

Ford Ranger, 2009

3/36K

14 MPG

\$17,125.00

Ford Ranger XLT 4X4, 2009

14 MPG

\$16,991.30

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 4

2 Each - Mid Size Sedan

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Dodge Avenger SXT, 2009

3/36K

21 MPG

\$16,891.00

20 MPG

\$16,891.00

\$33,782.00

\$33,782.00

ITEM 5

2 Each - Hybrid Mid Size Sedan

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Honda CMC Hybrid, 2009

3/36K, 5/60K, power train, 8/80K

40 MPG

\$22,820.81

\$45,641.62

ITEM 6

1 Each - Small 4WD Extended Cab Pick Up Truck

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Chevrolet Impala 1WB19, 2009

3/36K, 5/100K drivetrain

19 MPG

\$19,565.14

\$48,433.02

\$39,130.28

44

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 4

2 Each - Mid Size Sedan

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Ford Fusion, 2010

3/36K, 5/60 Powertrain

20 MPG

\$17,161.00

N/A

\$34,322.00

ITEM 5

2 Each - Hybrid Mid Size Sedan

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Ford Fusion Hybrid, 2010

3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain

N/A

N/A

41 MPG

\$25,112.00

Toyota Prius, 2009

3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain

48 MPG

\$22,681.00

\$45,362.00

ITEM 6

1 Each - Small 4WD Extended Cab Pick Up Truck

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Ford Ranger, 2009

3/36K, 5/60 Powertrain

14 MPG

\$16,936.00

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 7

4 Each - Six Cylinder Patrol Cars

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

Chevy Impala 901, 2009

NO BID

Ford V8 Police Interceptor, 2009

3/36K

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

17 MPG

\$20,717.00

Manuals

\$82,868.00

\$180.00

N/R

\$23,315.00

\$93,260.00

ITEM 8

1 Each - 8500 GVW 1/2 Ton Cargo Van

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

Ford Econoline, 2009

3/36K

NR

Ford E150 Cargo Van, 2009

3/36K

15 MPG

\$18,537.00

\$19,865.96

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 3017

NO BID

(\$500.00)

Net Total

\$19,355.96

ITEM 9

1 Each - 9900 GVW High Roof, Extended Body Cargo

Van

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

NO BID

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 1611

(\$750.00)

Net Total

(\$750.00)

44

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 7

4 Each - Six Cylinder Patrol Cars

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Dodge Charger V6, 2009

3/36K

17 MPG

\$22,545.00

\$90,180.00

Chevy Impala, 2009

3/36K, 5/100K powertrain

17 MPG

\$22,131.84

\$88,527.36

ITEM 8

1 Each - 8500 GVW 1/2 Ton Cargo Van

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 3017

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 9

1 Each - 9900 GVW High Roof, Extended Body Cargo

Van

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 1611

Net Total

Dodge Sprinter 2500, 2008

3/36K

20 MPG (Diesel)

\$42,180.00

(\$2,000.00)

\$40,180.00

NO BID

NO BID

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 7

4 Each - Six Cylinder Patrol Cars

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 8

1 Each - 8500 GVW 1/2 Ton Cargo Van

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 3017

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 9

1 Each - 9900 GVW High Roof, Extended Body Cargo

Van

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 1611

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 10

2 Each - 9200 GVV Regular Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0082

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0222

Net Total

Chevy Silverado CK20903, 2009

Ford F350, 2009
3/36K
Western ProPlus 1UTPP85

Ford F21 F250 4X4, 2009
3/36K
Western Pro Plus

N/A
\$33,960.00

N/A
\$32,424.00

NR
\$34,466.42

\$67,920.00

\$64,848.00

(\$2,000.00)

(\$500.00)

\$62,348.00

\$68,932.84

(\$1,000.00)

(\$1,200.00)

\$66,732.84

ITEM 11

1 Each - 8200 GVV Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow and Box Topper

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unti #0318

Net Total

NO BID

Ford F250, 2009
3/36K
Western Pro 1UTP75

Ford X14 F150 4X4 SS SC
3/36K
Western Ultramount
14 MPG

N/A

\$34,031.00

(\$1,500.00)

\$32,531.00

\$35,290.30

(\$1,100.00)

\$34,190.30

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 10

2 Each - 9200 GVV Regular Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0082

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0222

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 11

1 Each - 8200 GVV Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow and Box Topper

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0082

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0222

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 10

2 Each - 9200 GVV Regular Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0082

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0222

Net Total

NO BID

Ford F250, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain, 5/100K Diesel
Western IUTPP85
N/A

N/A

N/A

\$32,933.00

\$65,866.00

(\$1,800.00)

(\$2,200.00)

\$61,866.00

ITEM 11

1 Each - 8200 GVV Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow and Box Topper

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0318

Net Total

NO BID

Ford F150, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
Western IUTP75
14 MPG

10 MPG

N/A

\$33,304.00

(\$1,200.00)

\$32,104.00

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 12

1 Each - 8200 GVV Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0456

Net Total

Ford F250, 2009
3/36K
Western Pro 1UTP75

Ford X14 F150, 4X4 SS SC
3/36K
Western Ultramount

N/A

12 MPG

\$29,190.00

\$29,423.30

(\$2,000.00)

(\$1,000.00)

\$27,190.00

\$28,423.30

ITEM 13

1 Each - 12,500 GVV 4WD Pickup Truck with Lift Gate,

Dump Box and Hoist

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Lift Gate Make/Model

Dump Box Make/Model

Hoist Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0379

Net Total

Ford F350, 2009
3/36K

Tommy Gate G2-60-1540 TP3E

Winch Warn M6000

Venco VP6F-ED

N/A

Ford F31, F350 4X4 5DR 1CSR
3/36K

Tommy Gate

Venco

NR

N/A

\$35,919.58

\$41,384.00

(\$1,500.00)

\$39,884.00

\$35,169.58

N/A

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 12

1 Each - 8200 GVV Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0456

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 13

1 Each - 12,500 GVV 4WD Pickup Truck with Lift Gate,

Dump Box and Hoist

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Lift Gate Make/Model

Dump Box Make/Model

Hoist Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0379

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 12

1 Each - 8200 GVW Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

w/Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0456

Net Total

NO BID

\$28,480.00

(\$1,200.00)

\$27,280.00

Ford F150, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
Western IUTP75
14 MPG

10 MPG

N/A

ITEM 13

1 Each - 12,500 GVW 4WD Pickup Truck with Lift Gate,

Dump Box and Hoist

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Lift Gate Make/Model

Dump Box Make/Model

Hoist Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0379

Net Total

NO BID

\$42,413.00

(\$2,000.00)

\$40,413.00

Ford F350, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain, 5/100K Diesel
Tommy Gate Gs-60-1540-TP38
Venco VP6F-ED
Venco VP6F-ED
N/A

N/A

N/A

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 14

NO BID

1 Each - 5000 GVV Extended Cab Pickup Truck

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #-0348

Net Total

	Ford Ranger, 2009	Ford Ranger 4X2 XL	
	3/36K	3/36K	
		15 MPG	
			\$18,428.30
			(\$1,200.00)
			\$17,228.30
			\$16,445.00
			(\$500.00)
			\$15,945.00

ITEM 15--2 EACH WRA & COMM. DEV.

NO BID

4 Each - 5000 GVV Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 0273

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 0274

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 0334

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 0335

Net Total

	Ford Ranger, 2009	Ford Ranger 4X4 XLT, 2009	
	3/36K	3/36K	
	14 MPG	14 MPG	
			\$74,297.20
			(\$2,500.00)
			(\$2,500.00)
			(\$900.00)
			(\$900.00)
			\$67,497.20
			\$66,476.00
			(\$2,500.00)
			(\$2,200.00)
			(\$1,500.00)
			(\$1,500.00)
			\$58,776.00

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 14

1 Each - 5000 GVW Extended Cab Pickup Truck NO BID

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 0348

Net Total

NO BID

Chevy Colorado CS15653, 2009
3/36K, 5/100K powertrain
18 MPG

\$17,734.54

\$0.00

\$17,734.54

ITEM 15--2 EACH WRA & COMM. DEV.

4 Each - 5000 GVW Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck NO BID

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0273

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0274

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0334

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0335

Net Total

NO BID

Chevy Colorado CT 15653, 2009
3/36K, 5/100K powertrain
17 MPG
\$20,814.04

\$88,256.16

\$0.00

\$0.00

\$0.00

\$0.00

\$88,256.16

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 14

1 Each - 5000 GVW Extended Cab Pickup Truck

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0348

Net Total

NO BID

Ford Ranger, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
19 MPG

\$16,166.00

N/A

(\$800.00)

\$15,366.00

ITEM 15--2 EACH WRA & COMM. DEV.

4 Each - 5000 GVW Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck

Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0273

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0274

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0334

Less Trade Allowance: Unti # 0335

Net Total

NO BID

Ford Ranger, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
14 MPG
\$18,301.00

\$73,204.00

(\$2,500.00)

(\$3,100.00)

(\$800.00)

(\$700.00)

\$66,104.00

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 16---AIRPORT

1 Each - Standard SUV

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 2086

Net Total

NO BID

Ford Expedition, 2009
5/100K

NO BID

\$31,661.00

\$31,661.00

ITEM 17---AIRPORT

1 Each - 9200 GVW 4WD Pickup Truck with Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0201

Net Total

Ford F350, 2009
3/36K

Western 1UTMVP85

Ford F21 F250 4X4
3/36K

Western 1UTMVP85

N/A

NR

\$34,950.00
(\$500.00)

\$34,450.00

\$34,693.92
(\$1,500.00)

\$33,193.42

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 16---AIRPORT

1 Each - Standard SUV

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 2086

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

Chevy Tahoe CK10706, 2009
3,36K, 5/100K powertrain

14 MPG

\$35,488.42

(\$1,800.00)

\$33,688.42

ITEM 17---AIRPORT

1 Each - 9200 GVV 4WD Pickup Truck with Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0201

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

Dodge Ram 2500, 2009
3/36K Bumper-Bumper, 5/100 Motor

Western V-Plow #LUTMVPP83

NR

NR

\$28,252.00

\$34,711.00

(\$1,500.00)

\$26,752.00/

\$33,211.00

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 16---AIRPORT

1 Each - Standard SUV

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Hybrid, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit # 2086

Net Total

NO BID

NO BID

ITEM 17---AIRPORT

1 Each - 9200 GVM 4WD Pickup Truck with Snowplow

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Snowplow Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0201

Net Total

NO BID

Ford F250, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain, 5/100K Diesel
Western IUTMVP85
N/A

N/A

N/A

\$34,837.00
(\$1,500.00)

\$33,337.00

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 18---AIRPORT

1 Each - 5500 GVW 2WD Pickup Truck

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0225

Net Total

NO BID

No Bid

Ford R44 4X2 Ranger XLT
3/36K

\$18,279.30

(\$750.00)

\$17,529.30

ITEM 19

1 Each - 9900 GVW Pickup Truck with Dump Box

Make/Model/year

Warranty

Dump Box Make/Model

Hoist Make/Model

Lift Gate Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unti #0357

Net Total

NO BID

Ford F350, 2009
3/36K

Warn Winch M6000

Venco VP6F-ED

Tommy Gate G2-60-1540 TP38

Ford F31 F350 4X4, 2009

3/36K

Venco

Warn

Tommy

N/A

NR

\$38,181.00

(\$2,500.00)

\$35,681.00

Manuals - \$400.00

\$40,772.42

(\$1,500.00)

\$39,272.42

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064
Vehicles
Opened: 01/28/09
Opened by: mv

ITEM 18---AIRPORT

1 Each - 5500 GVW 2WD Pickup Truck
Make/Model/Year
Warranty
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Chevy Colorado CS15653, 2009
3/36K, 5/100K powertrain
18 MPG

\$17,599.82

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0225

(\$500.00)

Net Total

\$17,099.82

ITEM 19

1 Each - 9900 GVW Pickup Truck with Dump Box
Make/Model/year
Warranty
Dump Box Make/Model
Hoist Make/Model
Lift Gate Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Chevy Silverado 3500HD, 2009
3/36K, 5/100K powertrain

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unti #0357

Net Total

\$36,912.94

\$42,960.94

\$0.00

\$36,912.94/

\$42,960.94

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 18---AIRPORT

1 Each - 5500 GVV 2WD Pickup Truck

Make/Model/Year

Warranty

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0225

Net Total

NO BID

Ford Ranger, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain
16 MPG

\$17,476.00

(\$400.00)

\$17,076.00

ITEM 19

1 Each - 9900 GVV Pickup Truck with Dump Box

Make/Model/year

Warranty

Dump Box Make/Model

Hoist Make/Model

Lift Gate Make/Model

Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0357

Net Total

NO BID

Ford F350, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K
Pickup Box
Venco VF6F-ED
Tommy Gate G2-60-1540-TP38
N/A

N/A

N/A

\$39,617.00

(\$3,200.00)

\$36,417.00

44

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064

Vehicles

Opened: 01/28/09

Opened by: mv

ITEM 20--WRA

1 Each - 19,500 GVW 4x4 Crew Cab Work Truck
w/Service Crane and Air Compressor
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year
Warranty
Crane Body Make/Model
Service Crane Make/Model
Air Compressor Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Ford F550 Crew Cab, 2009
3/36K
Knapheide 6108DL-385
Venturo HT30KX-P
Vmac VR70

E-85 Powered, City MGP Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0488

Net Total

N/A

\$102,088.00
(\$1,500.00)

\$100,588.00

NR

\$107,263.00
(\$1,000.00)

\$106,263.00

ITEM 21

1 Each - 19,500 GVW 4WD Crew Cab Work Truck
w/Crane and Snowplow
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year
Warranty
Service Body Make/Model
Crane Make/Model
Snowplow Make/Model
Air Compressor Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Ford F550 Crew Cab, 2009
3/36K
Knapheide 7108D54RJ
Venturo ET12KX
Western 1UTMVP95
Vmac VR70

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0454

Net Total

N/A

\$84,025.00
(\$1,500.00)

\$82,525.00

NR

\$86,109.74
(\$1,000.00)

\$85,109.74

**NO RESPONSE FROM: Bob Brown GMC;
Deery Brothers Chevrolet; Holmes Chevrolet;
McKenna Motors; Ramsey Auto; Shottenkirk
Chevrolet; Toyota of Des Moines; Ft. Dodge
Ford**

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064
Vehicles
Opened: 01/28/09
Opened by: mv

ITEM 20--WRA

1 Each - 19,500 GVW 4x4 Crew Cab Work Truck
w/Service Crane and Air Compressor
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year
Warranty
Crane Body Make/Model
Service Crane Make/Model
Air Compressor Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

Dodge Ram 5500, 2009
3/36K Bumper-Bumper, 5/100K Motor
Knapeide 6108DL-38J
Venturo HT30KX-P
Vmac VR70

NO BID

NO BID

E-85 Powered, City MGP Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0488

Net Total

\$97,851.00
(\$1,000.00)
\$96,851.00

NR

ITEM 21

1 Each - 19,500 GVW 4WD Crew Cab Work Truck
w/Crane and Snowplow
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year
Warranty
Service Body Make/Model
Crane Make/Model
Snowplow Make/Model
Air Compressor Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

Dodge Ram 5500, 2009
3/36K Bumper-Bumper, 5/100K Motor
Knapeide 7108D54RJ
Venturo ET12KX
Western IUTMVPP99 V-Plow
Vmac VR70

NO BID

NO BID

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0454

Net Total

\$80,614.00
(\$1,000.00)
\$79,614.00

NR

**NO RESPONSE FROM: Bob Brown GMC;
Deery Brothers Chevrolet; Holmes Chevrolet;
McKenna Motors; Ramsey Auto; Shott Kirk
Chevrolet; Toyota of Des Moines; Ft. Dodge
Ford**

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE -
PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V09-064
Vehicles
Opened: 01/28/09
Opened by: mv

ITEM 20--WRA

1 Each - 19,500 GVW 4x4 Crew Cab Work Truck
w/Service Crane and Air Compressor
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year
Warranty
Crane Body Make/Model
Service Crane Make/Model
Air Compressor Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Ford F550, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain, 5/100K Diesel
Knapheide 61082L-38J
Venturo HT30KX-P
VMAC VR70
N/A

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

N/A

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

N/A

\$99,073.00
(\$4,400.00)

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0488

Net Total

\$94,673.00

ITEM 21

1 Each - 19,500 GVW 4WD Crew Cab Work Truck
w/Crane and Snowplow
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year
Warranty
Service Body Make/Model
Crane Make/Model
Snowplow Make/Model
Air Compressor Make/Model
Gasoline Powered, City MPG Rating:

NO BID

Ford F550, 2009
3/36K, 5/60K Powertrain, 5/100K Diesel
Knapheide 7108D54RJ
Venturo ET12KX
Western IUTMVP95
VMAC VR70
N/A

E-85 Powered, City MPG Rating:

N/A

Diesel Powered, City MPG Rating:

N/A

\$81,701.00
(\$3,600.00)

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #0454

Net Total

\$78,101.00

**NO RESPONSE FROM: Bob Brown GMC;
Deery Brothers Chevrolet; Holmes Chevrolet;
McKenna Motors; Ramsey Auto; Shottenkirk
Chevrolet; Toyota of Des Moines; Ft. Dodge
Ford**