

★ **Roll Call Number**

Agenda Item Number
39D

Date February 26, 2007

WHEREAS, the Equipment Maintenance center requested the Purchasing Division to solicit bids for purchase of various replacement vehicles for use by the Public Works and Park & Recreation Departments; and

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V07-059 to twelve (12) potential bidders with four (4) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEMS 1, 3, 5 and 6 was received from Bob Brown Chevrolet, 4224 Merle Hay Road, Des Moines, IA 50310, at a total cost of \$147,633.93; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM 6 were received from Charles Gabus Ford, 4545 Merle Hay Road, Des Moines, IA 50310, at a total cost of \$26,147.91; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM 2 was received from Ed Stivers Ford, 1450 E. Hwy 6, Waukee, IA 50263, at a total cost of \$64,385.00; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fleet Maintenance Manager recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the aforementioned low dollar compliant bidders for various replacement vehicles at a total cost of \$238,166.84.

(Council Communication No. 07-043)

Moved by _____ to adopt

Approved as to form:

Ann DiDonato
Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				
MOTION CARRIED			APPROVED	

CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

Mayor

City Clerk

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

398

Vehicles		Fleet Maintenance		Bid No. V07-959	
Date Opened:	01/03/07	Opened by:	mv	Req. #	
Bidder	Karl Chevrolet	Charles Gabus Ford	Bob Brown Chevrolet	Ed Silvers Ford, Inc.	NO RESPONSE:
Address	1101 SE Oralabor Rd.	4545 Merie Hay Road	4224 Merie Hay Rd.	1450 E. Hwy. 6	Crescent Chev.
City	Arkeny, IA. 50021	Des Moines, IA. 50310	Des Moines, IA. 50310	Waukee, IA. 50263	Dewey Ford
Terms	Net	Destination	Net	Net	Deery Chev.
FOB:	30 - 90 days				Stew Hansen
Delivery:					Quality Ford
					Haines GMC
					McKenna Truck
					Bob Brown GMC
ITEM 1					
3 Each - 9200 GVW Regular Cab 4X4 Pickup	\$36,114.00	\$108,342.00	\$28,097.17	\$64,291.51	\$29,152.00
Make/Model/Year	\$31,322.00	\$93,966.00	Chevrolet CK20903, 2007	Ford F250, 2008	\$87,354.00/Western
Warranty	Silverado, 2007/Silverado, 2007 Classic	Western IUTMVP85	3 yrs/36,000 & 5 yrs/100,000	3 yrs/36,000	
Snow Plow Make/Model			Western IUTMVP85	Western IUTMVP85/Boss Power V	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0204			(\$2,500.00)	NO BID	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0369			(\$1,500.00)	NO BID	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0388			(\$2,500.00)	NO BID	
NET TOTAL ITEM 1			\$81,145.09	\$75,191.51	
ITEM 2					
5 Each - 5000 GVW Compact Extended Cab Pickup Truck	\$15,176.00	\$75,880.00	\$14,908.68	\$74,543.40	\$12,877.00
Make/Model/Year	Chevrolet 2007 Colorado	Chevrolet SC, 2007	Chevrolet CS15653, 2007	Ford Ranger, 2007	Ford Ranger, 2007
Warranty			3 yrs/36,000 & 5 yrs/100,000	3 yrs/36,000	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0086			(\$2,300.00)	NO BID	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0211			(\$1,700.00)	NO BID	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0215			(\$1,000.00)	NO BID	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0433			(\$1,200.00)	NO BID	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0409			(\$2,000.00)	NO BID	
NET TOTAL ITEM 2			\$75,880.00	\$64,385.00	
ITEM 3					
1 Each - 5000 GVW Compact Ext. Cab 4X4 Pickup Truck			\$13,417.15	\$74,543.40	\$16,297.00
Make/Model/Year	Chevrolet Colorado, 2007	Ford Ranger 4X4 Super Cab, 2007	Chevrolet CT15653, 2007	Ford Ranger, 2007	Ford Ranger, 2007
Warranty			3 yrs/36,000 & 5 yrs/100,000	3 yrs/36,000	
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0059			(\$4,500.00)	NO BID	
NET TOTAL ITEM 3			\$18,183.00	\$13,391.88	
ITEM 4					
1 Each - 11,000 GVW Extended Cab & Chassis			NO BID		\$26,309.00
Make/Model/Year	Chevrolet Silverado Classic, 2007	Ford F350 SC 4X2, 2008		Ford F350, 2008	Ford F350, 2008
Warranty				3 yrs/36,000	3 yrs/36,000
NET TOTAL ITEM 4					
ITEM 5					
1 Each - 9200 GVW Regular Cab 4X4 Truck w/Serv Body					\$32,433.00-Omaha
Make/Model/Year					\$31,317.00-Knapheide
Warranty					
Service Body Make/Model					
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0240					
NET TOTAL ITEM 5					
ITEM 6					
1 Each - 9900 GVW Pickup Truck with Dump Body					\$35,690.00
Make/Model/Year	Chevrolet Silverado	Ford F350, 2007	Chevrolet CK20903, 2007	Ford F350, 2008	Ford F350, 2008
Warranty			3 yrs/36,000 & 5 yrs/100,000	3 yrs/36,000	3 yrs/36,000
Dump Box Make/Model			Venco VP6 F-ED	Ford box	Ford box
Hoist Make/Model			Tommy Gate G2-60-1540-TP38	Venco VP6F-ED	Venco VP6F-ED
Lift Gate Make/Model			M6000	Warm M6000	Warm M6000
Winch Make/Model				NO BID	NO BID
Less Trade Allowance for Unit #0306					
NET TOTAL ITEM 6					