

Date March 23, 2009

WHEREAS, the Fire Department requested the Finance Department Procurement Division to solicit bids for various fire fighting supplies; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V09-080 to twelve (12) potential bidders with six (6) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids were received from the various vendors as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from FIR040700/Operations; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fire Department recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the low dollar compliant bids for various fire fighting supplies as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form at a total cost of \$42,375.64.

Moved by \_\_\_\_\_ to adopt

*n* Approved as to form:

*Ann DiDonato*  
Ann DiDonato  
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLISSIS				
TOTAL				
MOTION CARRIED			APPROVED	
_____ Mayor				

**CERTIFICATE**

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

\_\_\_\_\_ City Clerk

290

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Fire Fighting Supplies	Fire Department	Bid No. V09-80						
Opened: 03/03/09	Opened by: mv	Req. # -						
Bidder Address City Terms FOB: Delivery:	Clarey's Safety 623 Gordon Ave. Norwalk, IA 50211	Murphy's Fire & Rescue 900 S. 66th Terr. Kansas City, KS 66111 Net 30 Approx. 30 days						
Ed M. Feld Equipment Co., Inc. 113 N. Griffith Rd. Carroll, IA 51401 Net 30 Destination 30 - 45 days	Sandry Fire Supply LLC 618 6th Street DeWitt, IA 52742 Net 30 Des Moines 30 days							
40 Each - Sections of 1 3/4" Angus Red Chief Fire Hose	\$220.50	\$8,820.00	\$164.00	\$6,560.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$465.00	\$11,160.00
20 Each - Sections of 2 1/2" Angus Red Chief Fire Hose	\$295.00	\$5,900.00	\$231.00	\$4,620.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$660.00	\$7,920.00
20 Each - Sections of 5" Angus Hi-Vol Yellow Fire Hose	\$755.00	\$15,100.00	\$585.00	\$11,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 Each - Oxygen Cylinders	No Bid		\$62.70	\$1,504.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Make/Model			Luxfer D Size Cylinder					
24 Each - Foam Eductors	\$451.95	\$10,846.80	\$415.80	\$9,979.20	\$415.00	\$9,960.00	\$465.00	\$11,160.00
12 Each - Fire Fighting Nozzles	\$550.00	\$6,600.00	\$541.15	\$6,493.80	\$585.00	\$7,020.00	\$660.00	\$7,920.00
24 Each - Tri Locks for use with 2 1/2" NST Couplings	\$43.00	\$1,032.00	\$35.95	\$862.80	\$67.20	\$1,612.80	No Bid	No Bid
Make/Model	Red Head		South Park QL-48z25c					
12 Each - Tri Locks for use with 1 1/2" NST Couplings	\$43.00	\$516.00	\$35.80	\$429.60	\$63.60	\$763.20	No Bid	No Bid
Make/Model	Red Head		South Park QL-48z15c					
4 Each - 10 foot Attic Ladders	\$175.00	\$700.00	\$185.90	\$743.60	\$194.00	\$776.00	No Bid	No Bid
2 Each - 24 foot Extension Ladders	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	\$577.50	\$1,155.00	\$525.00	\$1,050.00	No Bid	No Bid
2 Each - 35 foot Extension Ladders	\$875.00	\$1,750.00	\$935.00	\$1,870.00	\$860.00	\$1,720.00	No Bid	No Bid
8 Each - Flashlights	\$110.00	\$880.00	\$98.15	\$785.20	\$98.00	\$784.00	No Bid	No Bid

<p>Bidder Address City Terms FOB: Delivery:</p>	<p>MES 1751 Business Park Drive Fremont, NE 68025  Destination 45 days</p>	<p>Danko Emergency Equipment PO Box 218 Snyder, NE 68664 Net 30 Des Moines 30 days</p>	<p>"NO BID" FROM: Chemguard  NO RESPONSE FROM:  Fire Guard First Due Emergency Supply Hagemeyer Government Sales W.S. Darley &amp; Company Whelen Engineering</p>
40 Each - Sections of 1 3/4" Angus Red Chief Fire Hose	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20 Each - Sections of 2 1/2" Angus Red Chief Fire Hose	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20 Each - Sections of 5" Angus Hi-Vol Yellow Fire Hose	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 Each - Oxygen Cylinders	\$59.00	\$1,416.00	No Bid
Make/Model	Cramer/Decker K870MDT		
24 Each - Foam Eductors	\$398.00	\$9,552.00	\$387.20
12 Each - Fire Fighting Nozzles	\$338.00	\$4,056.00	\$523.30
24 Each - Tri Locks for use with 2 1/2" NST Couplings	\$28.00	\$672.00	\$68.84
Make/Model	South Park QL48z15c		Akron 373-2.5
12 Each - Tri Locks for use with 1 1/2" NST Couplings	\$28.00	\$336.00	\$66.84
Make/Model	South Park QL48z25c		Akron 373-1.5
4 Each - 10 foot Attic Ladders	\$176.25	\$705.00	\$153.22
2 Each - 24 foot Extension Ladders	\$524.50	\$1,049.00	\$445.70
2 Each - 35 foot Extension Ladders	\$877.50	\$1,755.00	\$737.80
8 Each - Flashlights	\$95.25	\$762.00	\$92.87
			\$802.08
			\$612.88
			\$891.40
			\$1,475.60
			\$742.96