

Date April 9, 2007

WHEREAS, the Traffic & Transportation Division of the Engineering Department requested the Purchasing Division to solicit bids for various traffic signal equipment for use by the Signal Shop; and

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V07-098 to eight (8) potential bidders with four (4) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for items 1 and 4 on the attached bid tabulation form was received from Traffic Control Corporation, PO Box 1051, Ankeny, IA 50021, at a total cost of \$14,259.92; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for items 2 and 3 on the attached bid tabulation form was received from Leotek Electronics, 1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA 95050, at a total cost of \$9287.20; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for item 5 on the attached bid tabulation form was received from Brown Traffic Products, 736 Federal Street, Suite 2312, Davenport, IA 52803, at a total cost of \$42,470.00; and


WHEREAS, funding is available from ENG990000/TFC095; Capital Projects/LED Bulb Change Out; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Traffic & Transportation Division recommend approval of the aforementioned low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the low dollar compliant bids as submitted by the aforementioned proposers, at a total cost of \$66,017.12.

Moved by _____ to adopt

Approved as to form:


Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				
MOTION CARRIED			APPROVED	
_____ Mayor				

CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

_____ City Clerk

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Traffic Signal Equipment		T & T Department	Bid No. V07-098
Date Opened: 03/26/07	Opened by: mv	Req. # 13919	
Bidder Address City Terms FOB: Delivery:	Leotek Electronics USA Corp. 1330 Memorex Drive Santa Clara, CA 95050 Net 30 Destination 30 - 45 days	Brown Traffic Products, Inc. 736 Federal Street - Suite 2312 Davenport, IA 52803 Net 30 - 45 days	Mid American Signal, Inc. 2429 S. Mill St. Kansas City, KS 66103 Net Destination 45 - 60 days
24 Each - 12" Green Left Arrow LED Module	\$48.15 \$1,155.60	\$53.15 \$1,275.60	\$58.00 \$1,392.00
Make/Model	Leotek TSL-12GA-MF-A1	Dialight 430-2374-001	Duralight-JXJ-300V1GA
24 Each - 12" Red Left Arrow LED Module	\$35.30 \$847.20	\$38.60 \$926.40	\$38.00 \$912.00
Make/Model	Leotek TSL-12RA-MF-A1	Dialight 430-1314-001	Duralight-JXJ-300VIRA
200 Each - 12" Red LED Module (For Programmed Head)	\$42.20 \$8,440.00	\$47.00 \$9,400.00	No Bid
Make/Model	Leotek T05R-A-6100	Dialight P463R33003	No Bid
200 Each - 12" Green LED Module (For Programmed Head)	\$78.70 \$15,740.00	\$78.15 \$15,630.00	\$65.98 \$13,196.00
Make/Model	Leotek T05G-A-CA01	Dialight P463G33003	Gelcore DR3-RCFB-01A
200 Each - 16" Pedestrian Signal Head with Clamshell Mounting and LED Filled Hand/Man Module	No Bid	\$212.35 \$42,470.00	\$239.00 \$47,800.00
Make/Model	No Bid	Dialight 430-6473-001 McCain M32258	McCain PSXX3D-P Duralight JXM-400VAIL
GRAND TOTAL		\$69,702.00	\$74,401.84

NO BID FROM:
 General Traffic Controls
 NO RESPONSE FROM
 Traffic Parts, Inc.
 Traffic & Transportation Products
 TraStar