

★ **Roll Call Number**

Agenda Item Number

30A

Date May 8, 2006

WHEREAS, the Fire Department requested the Purchasing Division to solicit bids for various fire fighting supplies; and

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V06-100 to fifteen (15) potential bidders with eight (8) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids were received from the various vendors as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from FIR040700/Operations; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fire Department recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the low dollar compliant bids for various fire fighting supplies as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form at a total cost of \$177,829.96.

Moved by \_\_\_\_\_ to adopt

Approved as to form:

Ann DiDonato  
Ann DiDonato  
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
KIERNAN				
HENSLEY				
MAHAFFEY				
BROOKS				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				

MOTION CARRIED

APPROVED

\_\_\_\_\_  
Mayor

**CERTIFICATE**

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

\_\_\_\_\_  
City Clerk

30A

Bidder	Fire Fighting Supplies	Fire Department	Bid No. V06-100	Req. # -
Address	Fireguard, Inc.	Ed M. Feld Equipment Co., Inc.	Municipal Emergency Services	Sandry Fire Supply, LLC
City	4404 S. 76 Circle	113 N. Griffith Rd.	1751 North County Rd. Avenue	618 6th St.
Terms	Omaha, NE 68127	Carroll, IA 51401	Fremont, NE 68025	DeWitt, IA 62742
FOB:	Net	Net		Net
Delivery:	60 - 150 days		30 - 60 days	30 days
5 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	\$4,020.88 \$20,104.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,929.00 \$19,645.00
Make/Model	MSA1CMD12J03B14CCO			MSA KCM012TOB14CCO
Warranty	Mask-Lifetime, 5 years			Lifetime
15 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	\$4,020.88 \$80,313.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,929.00 \$58,935.00
Make/Model	MSA/CMD12J03D24CCO			MSA KCM012J0D24CCO
Warranty	Mask-Lifetime, 5 years			Lifetime
46 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus Tanks-MSA	\$877.29 \$40,355.34	No Bid	No Bid	\$675.00 \$31,050.00
Make/Model	MSA/807570			#807570
Warranty				Pro-rated Lifetime
60 EA-MSA Heads Up Display	\$136.99 \$8,219.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$138.05 \$8,283.00
Make/Model	MSA/10061542			MSA 10061542
Warranty	1 year			2 years
40 EA-MSA Clear Command System Kit	\$265.30 \$10,612.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$260.95 \$10,438.00
Make/Model	MSA/10024074			#10024074
Warranty	1 year			2 years
20 EA-MSA Clear Command System Module	\$174.46 \$3,489.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$171.60 \$3,432.00
Make/Model	MSA/1002305L			#10023056
Warranty	1 year			2 years
12 EA-Pass Device-MSA ICM TX With Heat Heat Sensor	\$1,029.33 \$12,351.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$499.00 \$5,988.00
Make/Model	MSA/10067167			MSA 100676167
Warranty	2 years			2 years
60 EA-1 3/4" Hose-Angus Red Chief in 50' lengths	No Bid	\$137.95 \$11,036.00	No Bid	No Bid
Make/Model		Angus Red Chief		
Warranty		Mfg.		
20 EA-2 1/2" Hose-Angus Red Chief hose in 50' lengths	No Bid	\$192.95 \$3,859.00	No Bid	No Bid
Make/Model		Angus Red Chief		
Warranty		Mfg.		
18 EA-Forcible Entry Tool-Ziamatic SQB30C	\$235.62 \$4,241.16	\$230.95 \$4,157.00	\$234.86 \$4,227.48	No Bid
Make/Model	Zico/SQB30C	Ziamatic SQB30C	Ziamatic SQB30-C	
Warranty	90 days	Mfg.	Mfg.	
6 EA-Hose Adaptor-Double Make 2 1/2" by 2 1/2" NST	\$35.00 \$210.00	\$32.95 \$197.70	\$28.76 \$172.56	No Bid
Make/Model	Elkhart/M-327	Red Head BR362525	Red Head Brass	
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	
6 EA-2 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles - Elkhart	\$640.50 \$3,843.00	\$571.95 \$3,431.70	\$577.16 \$3,462.96	\$601.85 \$3,611.10
Make/Model	Elkhart/4000-24 + 0B-275-GA	Elkhart 4000-24 + DB2756A	Elkhart 4000-24	4000-24 w/DB275GA
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	5 years
4 EA-High Rise Nozzles - Elkhart	\$539.48 \$2,157.92	\$535.95 \$2,143.80	\$446.00 \$1,784.00	\$507.05 \$2,028.20
Make/Model	Elkhart/4000 14+B-275GAT	Elkhart 4000-14 + B-275-GAT	Elkhart 4000-14 (150/75)	4000-14 w/B-275-GAT
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	5 years
2 EA-1 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles - Elkhart	\$496.85 \$973.30	\$449.95 \$899.90	\$409.30 \$818.60	\$426.90 \$853.80
Make/Model	Elkhart/4000-17	Elkhart 4000-17	Elkhart 4000-17 150/50	4000-17
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	5 years
2 EA-Nozzle Stream Straighteners - Elkhart	\$65.45 \$130.90	\$64.95 \$129.90	\$55.50 \$111.00	\$62.50 \$125.00
Make/Model	Elkhart 281-A	Elkhart 281-A	Elkhart 281-A	281-A
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	5 years
4 EA-Monitor Stacked Straight Tips - Elkhart	\$343.20 \$1,372.80	\$336.95 \$1,347.80	\$288.85 \$1,155.40	\$301.30 \$1,205.20
Make/Model	Elkhart/ST-194	Elkhart ST-194	Elkhart ST-194	ST-194
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	5 years
6 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA6 200 Watt	\$363.00 \$2,178.00	\$518.95 \$3,113.70	\$374.00 \$2,244.00	No Bid
Make/Model	Whelen/295HFSA6	Whelen 295HFSA6	Whelen 295HFSA6	
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	
1 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFS2 100/200 Watt	\$350.46	\$372.95	\$357.75	No Bid
Make/Model	Whelen/295HFS2	Whelen 295HFS2	Whelen 295 HFS2	
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	
1 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFSA7 Dual 200 Watt	\$498.96	\$530.95	\$509.50	No Bid
Make/Model	Whelen/295HFSA7	Whelen 295HFSA7	Whelen 295HFSA7	
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	
24 EA-Siren Driver - Whelen SD 210RX 100 Watt Flat	\$122.30 \$2,935.20	\$127.95 \$3,070.80	\$123.00 \$2,952.00	No Bid
Make/Model	Whelen/SD 210 RX	Whelen SD210RX	Whelen SD2104K	
Warranty	12 months/250 hours	Mfg.	Mfg.	
48 EA-Spanner Wrenches - Elk-O-Lite/Akrolite	\$21.00 \$1,008.00	\$16.50 \$792.00	\$14.70 \$705.60	\$15.50 \$744.00
Make/Model	Elk-O-Lite/F464A	Elkhart T-464	Elkhart T-464	T-464
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	5 years
12 EA-Sledge Hammers	\$45.00 \$540.00	\$29.95 \$359.40	\$31.25 \$375.00	No Bid
Make/Model	Akron/FSA-10	Nupla 25810	Council PR1000FG	
Warranty	90 days	Mfg.	Mfg.	
6 EA-Hand Held Spot Light	\$90.34 \$542.04	No Bid	\$17.81 \$106.86	No Bid
Make/Model	Collins Dynamic Pulsor		Koehler NG-112	
Warranty	2 years excluding bulbs		Mfg.	
12 EA-Tri Locks	\$48.50 \$582.00	\$29.95 \$359.40	\$28.00 \$312.00	No Bid
Make/Model	Elkhart/653	South Park QL048225	South park QL48225C	
Warranty	5 years	Mfg.	Mfg.	
4 EA-Positive Pressure Gas Fan-Tempest BD-21-H6.5	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,800.00 \$7,200.00	\$1,839.00 \$7,356.00
Make/Model			Tempest 700-021	BD-21-H-6.5
Warranty			Mfg.	

30

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION  
PAGE 2 OF 2

	Fire Fighting Supplies	Fire Department	Bid No. V06-100		
	Date Opened: 02/08/05	Opened by: mv	Req. # -		
Bidder	Heiman Fire	W.S.Darley & Co.	Whelen Engineering Co., Inc.	Murphy's Fire & Rescue	
Address	248 Highway 60 Blvd.	2000 Anson Drive	Rte 145 Winthrop Rd.	900 S. 66th Terrace	
City	Ashton, IA 51232	Melrose Park, IL 60160	Chester, CT 06412	Kansas City, KS 66111	
Terms	Net	Net	Net 30		
FOB:					
Delivery:		30 days	30 days	45 days	
5 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model					
Warranty					
5 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus-MSA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model					
Warranty					
30 EA-Self Contained Breathing Apparatus Tanks-MSA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model					
Warranty					
60 EA-MSA Heads Up Display	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model					
Warranty					
40 EA-MSA Clear Command System Kit	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model					
Warranty					
20 EA-MSA Clear Command System Module	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model					
Warranty					
12 EA-Pass Device-MSA ICM TX With Heat Heat Sensor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model					
Warranty					
80 EA-1 3/4" Hose-Angus Red Chief in 50' lengths	No Bid	\$134.00 \$10,720.00	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model		Angus Red Chief			
Warranty		2 years			
20 EA-2 1/2" Hose-Angus Red Chief hose in 50' lengths	No Bid	\$184.00 \$3,680.00	No Bid	No Bid	
Make/Model		Angus Red Chief			
Warranty		2 years			
18 EA-Forcible Entry Tool-Ziamatic SQB30C	\$224.00 \$4,032.00	\$253.00 \$4,554.00	No Bid	\$257.40 \$4,633.20	
Make/Model	Per Spec	Ziamatic SQB30C		Ziamatic SQB30C	
Warranty	Factory	90 days		1 year	
6 EA-Hose Adaptor-Double Make 2 1/2" by 2 1/2" NST	\$24.00 \$144.00	\$48.00 \$288.00	No Bid	\$24.21 \$145.26	
Make/Model	Mfg.	Darley B24301		Akron 336	
Warranty		1 year		5 years	
6 EA-2 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles - Elkhart	\$599.00 \$3,594.00	\$661.00 \$3,966.00	No Bid	\$696.00 \$4,176.00	
Make/Model	DB-275-GA + 4000-24	Elkhart 4000-24TBD275GA		4000-24 Chief Tip	
Warranty	Elkharts	5 years		5 years	
4 EA-High Rise Nozzles - Elkhart	\$669.00 \$2,676.00	\$558.00 \$2,232.00	No Bid	\$553.92 \$2,215.68	
Make/Model	Per Spec	Elkhart 4000-14 & B275-GA7		4000-14 Chief w/B375-GAT	
Warranty	Elkharts	5 years		5 years	
2 EA-1 1/2" Fire Fighting Nozzles - Elkhart	\$416.00 \$832.00	\$469.00 \$938.00	No Bid	\$466.37 \$932.74	
Make/Model	Per Spec	Elkhart RD 4000-17		400D-17	
Warranty		5 years		5 years	
2 EA-Nozzle Stream Straighteners - Elkhart	\$119.00 \$238.00	\$69.00 \$138.00	No Bid	\$62.71 \$125.42	
Make/Model	Per Spec	Elkhart 281-A		281-A	
Warranty		5 years		5 years	
4 EA-Monitor Stacked Straight Tips - Elkhart	\$289.00 \$1,156.00	\$331.00 \$1,324.00	No Bid	\$329.13 \$1,316.52	
Make/Model	Per spec	Elkhart ST-194		St-194	
Warranty		5 years			
6 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFS A6 200 Watt	\$429.00 \$2,574.00	\$418.00 \$2,496.00	\$343.20 \$2,059.20	\$394.68 \$2,368.08	
Make/Model	Whelen	Whelen 295HFS A6	Whelen 295HFS A6	Whelen 295HFS A6	
Warranty	Per Spec	5 years	5 years	5 years	
1 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFS2 100/200 Watt	\$409.00	\$398.00	\$328.20	\$377.43	
Make/Model	Whelen	Whelen 295HFS2	Whelen 295HFS2	ST-194	
Warranty	Per spec	5 years	5 years	5 years	
1 EA-Siren - Whelen 295HFS A7 Dual 200 Watt	\$579.00	\$567.00	\$467.40	\$537.51	
Make/Model	Whelen	Whelen 295HFS A7	Whelen 295HFS A7	St-194	
Warranty	Per Spec	5 years	5 years	5 years	
24 EA-Siren Driver - Whelen SD 210RX 100 Watt Flat	\$139.00 \$3,336.00	\$137.00 \$3,288.00	\$112.80 \$2,707.20	\$119.79 \$2,874.96	
Make/Model	Whelen	Whelen SD210RX	Whelen 50210RX	ST-194	
Warranty	Per Spec	5 years	1 year	5 years	
48 EA-Spanner Wrenches - Elk-O-Lite/Akrolite	\$14.99 \$719.52	\$16.50 \$792.00	No Bid	\$16.14 \$774.72	
Make/Model	Elkhart T-464	Akron #10		T-464	
Warranty		5 years		5 years	
12 EA-Sledge Hammers	\$39.00 \$468.00	\$39.00 \$468.00	No Bid	\$34.66 \$415.92	
Make/Model	Nupla 36" 10#	Firehooks Unlimited SHF-10		Cummins	
Warranty	Factory	5 years		1 year	
6 EA-Hand Held Spot Light	\$44.00 \$264.00	\$25.00 \$150.00	No Bid	\$20.00 \$120.00	
Make/Model	Koehler XL-1000C	Darley AF232		Vector VEC 134	
Warranty	Factory	1 year		1 year	
12 EA-Tri Locks	\$26.90 \$332.80	\$31.00 \$372.00	No Bid	\$48.43 \$581.25	
Make/Model	South Park	Darley Trilock G321		653 Elk	
Warranty	Factory	1 year		5 years	
4 EA-Positive Pressure Gas Fan-Tempest BD-21-H6.5	No Bid	\$2,257.00 \$9,028.00	No Bid	\$2,268.75 \$9,075.00	
Make/Model		Tempest BD-21-H6.5		BD-21-H6-5	
Warranty				5 years from shipping/2 years on engine	

"NO BIDS" FROM:

Ray O'Herron Co.  
Helget Safety Supply

NO RESPONSE FROM:

Clarey's Safety EQ.  
Western Safety  
Quad City Safety  
MYA Safety  
EDM EQ.