

★ **Roll Call Number**

Agenda Item Number

46C

Date August 20, 2007

WHEREAS, the Public Works Department requested the Procurement Division to solicit bids for catch basin and manhole castings for use by the Sewer Division; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V08-009 to thirteen (13) potential bidders with five (5) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM's 1, 2 and 3 was received from American Highway Products, 11723 Strasburg Bolivar Rd. NW, Bolivar, IL 44612, at a total cost of \$28,150.00; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM's 4, 5, 6 and 7 was received from Neenah Foundry Company, 2121 Brooks Avenue, Neenah, WI 54957-0729, at a total cost of \$47,250.00; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from PWK071001; Sewer Maintenance Clearing; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Public Works Department recommend approval of the low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the low dollar compliant bids for catch basin and manhole castings as submitted by the aforementioned bidders at a total cost of \$75,400.00.

Moved by _____ to adopt

Approved as to form:

Ann DiDonato
Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				

MOTION CARRIED

APPROVED

Mayor

CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

City Clerk

460

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Bidder		Foundry Castings	Public Works Department	Bid No. V08-009
Address		Date Opened: 07/31/07	Opened by: mv	Req. # -14886, 14891
City		Neenah Foundry Co.	East Jordan Iron Works, Inc.	Utility Equipment Company
Terms		PO Box 729	310 Garnet Dr.	5615 NE 22nd Street
FOB:		Neenah, WI 54957	New Lenox, IL 60451	Des Moines, IA 50313
Delivery:		Net	Net	Net
		Destination	Des Moines	30 days
		30 days	30 days	
Catch Basin and Manhole Risers				
ITEM 1	1---150 Each - Catch Basin Risers	No Bid	\$145.00	\$21,750.00
Make/Model				\$115.00
ITEM 2	2---200 Each - Manhole Risers, 24" Diameter Lid, 1.5" Thick	No Bid	EJW D51773552015	East Jordan/Andrews Metals D51773552015
Make/Model			\$110.00	\$17,600.00
ITEM 3	3---50 Each - Manhole Riser, 26" Diameter Lid, 1.5" Thick	No Bid	EJW M1240015204A	East Jordan/Andrews Metals M1240015204A
Make/Model			\$115.00	\$4,675.00
Standard Type C, Coal Hole Lids				
ITEM 4	4---50 Each - Neenah Equivalent #R-5145 - Solid Lid	\$85.00	No Bid	\$89.10
Make/Model		Neenah R-614S		Neenah R-614S
ITEM 5	5---50 Each - Neenah Equivalent #R-6020 - Solid Lid	\$80.00	No Bid	\$83.60
Make/Model		Neenah R-6020		Neenah R-6020
Standard Intake Castings				
ITEM 6	6---100 Each - Type "R"	\$260.00	\$400.00	\$271.70
Make/Model		Neenah R-3067-V or Neenah R-3067-VB	EJW 7030Z W/Vaned & T1	Neenah R-3067-V
ITEM 7	7---50 Each - Type "Q"	\$260.00	\$400.00	\$271.70
Make/Model		Neenah R-3290-A	EJW 7034 W/Grate	Neenah R-3290-A

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Foundry Castings Public Works Department Bid No. V08-009

Date Opened: 07/31/07 Opened by: mv Req. # -14886, 14891

Bidder American Highway Products "NO BID" FROM:
 Address 11723 Strasburg Bolivar Rd. NW Manhole Systems, Inc.
 City Bolivar, OH 44612 PO Box 278
 Terms Net Richmond, OH 43944
 FOB: Ess Brothers and Sons
 Delivery: 21 days 30 days

Catch Basin and Manhole Risers
ITEM 1---150 Each - Catch Basin Risers \$71.00 \$10,650.00 \$71.00 \$10,650.00
 Make/Model AHP Type I MS-SQ TB
ITEM 2---200 Each - Manhole Risers, 24" Diameter Lid, 1.5" Thick \$70.00 \$14,000.00 \$73.00 \$14,600.00
 Make/Model Pivoted Turnbuckle MS-101 TB

ITEM 3---50 Each - Manhole Riser, 26" Diameter Lid, 1.5" Thick \$70.00 \$3,500.00 \$73.00 \$3,650.00
 Make/Model Pivoted Turnbuckle MS-101 TB

Standard Type C, Coal Hole Lids

ITEM 4---50 Each - Neenah Equivalent #R-5145 - Solid Lid No Bid
 Make/Model
ITEM 5---50 Each - Neenah Equivalent #R-6020 - Solid Lid No Bid
 Make/Model

Standard Intake Castings

ITEM 6---100 Each - Type "R" No Bid
 Make/Model
ITEM 7---50 Each - Type "Q" No Bid
 Make/Model