

★ **Roll Call Number**

Agenda Item Number
39 A

Date November 19, 2007

WHEREAS, the Police Department along with the Polk County Sheriff's Office wished to solicit joint bids for ammunition; and

WHEREAS, the City of Des Moines Finance Department Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V08-022 to nine (9) potential bidders with four (4) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids were received from (1) Gil Hebard Guns, 125 Public Square, Knoxville, IL 61448, (2) UltraMax, 2112 Elk Vale Road, Rapid City, SD 57701, and (3) Ray O'Herron Company, 3549 N. Vermilion Street, Danville, IL 61832, as designated in bold on the attached bid tabulation form; and


WHEREAS, funding is available from POL041000/Personal & Training (\$70,330.71) and POL101300/Tactical (\$64,401.20); and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Police Department recommend approval of the low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED; that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the above referenced low dollar compliant bids for ammunition as submitted by UltraMax Ammunition, Gil Hebard Guns, and Ray O'Herron Company at a total cost of \$134,731.91.

Moved by _____ to adopt

Approved as to form:


 Ann DiDonato
 Assistant City Attorney

(Council Communication No. 07-678)

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				
MOTION CARRIED			APPROVED	
_____ Mayor				

CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

_____ City Clerk

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Ammunition	Police Department/Polk County	Bid No. V08-022	Req. # -
Date Opened: 09/26/07	Opened by: mv		
Bidder Address City Terms FOB: Delivery:	Ultramax Ammunition 2112 Eik Vale Road Rapid City, SD 57701 Net 30 Destination	Streicher's, Inc. 10911 West Hwy. 55 Plymouth, MN 55441 Net 30 Destination	Ray O'Herron Co., Inc. 3549 N. Vermillion St., PO Box 1070 Danville, IL 61832-1070 Net 30
Duty Ammunition-Speer Gold DOT Hollow Point Duty 1,200 Rounds - .38 Special +P, 135 Grain 11,000 Rounds - 9mm, 147 Grain 24,000 Rounds - .40 Caliber, 180 Grain 19,500 Rounds - .45 Caliber, 230 Grain 7,250 Rounds - .45 Caliber GAP, 200 Grain	\$306.00/M \$299.00/M \$322.00/M \$353.00/M \$353.00/M	\$447.74 \$4,104.32 \$9,638.88 \$8,578.64 \$3,189.49	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shot Gun Ammunition - CCI Blazer Clean-Fire 3,000 Rounds - .000 Buckshot 12,250 Rounds - .00 Buckshot, 8 Pellet 8700 Rounds - Slug, 2 3/4" 1 ounce, Hydra Shok HP 1,000 Rounds - Birdshot, 7 1/2 or 8 Shot 2,000 Rounds - .00 Buckshot Ballistic Clean	\$418.80/M \$336.00/M \$394.80/M \$168.80/M \$840.00/M	\$1,272.00 \$4,214.00 \$3,445.20 \$184.00 \$828.00/M	\$513.80/M \$413.30/M \$484.28/M \$290.40/M \$1030.48/M
Practice Ammunition - CCI Blazer Clean-Fire 7,800 Rounds - .38 Speical, 158 Grain 111,000 Rounds - 9mm, 147 Grain 92,500 Rounds - .40 Caliber, 180 Grain 136,500 Rounds - .45 Caliber, 230 Grain	\$160.00/M \$150.00/M \$176.00/M \$190.00/M	\$1,530.75 \$20,507.25 \$20,207.55 \$32,332.76	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rifle Ammunition 40,000 Rounds - .223 Caliber 66 Grain Practice Federal AE223 40,000 Rounds - .223 Caliber 69 Grain BTHP Winchester	\$330.00/M \$633.00/M*	\$13,200.00 \$25,320.00	No Bid \$749.00/M

*Bidding Federal Brand

NO RESPONSE FROM:

- Matre Arms & Ammunition
- OMB Express Police Supply
- The Hunting Shack
- TJ Conevera's
- Precision Ammunition

\$29,960.00