



Roll Call Number

Agenda Item Number

280

Date March 12, 2012

WHEREAS, the Public Works Department requested the Finance Department Procurement Division to solicit bids for an annual contract with two (2) additional one year renewal options to furnish hot mix asphalt materials; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V12-054 to two (2) potential bidders with two (2) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar primary and secondary bids were determined on an item-by-item basis, at the prices shown on the attached bid tabulation form from the following companies:

Des Moines Asphalt & Paving Co.
2401 SE Tones Drive
Ankeny, IA 50021
Craig Lamberty/President

Grimes Asphalt & Paving Corp.
PO Box 3374
Grimes, IA 50111
Kurt Rasmussen/President

WHEREAS, funding is available from Public Works Divisions Operating and CIP Budgets, for an annual estimated cost of \$1,000,000; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Public Works Department recommends approval of the attached low dollar primary and secondary bids for hot mix asphalt materials.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the awards to Des Moines Asphalt & Paving Co. and Grimes Asphalt & Paving Corp., and further authorizes the Procurement Administrator to enter into annual agreements renewable for two (2) additional twelve (12) month periods, with price increases complying with the agreement terms.

Moved by _____ to adopt

Approved as to form:

Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
GRIESS				
HENSLEY				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
MOORE				
TOTAL				

MOTION CARRIED

APPROVED

Mayor

CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

City Clerk

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid No. V12-054

Annual Agreement for
Hot Mix/Warm Mix Asphalt Mixtures

Public Works

Req. # -

Opened by: mv

Opened: 02/22/12

Des Moines Asphalt & Paving
2401 SE Tones Drive, Suite 13
Ankeny, IA 50021
Net 30

Grimes Asphalt & Paving Corp.
5550 NE 22nd Street
Des Moines, IA 50313
Net 30

Bidder
Address
City
Terms
FOB:
Delivery:

HOT MIX ASPHALT MIXTURES

- HMA (100K ESAL) SURF, 3/8"
- HMA (300K ESAL) SURF, 1/2"
- HMA (1M ESAL) SURF, 1/2", FRIC L-4
- HMA (1m ESAL) SURF, 1/2" FRIC L-4, 15% RAP
- HMA (3M ESAL) SURF, 1/2", FRIC L-4
- HMA (100K ESAL) BASE, 1/2"
- HMA CURB MIX, 3/8"
- CRUSHED HMA, 3/4' MINUS

- \$80.35/ton
- \$65.00/ton
- \$65.00/ton
- \$64.50/ton
- \$68.00/ton
- \$64.00/ton
- \$85.00/ton
- \$12.00/ton
- \$95.00/ton
- \$67.00/ton
- \$72.00/ton
- \$72.00/ton
- \$79.50/ton
- \$67.00/ton
- \$127.00/ton
- \$28.00/ton

WARM MIX ASPHALT MIXTURES

- WMA (100K ESAL) SURF, 3/8"
- WMA (300K ESAL) SURF, 1/2"
- WMA (1M ESAL) SURF, 1/2" FRIC L-4
- WMA (1M ESAL) SURF, 1/2" FRIC L-4, 15% RAP
- WMA (3M ESAL) SURF, 1/2", FRIC L-4
- WMA (100K ESAL) BASE, 1/2"
- WMA CURB MIX, 3/8"

- \$80.35/ton
- \$65.00/ton
- \$65.00/ton
- \$64.50/ton
- \$68.00/ton
- \$64.00/ton
- No Bid
- No Bid
- No Bid
- \$66.00/ton
- \$70.50/ton
- \$70.50/ton
- \$78.25/ton
- \$61.00/ton
- No Bid

28C