X Roll Call Number Agenda Item Number

______________________________________________________ 3eA

An Ordinance entitled, "AN ORDINANCE to amend the Municipal Code of the City of Des
Moines, Iowa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5, 2000, as
heretofore amended, by amending Sections 46-1, 46-3, 46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-63, 46-
64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281, 46-316 and 46-318, and adding and enacting new Sections 46-
74 and 46-75, and by repealing Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-72, 46-246 and 46-249,
relating to adoption of the international fire code and amendments and additions thereto",

which was considered and voted upon under Roll Call No. 13- [110 of July 15, 2013;
again presented.

Moved by that this ordinance be
considered and given second vote for passage.

(Second of three required readings)

COUNCIL ACTION | YEAS | NAYS | PASS | ABSENT CERTIFICATE
COWNIE
COLEMAN I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby
GRIESS certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,
HENSLEY among other proceedings the above was adopted.
MAHAFFEY
MEYER IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
MOORE above written.
TOTAL
MOTION CARRIED APPROVED
Mayor City Clerk




X Roll Call Number Agenda Item Number

................ [B-LI40....... R
Date ____July 15,2013 36 A

An Ordinance entitled, "AN ORDINANCE to amend the Municipal Code of the City of Des
Moines, Iowa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5, 2000, as
heretofore amended, by amending Sections 46-1, 46-3, 46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-63, 46-
64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281, 46-316 and 46-318, and adding and enacting new Sections 46-
74 and 46-75, and by repealing Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-72, 46-246 and 46-249,
relating to adoption of the international fire code and amendments and additions thereto",

presented. (Couacil Communication No. / 3.3 7g )

Moved by
considered and given first vote for passage.

that this ordinance be

FORM APPROVED:
(First of three required readings)
/%Jérlenna K. Frﬁ
Assistant City Attorney
COUNCILACTION | YEAS | NAYS | PASS | ABSENT CERTIFICATE
COWNIE e
COLEMAN v I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby
GRIESS % certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,
HENSLEY v among other proceedings the above was adopted.
MAHAFFEY v
MEYER v IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
MOORE [ above written.
TOTAL ~1
MOTION CARRIED ] APPROVED
14 'S
/3 Do o
] ’
Mayor CLasrne \__ City Clerk




Date: \ July 15,2013
Council Agenda Item No. 55A
. . Roll CallNo. [ /3 j’/@ B
Communlcathn Communication No. 13,378
Office of the City Manager Submitted by: John F. TeKippe,
Fire Chief ]

AGENDA HEADING:

Amending Chapter 46 of the Municipal Code relating to adoption of the International Fire Code and

amendments and additions thereto.

SYNOPSIS:

Recommend approval of this Ordinance which amends Sections 46-1, 46-3, 46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-

63, 46-64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281, 46-316, and 46-318, and enacts new Sections 46-74 and 46-75, all of

Chapter 46, Fire Protection and Prevention of the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines.
Approval of this Ordinance also deletes Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-72, 46-246, and 46-249. The
change to Section 46-61 is to replace the 2009 edition of the International Fire Code by adopting the
more recent 2012 edition of the International Fire Code. The other changes to Chapter 46 are intended

to reflect changes between the 2009 edition and the 2012 edition

of the International Fire Code, and to

provide the Fire Department with supplemental options for enforcement of the Fire Prevention Code.

FISCAL IMPACT: NONE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

The Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines adopts and incorporates the International Fire Code as

published by the International Code Council, which is historically updated ev

ery three (3) years. The

International Fire Code “is a model code that regulates minimum fire safety requirements for new and
existing buildings, facilities, storage, and processes” and is historically updated every three (3) years to
incorporate technological advances and best practices in fire protection, prevention, and inspection. In
conjunction with the adoption of the 20i2 edition of the International Fire Code, the amendments,
additions, and deletions to the Municipal Code of Des Moines must also be updated by ordinance to
correlate with the new edition. The proposed ordinance also adds new requirements regarding

securing of fire-damaged buildings following fire events.

The proposed revisions to Chapter 46 include, but are not limited to, the following:

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-1. Permits Required.

The proposed revisions to Section 46-1 reflect the renumbering of chapters and sections of the 2012
edition of the International Fire Code, and incorporate new permitting requirements found in said

edition. ‘

Des Moines Municipal Code Sections 46-3, 46-3.07, and 46-64. Violations; notice of violation —

administrative penalties — corrective action order; appeals.



Council Communication No. 13-378
Page 2 of 5

The proposed revisions add the option for the Fire Department to pursue nuisance or other legal
remedies for violations of Chapter 46, in addition to misdemeanor and municipal infraction charges.

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-61. Adoption of International Fire Code.

The proposed ordinance replaces the outdated 2009 edition of the International Fire Code with the
2012 edition of the International Fire Code.

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-62. Deletions.

The following sections of the 2012 Edition of the International Fire Code are deleted and replaced
elsewhere in the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines or were not recommended for adoption by
the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals:

Section 113 —fees

Section 307 - open burning, recreational fires, and portable outdoor fireplaces
Section 510.3 — permit required for emergency responder radio coverage
Section 2006.5.4 — aircraft fueling vehicles — transfer personnel

Section 3104.15.5 and 3104.15.6 — cooking tents and outdoor cooking
Appendix A — Board of Appeals

While the aforementioned list is not all inclusive, it highlights some of the International Fire Code
requirements that have been deleted.

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-63. Amendments and additions.

Open Flames in Residential Occupancies. Section 308.1.4 is deleted and replaced with Section 46-66
and 46-67. Section 46-66 limits the use of charcoal burners and other ash/ember producing cooking
devices to one (1) and two (2) family dwellings and Section 46-67 allows the use of LPG (liquid
propane gas) fueled cooking devices in multi-family dwellings with certain restrictions and safeguards.

Securing Fire Damaged Premises within 48 hours — Section 46-74. Section 46-74 establishes that the
new requirement that within 48 hours of a fire event, and upon determination of the fire department
official that the fire-damaged structure in an unsecured condition may constitute a hazard and
emergency nuisance condition, a fire damaged structure must be secured by the property owner. If the
property owners fails'to secure the fire-damaged property (or have the fire-damaged property secured
at the owner’s expense including by homeowner’s insurance coverage), the Fire Chief or designee may
cause the fire-damagéd structure to be secured and assess the costs against the property in the same
manner as a property tax, pursuant to the procedures set forth in article VI, chapter 42 of the City
Code. Rather than creating a new preferred vendor contract process for securing fire-damaged
structures, the Fire Department will utilize the Building Department’s contracted preferred vendor for
commercial structures and the preferred vendor on contract with the Neighborhood Inspection Division
will be used for residential structures.

Fire Escape Examination for Structural Integrity — incorporated by adoption of 2012 edition of
International Fire Code (Section 46-61). Section 1104.16.5 of the 2012 International Fire Code
requires fire escape stairs and balconies to be examined for structural adequacy and safety by a
registered design professional or others acceptable to the fire code official every five (5) years, or as
required by the fire code official. The reason for this change is that building fire escapes are a means
of egress component in many existing multiple-story buildings. The evaluation of fire escapes is



Council Communication No. 13-378
Page 3 of 5

necessary to confirm that this exterior stair egress component satisfies a minimum design load, is
properly maintained, and is available for service in the event of an emergency.

Appendices B, C, and D. Appendix B — Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings, Appendix C - Fire
Hydrant Locations and Distribution, and Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Road Requirements
establish minimum fire protection features that previously were referenced during project review by
the Fire Department. The Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals recommends formally adopting
these appendices since they are currently being required and enforced during project reviews.

Emergency Responder Radio Coverage — Section 46-73(b). Sections 510.1 and 1103.2 of the 2012
edition of the International Fire Code require that emergency responders must be capable of effectively
communicating in new and existing buildings when using emergency portable radios. The
communication challenges experienced during the September 11th World Trade Center tragedy
prompted this fire code change. In situations where the design or construction features of the buildings
do not allow for effective radio transmission/reception, the owner of the building is required to install
bi-directional amplifiers or other upgrades to achieve compliance. The Des Moines Fire Department
has been conducting field radio tests and preliminary results suggest that fewer than 50 buildings will
be impacted. There are financial implications for those buildings that fail the field radio test and
require further testing and system upgrades. Pursuant to the proposed revisions to add Section 46-
73(b), once notified, building owners will have three (3) years (with a possible two (2) year extension)
to comply with the Emergency Responder Radio Coverage requirement.

Carbon Monoxide Alarms in Institutional and Residential Buildings incorporated by adoption of 2012
edition of International Fire Code (Section 46-61). Sections 908.7 and 1103.9 of the 2012
International Fire Code address carbon monoxide issues and require carbon monoxide alarms to be
installed in new and existing institutional and residential occupancies. This requirement will require
enforcement coordination between the Fire Department, Building Department and Neighborhood
Inspection Division, but the benefit of detecting deadly carbon monoxide gas is indisputable. The
financial impact to property owners is minimal.

PREVIOUS COUNCIL ACTION(S):
Date: December 20, 2010

Roll Call Number: 10-2100

Action: Amending Chapter 26 of the Municipal Code to adopt the 2009 editions of the International
Building Code; International Residential Code; International Existing Building Code; International
Mechanical Code; International Fuel Gas Code; International Energy Conservation Code and Uniform
Plumbing Code — as amended by changing Section 26-328 and 26-329 to address concerns raised by
local homebuilders. (Council Communication No. 10-764) Moved by Hensley that this ordinance do
now pass, #14.981. Motion Carried 7-0.

Date: December 6, 2010

Roll Call Number: 10-2014 and 10-2015

Action: Amending Chapter 26 of the Municipal Code to adopt the 2009 editions of the International
Building Code; International Residential Code; International Existing Building Code; International



Council Communication No. 13-378
Page 4 of 5

Mechanical Code; International Fuel Gas Code; International Energy Conservation Code and Uniform
Plumbing Code — as amended by changing Section 26- 328 and 26-329 to address concerns raised by
local homebuilders. Moved by Hensley that this ordinance be considered and given second vote for
passage. Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

(A) Amendment to the Schedule of Fees. (Council Communication No. 10-71 [5) Moved by
Hensley to adopt. Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

Date: November 22,2010

Roll Call Number: 10-1959, 10-1960 and 10-1961

Action: On Amendment of Chapter 26 of the Municipal Code to adopt the 2009 editions of the
International Building Code; International Residential Code; International Existing Building Code;
International Mechanical Code; International Fuel Gas Code; International Energy Conservation Code
and the Uniform Plumbing Code. (Council Communication No. 10-704) Moved by Hensley to adopt.
Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

(A) First consideration of ordinance above. Moved by Hensley that this ordinance be
considered and given first vote for passage on all sections, excluding Sections 26- 328 and 26-
399 of the International Residential Code; refer those sections to the City Manager for review
and recommendation regarding how suburbs are handling sprinklers. Motion Carried 6-1.
Nays: Moore.

(B) First consideration of ordinance on amendment of Chapter 46 of the Municipal Code
regarding adoption of the International Fire Code and amendments and additions. (Council
Communication No. 10-689) Moved by Hensley that this ordinance be considered and given
first vote for passage. Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

Date: July 23,2007

Roll Call Number: 07-1431 and 07-1432

Action: Amending Chapter 46 of the Municipal Code regarding the following:

(A) Fire Protection and Prevention Code. Moved by Coleman that this ordinance be considered

and given first vote for passage. Motion Carried 7-0.

(B) Adoption of the International Fire Code and amendments and additions to International Fire
Code. (Council Communication No. 07-424) Moved by Cole that this ordinance be considered
and given first vote for passage. Motion Carried 7-0.

BOARD/COMMISSION ACTION(S):
Board: Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals
Date: May 9, 2013

Resolution Number: N/A




Council Communication No. 13-378
Page Sof 5

Action: Motion to recommend Council adopt the 2012 editions of the Uniform Plumbing Code,
International Mechanical Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Residential Code,
International Building Code, International Existing Building Code, and the International Fire Code
with amendments as proposed by the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals. Motion carried 9-1
(Martie Mendenhall opposed).

ANTICIPATED ACTIONS AND FUTURE COMMITMENTS: NONE

For more information on this and other agenda items, please call the City Clerk’s Office at 515-283-4209 or visit the
Clerk’s Office on the first floor of City Hall, 400 Robert D. Ray Drive. Council agendas are available to the public at the
City Clerk’s Office on Thursday afternoon preceding Monday’s Council meeting. Citizens can also request to receive
meeting notices and agendas by email by calling the Clerk’s Office or sending their request via email to
cityclerk@dmgov.org.



/3110
po?

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE to amend the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines,
Towa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 3,
2000, as heretofore amended, by amending Sections 46-1, 46-3,
46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-63, 46-64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281,
46-316 and 46-318, and adding and enacting new Sections 46-74
and 46-75, and by repealing Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-
72, 46-246 and 46-249, relating to adoption of the
international fire code and amendments and additions thereto.

Be It Ordained by the City Council of the City of Des Mbines, Iowa:

Section 1. That the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines,
Towa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5, 2000,
as heretofore amended, is hereby amended by amending Sections 46-1,
46-3, 46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-63, 46-64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281,
46-316 and 46-318, and adding and enacting new Sections 46-74 and
46-75, and by repealing Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-72, 46-246
and 46-249, relating to adoption of the international fire code and
amendments and additions thereto, as follows:

ARTICLE I. IN GENERAL

Sec. 46-1. Permits required.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person to use a building or
premises or engage in any activities for which a permit is
required by this chapter without first having obtained such
permit. Permits are required from the fire prevention bureau
for the uses listed in subsections (b) through (h) of this
section.

(b) Permits shall be required for each of the following
installations, and the fee for each such installation shall be
the amount established in the schedule of fees adopted by the
city council by resolution:

(1) Compressed and liquefied petroleum gas system (see
section 46-278 of this chapter).



(2)

Flammable or combustible liquid tanks (see section
105.7.8 of the fire code—46-246ocfthis—chapter).

Yearly operational permits shall be required for each of the

following facilities

or uses, and the fee for each such

installation or use shall be the amount established in the
schedule of fees adopted by the city council by resolution:

(1)

Aviation Facility. To use a Group H or Group S for
aircraft servicing or repair and aircraft fuel-servicing
vehicles (see chapter 331-20 of the fire code).
Acetylene generator. To operate an acetylene generator
having a carbide capacity of five pounds or greater (see
section 46-121 of this chapter).

Calcium carbide. To store or keep calcium carbide in

excess of 100 pounds (see section 46-121 of this chapter)

Cellulose nitrate film. To store, handle, or use nitrate

film in quantities in excess of five reels or 25 pounds

in weight (see section 306 of the fire code)

Cellulose nitrate (pyroxylin).

a. To store or handle more than 25 pounds of cellulose
nitrate plastic (see section 306 of the fire code).

b. To manufacture or assemble pyroxylin articles or
parts of (see chapter 42—-65 of the fire code).

Combustible fiber. To store or handle combustible fibers

in quantities in excess of 100 cubic feet (see chapter 28

52 of the fire code).

Compressed gases. To store, handle or use at normal

temperatures and pressures in excess of quantities

indicated:

a. Flammable gases in excess of 27668-200 cubic feet
(see chapter 3558 of the fire code).

b. Nonflammable-—Inert and simple asphyxiant gases in
excess of 6,000 cubic feet (see chapter 36—53 of
the fire code).

C. Oxidizing gases in excess of 34686504
(see chapter 46—63 of the fire code).

d. Corrosive or toxic +n of 1,000—cubit
gases in any amount (see chapter 27-50 of the
code) .

e. Highly toxic, radioactive or reactive (unstable) #n

500 feetmaterials in any amount
(see chapter 37—60 and 4366 of the fire code).

Reserved.

feet

oSS FaYal ol ot o frot
A= S = c—CTT

fire

aco ot
o

aseooc P o e
cr2rotToT A== 2 e oy v

("rxfr\rvgr\c

o
q
[t
{

e
dft
}._l
[OR
o]

g
b T

p

P O

)
b

0o
D
th

MRt}
H-

l..l

43

]

0}

¢ ¢

q
()]

¢
i
¢ b
0

H-
oo
H

D
D
3
i

(P v IRl 1)
b
I N
b
D

ORIV B

h O
th T @
;

EU
i
]

)

D
n

D

In 4
o @

b
b

(O]
D
o

[ NORILY
P
(

I

q4f h dF %t i
o

O 4 q
IV O
[(]

»)

o)
D
P

q

¢

¢ @
D
o]



£ 200-—gatleons—

o S+ LAl e Y LR R K el o S Ptk 2k ol Y
oo T = LR g e

(9) Dry cleaning plants. To engage in the business of dry
cleaning, as prescribed by class or type of system (see
chapter 3221 of the fire code).

(10) Dust-producing operations. To operate a grain elevator;
flour, starch or feed mill; or plant pulverizing
aluminum, coal, cococa, magnesium, spices, sugar or other
material producing dusts as defined in chapter 13-22 of
the fire code. -

(11) Activities or uses involving explosives or blasting
agents. (see chapter 33-56 of the fire code):

a. Keep, store or sell explosives.
b. Transport explosives.
C. Blasting using explosives.

(12) Activities or uses involving explosives, small arms
ammunition, small arms primers, smokeless propellants,
black rifle powder (see chapter 33-56 of the fire code):
a. Small arms ammunition, to store or sell.

b. Small arms primers and smokeless propellants, to
store or sell.
cC. Black rifle powder, to store or sell.
(13) Inspection, maintenance and certification of fire
appliances.
(14) Operation for conducting a fireworks display (see section
46-214 of this chapter).
(15) Conducting a flammable finish operation by painting,
spraying, dipping or storing flammable products for these
operations (see chapter 1524 of the fire code).
(16) Flammable or combustible liquids_(see section 105.6.16 of
fire code).
=i For —sterage— handling—or—use—of flommable —or
cembustible liguids— by -class—{see section—-46-24§
of this-chapteri-

b Retail-dealers—in—flammable orcombustible liguids
tsee—subsection46~246{2) of this chapteri—

e Manufaecturing —using—flommable —eor —combustible
HHguids—

(17) Fruit ripening. To ripen fruit by the process described
in chapter 36-25 cof the fire code using ethylene gas.

(18) Garages. To use any structure as a place of business for
repairing motor vehicles (see chapter 22-23 of the fire
code) .

(19) Hegardeus—chemicals— Te—store—or—handliethe following
hazardous—echemicals—in excess—of guantities indicated
+fsee——chapter 27 of the fire-—codel—-

S oxr ives—in—excess—of 110 —gatlens—er 31000




100 et Ao

ovonoo ~f
S

Ll

-

anlada

=4

D) amm a1 o
Traitthtao e
U~ Yy
TGty

f A A= A= =
Eae |

\vs
TITICH

4

=TT 2T ToT

oy ey = g

LIk aY
TTIT

=g

Nneot o~ dna
A==~

I

cnlida
= g = = gen g

ey

13 ~ntida

bl at ¥ 2 ]
O

Yoot g vy

oanlids

[

or wuater

ot alnl ~

Oz A1 73 e

pm mpe . v gy

T Wt =3

LT3 o ey v > 0 W e

L=

TV O

=

A T e A N ]

AF BN pre~aam e [ £ 2y o1l An e

IT 11 e e e

o

THho =

ST 7 T v o g

ESEEESS e o

(e

ray

[ S g

oxr
A =

ol 1A
[ A g agm ap W yweg

roaaet 3 sy
oottt IvVEe

+

ot ol A ot

IO T T

o
T

2

LR e e

E A= ar e =T iy

Al aoo

naraswidac

Pt ol e i 2 e )

1

ol Ao e
Qg ey

limuids

o
L ge

1
=

Pe Y o ey (o= o e e

e

Tinde /B

T

=

T

EoESAS R =Sy
ITT7T
=

a1l A

£ ENAN 3~

A AT~

T
= It

o

THho e

[ S s caS A SAa= e SAERS L= ===
aheoma ~~ 1 o

25

v

=

T
Ri:zl ke
T ATY

ot v aa AF

for

£ haoayrydaiao
A =

el el ot o Wi Y

[=aa e

oo g T o

e g g oy

P o gy oy o gr e o v g e o i i g 3 g Wy - gt ey

TG
choamd ~o 7 o

arabhan b q A

ol ¥ FalaValla)

mn

3

n +h4a

S

l1iotand

+he

T

Faa—

[ —— g

TTTdmT [ & > p oy oy e

TIT

[~ =g =gy op ey = y

o Tt

Af JliotnAd weaavma 4

ATATA NI YN P ot

T7 T OT

of 1
o

R3]l
AV o=~

Tt
Rl le

o

[0 Meis Sy G N
micrcol ]l ana~iro

=

| SAEaA=A = =

of mevre

A==

fok et ok Wa at

T

ot oar e

p=

O P g g e = payy

[ e o 3

Py o= ey

TTTOoOTT g TT7

o}

o g

To store or handle

the following hazardous chemicals in excess of the

guantities indicated

code

h ol W ik e i aln B 0. Was 4

=

Aaf haoayAdaiia matnd 2] o

Fhaorn +i1n ~T acoao

L™ 3> 1 38 o g S e e my o g gy |

T

permit-—Hazardous chemicals.

2

=

pr oy o

WY

It

(see Chapter 50 of the fire

Combustible liguids - see 105.6.16

Corrosive liguids - 55 gallons

Corrosive solids - 1000 pounds

Flammable ligquids - see 105.6.16

Flammable solids - 100 pounds

Highly toxic liguids and solids - any amounts

Toxic liguids - 10 gallons

Toxic solids

100 pounds

Organic Peroxides

Liguids - Class I and II - any amount

guids - Class III - 1 gallon

i
Liguids - Class IV - 2 gallons

L

Liguids - Class V - no permit required

Class I and II — any amount

Solids

Solids — Class III - 10 pounds
Solids - Class IV - 20 pounds

Sclids - Class V - no permit required

Oxidizing materials

Oxidizing gases - any amount

Oxidizing liguids class 4 - any amount

Oxidizing liguids class 3 - 1 gallon

Oxidizing liguids class 2 — 10 gallons

Oxidizing liguids class 1 — 55 gallons

Oxidizing solids class 4 — any amount




Oxidizing solids class 3 — 10 pounds

Oxidizing solids class 2 — 100 pounds

Oxidizing solids class 1 — 500 pounds

Unstable (reactive) materials
TLiguids class 3 & 4 - any amount
Liguids class 2 — 5 gallons
Liguids class 1- 10 gallons
Solids class 3 & 4 — any amount
Solids class 2 — 50 pounds
Solids class 1 — 100 pounds

Water reactive materials
Liquids class 3 -~ any amount
Liguids class 2 - 5 gallons
Liguids class 1 - 55 gallons
Solids class 3 - any amount
Solids class 2 - 50 pounds

Solids class 1 — 500 pounds

Liquefied petroleum gas. To operate or maintain an LP gas
system or store LP gas (see section 46-278 of this
chapter).

Lumberyards. To store lumber in excess of 100,000 board
feet (see chapter }9£§:of’the fire code).

Magnesium. To melt, cast, heat treat or grind more than
ten pounds of magnesium per working day (see chapter 36
59 of the fire code).

Mall, covered. To use a covered mall in the following
manner: placing or constructing temporary kiosks, display
booths, concession equipment or the like in the mall; to
use the mall as a place of assembly; to use open-flame or
flame-producing devices; to display any liquid or gas
fueled powered equipment; to use liquefied natural gas or
compressed flammable gas 30 days only.

Organic coatings. To manufacture more than one gallon of
organic coatings in a working day (see chapter 29 of the
fire code).

Ovens, industrial baking or drying. To operate an
industrial baking or drying oven regulated by this
chapter (see chapter 23—30 of the fire code) .

Padmt amA ~11 To ot nr oFr kahHTA ﬂ31n+ |
aTrre—ait= Tt o— St OFC—0OT——T1iatt P O =7

v h o~
E= T

I
T
[

h s

D i
o

excess—ef2 é
»—Reserved.

Refrigerant equipment. To operate a refrigeration unit or
system having a refrigerant circuit containing more than
220 pounds (100 kg) of group Al or 30 pounds (14 kg) of

any other group refrigerant.

n+hnv aimilay £ armrmaly
T == P

lon
=

TT

leaon comtieon A DA oaf 4
= =4 o O

o
P o g e R e



(d)

(28) Tents. To erect or maintain a tent or air-supported
structure (see chapter 24-31 of the fire code and article
X of this chapterx).

(29) Tire rebuilding. To operate a tire rebuilding or tire
recapping plant (see chapter 25-34 of the fire code).

(30) High piled combustible storage. To use a building or a
portion thereof as a high piled storage area in excess of
500 sqguare feet, including storage of combustible
materials on pallets, in racks or on shelves where the
top of the storage is greater than 12 feet in height, and
also including certain commodities, such as rubber tires,
Group A plastics, flammable liquids, idle pallets and
similar commodities where the top of the storage is
greater than 6 feet in height (see sections 105.6.22 and
202 of the fire code).

A permit shall be required for construction, installation or

modification of the following types of fire protection systems

and equipment, and the fee for issuance of such permit shall

be the amount established in the schedule of fees adopted by

the city council by resolution:+

(1) Automatic fire-extinguishing systems.

(2) Cempressed—gases—Reserved.

(3) Fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment.
(4) Fire pumps and related equipment.

(5) Elammable andcombustible liguids—Reserved.

(6) Spraying—ordipping—Reserved.

A permit shall be required for removal of an underground
storage tank which contains or has contained any substance for
which a permit is required under this section_ (see section
105.7.8(3) of the fire code), and the fee for such permit
shall be the amount established in the schedule of fees
adopted by the city council by resolution.

Exemption for certain classes of applicants. Persons
performing work or operations for the federal government or
the state may obtain permits for such work or operations
without paying the permit fees described in this section.

A permit shall be required for open fires or open burns
pursuant to section 46-61. Outdoor fireplaces or grills
burning untreated wood or charcoal used solely for the non-
commercial preparation of food shall not be regquired to obtain
a permit,

The permit fees reguired by this section shall be doubled
whenever a permit is not obtained prior to conducting the
activities described in this section. No additional permits
shall be issued to any person who owes the city the double fee
established in this subsection.




Sec. 46-3. Violations.

(a) Any person who fails to perform an act required by the
provisions of this chapter, or who commits an act prohibited
by the provisions of this chapter, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor punishable by fine or imprisonment as provided by
section 1-15, or shall be guilty of a municipal infraction
punishable by a civil penalty as provided by section 1-15.

(b) The fire department may also proceed under public nuisance
provisions set forth in this code, and/or pursue any other
remedy available at law, to address any failure to perform an
act required by the provisions of this chapter or any action
prohibited by the provisions of this chapter.

Sec. 46-3.07. Notice of wviolation--administrative penalties--
corrective action order.

(a) The fire department is authorized to issue a notice of
violation imposing administrative penalties upon any person
who fails to perform an act required by chapter 46 of this
code or who commits an act prohibited by said chapter.

(b) Such notice shall include a statement of the administrative
penalties imposed. Such notice may include a corrective
action order requiring compliance with the violated code
section within thirty (30) days.

(c) The administrative penalty for such violations shall be as
provided in the schedule of administrative penalties adopted
by the city council by resolution.

(d) Notice of violation, with the applicable penalty for such
violation noted thereon, shall be issued to and served upon
the violator. Service of the notice upon the violator may be
by regular mail or by delivery in person.

(e) Penalties assessed pursuant to notice of violation shall be
paid by the violator in full as directed in the notice within
thirty (30) days of its 1issuance. Corrective action as
required pursuant to notice of violation shall be completed by
the violator as directed in the notice within thirty (30) days
of its issuance.

(f) The administrative penalties set out in the schedule of
administrative penalties shall be charged in lieu of the fines
and penalties provided for in section 46-3 and 46-3.05, unless
the violator refuses to correct the violation and pay the
scheduled administrative penalty, or the fire chief or the
chief’s authorized representative determines that immediate
enforcement action by misdemeanor or municipal infraction
prosecution pursuant to section 46-3 and 46-3.05, or by public
nuisance procedure or any other remedy available at law, 1is,
in view of the particular circumstances of the case, necessary
to achieve compliance with the requirements of Chapter—46this
chapter. The fire department shall maintain a record of all




/ﬁg@p\
7%

violations, administrative ©penalties charged or other
enforcement actions taken.

ARTICLE III. CODE
Sec. 46-61. Adoption of international fire code.

(a) This chapter shall consist of the International Fire Code,
2009 2012 edition, published by the International Code
Council, Inc., and known commonly and referenced in this
chapter as the “international fire code” and as the “fire
code”, which volume is incorporated in this seetien-chapter by
this reference as fully as though set forth in this chapter in
its entirety, excepting only such portions as are stated to be
deleted therefrom and such additional provisions as are set
forth in this article.

(b) This chapter and all provisions incorporated in this chapter,
by reference or otherwise, shall be known as the fire
prevention code, may be cited as such, and will be referred to
in this chapter as such and as "this code" or as "this
article™ or as "this chapter." Further references made in this
chapter to chapters will be to chapters of the international
fire code. References to section numbers not preceded by "46-"
will be to sections in the international fire code.

Sec. 46-62. Deletions.

The following sections are Thereby deleted from the
international fire code adopted in section 46-61 of this article
and are of no force or effect in this chapter:
(1) Sections 113, 307.1, 307.2, 307.4, 307.4.1, 307.
307.4.3, 510.3,—33106-5-4—2404-315-5—ana—2404
2006.5.4, 3104.15.5 and 3104.15.6.

(2) Appendix A.

(3)

Dy~ T
PPt A

.2,

E_&
A

B

Sec. 46-63. Amendments and additions.

(a) Article I of this chapter and the remaining sections in this
chapter and in division 2 of article III of chapter 38 of the
city code are and represent amendments and additions to the
requirements contained in the international fire code. Where
their requirements conflict with those of the international
fire code, the requirements of sections 38-81 and 38-82 of the
city Code and articles IV through X of this chapter shall
prevail.

(b) The deleted sections and the corresponding amendments and
additions to those sections are as follows:

(1) Section 108 (see section 46-64 of this chapter).



(2) Section 105, except sections 105.1, 105.6.10, 105.6.16,
105.6.22 and 105.7.8 thereof which are not amended or
deleted and remain incorporated in this chapter (see
section 46-1 of this chapter).

(3) Section 2603-23501.2 (see section 46-121 of this

chapter).

(4) Section 3368-25608.2 (see article VII of this chapter).

(5) Section 3403-45701.4 (see section 46-246 of this
chapter).

(6) Sections 270315001.5, 24635003.9.1, 21@%5003 9.1.1,
27015001.6.3, 29615001.6, 2960315001.5.1 and 5001.5.2

(see article IV of this chapter).

(7) Section 3884 6104, except Table 6104.3 which is not
amended or deleted and remains incorporated in this
chapter (see section 46-281 of this chapter).

(8) Section 308.1.4 (see section 46-66 and 46-67 of this

chapter).

Seectieon 50323 {sece—section46-68 of this -chapter—

9
1

(9)
{(104—Section 311, except sections 311.2.1, 311.2.2, 311.2.3,

3i11.5.1, 311.5.2, 311.5.3, 311.5.4, and 311.5.5 thereof which are

not amended or deleted and remain incorporated in this chapter (see

section 46-75 of this chapter) .Secticn 5061 {sece-secetion 46-69 of

(173
7

(123 Sectien-912. 31 {sec sectien 46-72 oi-this chapreri-
(F410) Section 46014 -1101.4 (see section 46-73 of this
chapter).
(F=11) Section 2403-2—-3103.2 (see section 46-318 of this
chapter).
(c) The addition of the following sections/appendices:
(1) Appendixces B, C, D and I.
(2) Section 110.5 (see section 46-74 of this chapter).
(3) Section 311.6 (see secticn 46-75 of this chapter).
Sec. 46-64. Appeals.
(a) ©Other than notices of immediate enforcement action by

misdemeanor or municipal infraction prosecution or other
remedies at law, or public nuisance violations addressed
through procedures set forth elsewhere in this code, Aany
person affected by a decision of the building official or fire
chief or their designee may request and shall be granted a
hearing before the building and fire code board of appeals on
the decision, provided that the person shall file in the
permit and development center a written petition requesting a
hearing and setting forth a brief statement of the grounds
within 15 days after receiving notice of the decision. Upon
receipt of the petition, the permit and development center




shall set a time and place for the hearing and shall give the
petitioner written notice thereof at least three days before
the hearing, unless such notice requirement is waived in
writing by the petitioner. The hearing shall be commenced not
later than thirty days after the day on which the petition was
filed, unless for good cause shown the building official
grants a postponement in writing.

(b) At the hearing the petitioner shall be given an opportunity to
be heard to show why the decision of the building official or
fire chief or designee should be modified or withdrawn. The
building official or fire chief or designee shall have the
opportunity to be heard to show why their decision should be
affirmed.

(c) After the hearing as provided in this section, the building
and fire code board of appeals shall affirm, modify or
withdraw the decision of the building official or fire chief
or designee. The decision of the building and fire code board
of appeals is the final administrative decision.

(d) The proceedings at any hearing before the board, including the
findings and decision of the building official or fire chief
or designee, if applicable, shall be summarized, reduced to
writing, and entered as a matter of public record in the
permit and development center. This record shall include a
copy of every notice or order issued in connection with the
matter.

Sec. 46-68. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,---. Fire-—-apparatus—aceess

Sec. 46-69. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,---.Leek bex-

ez 1read b tha lao otlnac W oy Yory vyt mant ahall b 1meat a1~ A
KeY—a 50 —0y—<tt ST So— =% Depar Tt t—Shcgrrr—Poe 3RSt Ca—0h
211 N conalbriiet A o A LV =k mie Ve S K ol SR Wal ch b P B ol 2 B e PaE ol o TP e § U ol < =
L= e supw uy 1L LAd A0 I S TR S - N we— 1T CTATICR 25 LT L./_‘—-LIB [ W= N U N e w e vy 3 LR G 5 = By Wy E L A iy u\_’ll Lo g
nlan ATl AL WY ooaco oy oo roamidrad Ihiy o Tra _ocandes o ~AfFLFT ~a o
P_Lull = = vV LY bll.\}‘\./\,uu R = AT J_k/\j“_l_d—\lu U-Y wId e A ANl U SR S N Say S S Sy
Rsrcoantioncs 1Y Cretirm R arm el sdarmenmggyrard rameaaaey DD cotiman et ac e DN
£2 P its— ot oup——r S—aira—atS e —gEroup—a—= coapa R TS
o~ 1At 1o sgath A ot ettty D/ Tetrreo o Aasxr amA Wasramey oo osaoo
[= S 9™ S v S Sk Sipy Vg Sy =4 LA = = vy 3 L [ gy v vy ;}\a\z\ll_}.\,] T L AT T uuj AL 11“\'—‘—113 A== ) T
N O | aAraoano £+ Whit1 1 3 mer
L A A L% Qs S ey = e 4 A L= g B AJ\AJ._L\.AJ_J&\jI

Sec. 46-70. Repealed by Ord. No. 15, —--.Limited aceess—gates—and
locks-




:

H=

qr
M

Hh

~
[0)]

1 dasral Ay o 3 o Pt o St 1442 oxr

e \A\JV\/—L\JB&lL Iy ~ TTEAT O =] [F S V- S e we L), 9% ) N S S S ey e
oDroncrt sy o el S = 31 natiiyres +h o+ sy conmtrallad eV alalaola) net vt o
t/.l_vr/\/-l— \41 TS A N & i 0 Sy iy e gyn Sy [ TICE OO S LU g g @ g TICTLV [ 3P G SN W Sug s e L= 3w T b/\./_ﬂ-&l.k—;}
[ TR IR I W leosr losz ~a+rA codad o oAl ov o oqdmt T ar Aewrg ~e o
== \ﬂu.LJ_ J-ll& A ERS I'd 3 j LAy — A A ERY _I r/uu, = [T S 9 % = gy Sy e ey A Voo R
Jamit ~Nr~~emoo ohall axres o leaelr sy o4 4 korc oy coavAa caodeac o
[ Sy wp 3 y g Sl WY p=1 wIaT [0 4 4 @~ g S TICAV =1 —_ N n P A ey LA™ S e a5 ks \-‘ju, ERA3 LA ATy A= A = L8> g
Pt e O BN detrioa + ogoI1n Ao o oxr ah=o117 hosze = loce o s
[T S 1) R i Sy g ATV TN L3 gu_l.ll LS G o vy e == [SJ5 J¥ i) & quw mppm =y LTIV A - A e >~ P2Y Pl \41
ot dvratadd v gy Aoggd ~o N1 1acl Ihesreaa Ay 7o Ineyse oz et rat Al
L Ny W sk + S Sy wy A b/ l&—‘—llg A 9 V L e T i S N N ) Ny WIS L > A P S W e g 4 Z £2 J 7 SN W S < g W oy we e W §
Aotricae ochal1l W Araryalhl o e+ +theo Ayt otamey T A~ hose oz 1A g
VvV I =4 [ G o v, R S > Vb/\./d_uu_l_\./ LA S v LM 9 o ey LXANT L{.—Lll\j e =y £ g J\\/j L ey o Uj
+Fhe Noao  MAdrmaa B e Noarngrtmarn Tz mmynt 4 o Contrallad eVaVolaWalal
TG 1= >4 PO e v g =4 P S e g E=~4 t/u.l_ =IlC ITT T e TTZ5 tJ\..J- T CIT I A X T
nodinta +hat Atz cmritritir rmyooant DA hesivao o Aoyy
b/\./.LLLL/L) LS g S 4 Oy 1AV [ A Sy U7 G S Sy ey t—lJ— =4 3¢ Sp e — & T W TA \Au] .
Sec. 46-72. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,---. Leecking fire department
eeﬂﬁeeﬁeﬁ“e'a?ST

T relbtrme fivea Aormartmant comma~tdon sarme ohal]l e dmat o] leod ~n

g | JXJ.J.J.& [ S gyl gy, S A t./u-]— CIT L3 ~— PP L W v S i ub/k.) [ N 1 W g mpym L [F i G O ey WA wi A ER S N g T3
211 LaWaS R canoat vt 4 A A 'r'\ -1 1 oyt ot ey £9ra dernavrtment
T EXS vy o Tho O AT e 01T TLT1INA ST | S g 4y "4 b_‘_LLg [P S s iy \.A\.;t./u.l_ CITO TN
cornoactEtoarme +hoat+ A Nt Whoasra ~orme 9 T e
LN I G W G S U W W T LT LT g G ey ey AT F 9 W v TITCATV \J.b/u e e 4 b/A.u\/bl
Sec. 46-73. Owner Notification for retroactive provisions.

(a) Upon the issuance of a building permit under chapter 26 of the
City Code and determination by the fire code official that
alterations are needed to the existing building to provide a
minimum degree of fire and life safety to persons occupying
said building, the property owner has three (3) calendar years
from the date of issuance of the building permit to comply
with the requirements of chapter 46—11 of the international
fire code in effect at the time of permit issuance that apply
to the building in gquestion. If, at the end of the initial
three (3) year period, the fire code official determines that
the property owner has made substantial progress in bringing
the property into compliance, the fire code official may grant
a single two (2) year extension to the owner to complete such
work. If, however, the fire code official determines that
substantial progress has not been made by the property owner
by the end of the initial three (3) year period or, when
applicable, the property owner fails to complete the work
during the two (2) year extension period, then the property
will be subject to compliance with the retroactive
requirements of chapter 46—11 in effect at the end of the
initial three (3) year period or, when applicable, the two (2)
year extension period that apply to the building in question.

(b) Upon determination by the fire code official that alterations
are needed to an existing building to provide a minimum degree
of fire and life safety to persons occupying said building
and/or to provide for fire prevention and response within said
building, the fire code official may reguire the property
owner to comply with some or all of the requirements of
chapter 11 of the international fire code in effect at the
time of such determination, and may reguire the property owner




to comply with the specified reguirements within the time

period set forth in written notice given by the fire code

official to the property owner, not to exceed three (3)

calendar vears from the date of said notice.

Sec. 46-74. Securing fire-damaged premises within 48 hours after

fire event.

Section 110 of the international fire code is amended by

adding a new section 110.5 to read as follows:

Section 110.5 Securing fire-damaged premises within 48 hours

after fire event.

(a)

The following definitions apply to this section:

(b)

“Fire event” means a response by the Des Moines Fire
Department to extinguish a fire within a building,
dwelling or other structure that commences with the
dispatching of fire department resources and concludes
with the fire officer in charge terminating the incident.
“Fire-damaged structure” means a building, dwelling or
other structure within the corporate limits of the city
that has been partially burned during a fire event.
“"Nuisance” means inijurious or dangerous to public safety,
and constituting an emergency reguiring immediate
abatement pursuant to article VI, chapter 42 of the city
code and/or other applicable city code section(s).
“Property owner” means the record titleholder(s) and/or
contract purchaser(s) of the real property upon which a
fire-damaged structure is located.

A fire-damaged structure in an unsecured condition may be

(c)

determined by a designated fire department official, in
his or her sole discretion, to constitute a nuisance.
The designated fire department official may but is not

required to give notice to the property owner(s) of such
a determination of nuisance reguiring immediate
abatement, and a hearing regarding the existence of the
nuisance pursuant to section 42-358.02(c) of this code
may be held if practical under the circumstances, but
shall not be required to be held if impractical under the
circumstances, prior to abatement of the nuisance by the
property owner or the city.

A fire-damaged structure determined to constitute a

nuisance shall be secured by the property owner(s), at
the property owner’s sole expense, 1in accordance with
this section and within forty-eight (48) hours of the
fire event, unless additional time is requested by the
property owner (s) and granted in writing by the
designated fire department official, in his or her sole
discretion.




(e) Prior to securing a fire-damaged structure determined to
constitute a nuisance, the property owner(s) shall remove
or cause to be removed all living beings from such
structure.

(f) The property owner(s) shall secure all windows, doors,
and other structural openings of the fire-damaged
structure determined to constitute a nuisance to prevent
access by unauthorized persons.

(g) A fire—-damaged structure determined to constitute a
nuisance which cannot be properly secured from access to
the interior by the use of window locks, door 1locks,
padlocks, or other appropriate locking mechanisms, shall
be secured by the property owner(s) as follows:

(1) Completely enclosing over all structural openings
(windows, doors, roof openings) on the exterior of
such fire-damaged structure with plywood; or

(2) Completely enclosing such fire-damaged structure
with a temporary snow fence of not less than forty-
eight (48”) inches in height; or

(3) By any different and/or additional measures set
forth in any written notice given by the designated
fire department official to the property owner(s).

(h) TIf the property owner(s) fails to secure a fire-damaged

structure determined to constitute a nuisance in
accordance with the reguirements of this section, the
fire chief or his or her designee, which designee may
include the community development department director or
his or her designee, may cause such fire-damaged
structure to be secured and assess the costs thereof
against the real property upon which such fire-damaged
structure is located for collection in the same manner as
a property tax, following hearing in accordance with
article VI, chapter 42 of the city code and/or other
applicable city code sections.

(1) Property owner(s) shall be joint and severally liable for

performing the actions reguired by this section and for
any property assessments arising from failure to perform
such actions.

Section 46-75. Vacant Premises.

(a)

Section 311.1 of the international fire code is amended to

read as follows:

311.1 General. Permanently or temporarily unoccupiled

buildings, structures, premises or portions thereof,
including tenant spaces, shall be safeguarded and maintained
in accordance with Sections 311.1.1 through 311.5.5.




{(b) Section 311.1.1 of the international fire code is amended to
read as follows:
311.1.1 Abandoned premises. Buildings, structures and premises
for which an owner cannot be identified or located by dispatch
of a certificate of mailing to the last known or registered
address, which persistently or repeatedly become unprotected
or unsecured, which have been occupied by unauthorized persons
or for illegal purposes, or which present a danger of
structural collapse or fire spread to adjacent properties may
be considered abandoned, declared unsafe and abated by
demolition or rehabilitation in accordance with chapters 26,
42 and/or 60 of the city code, as applicable.

(c} Section 311.1.2 of the international fire code is amended to
read as follows:
311.1.2 Tenant spaces. Storage and lease plans required by
this code shall be revised and updated by the persons owning
or in charge of control of tenant spaces to reflect temporary
or partial wvacancies.

(d) Section 311.2 of the international fire code is amended to
read as follows:
311.2 Safegquarding vacant premises. Permanently and
temporarily unoccupied buildings, structures, premises or
portions thereof (collectively “premises”) shall be secured
and protected by persons owning or in charge or control of
such premises in accordance with Sections 311.2.1 through
311.2.3.

(e) Section 311.3 of the international fire code is amended to

read as follows:

311.3 Removal of combustibles. Persons owning, or in charge or
control of, a vacant building, structure, premises or portion
thereof (collectively “premises”), shall remove therefrom all
accumulations of combustible materials, flammable or
combustible waste or rubbish and shall securely 1lock or
otherwise secure doors, windows and other openings to prevent
entry by unauthorized persons. The premises shall be
maintained clear of waste or hazardous materials.

Exceptions:

1. Builldings or portions of buildings undergoing additions.
alterations, repairs or change of occupancy in accordance
with the International Building Code, where waste is
controlled and removed as required by Section 304.




(£)

=)

2. Seasonally occupied buildings.

Section 311.4 of the international fire code is amended to

read as follows:

311.4 Removal of hazardous materials. Persons owning or having
charge or contrel of a vacant building, structure, premises or
portion thereof containing hazardous materials requlated by
Chapter 50 shall comply with the facility closure reguirements
of Section 5001.6.

Section 311.5 of the international fire code is amended to

read as follows:

311.5 Placards. Any vacant or abandoned buildings or
structures determined to be unsafe pursuant to Section 110 of
this code relating to structural or interior hazards may be
marked as regquired by Sections 311.5.1 through 311.5.5,

Section 311 of the internaticnal fire code is amended by

Secs.

Sec.

adding a new section 311.6 as follows:

The fire code official may
notify the perscn(s) owning, or in charge or control of, a
vacant building, structure, premises or portion thereof
(collectively “premises”) of failure to comply with any of the
reguirements of Sections 311.2 to 311.4, and may regquire
compliance by such person(s) within the time set forth in the
notice. If compliance does not occur within the time set forth
in the notice, the fire chief or his or her designee may seek
available remedies, including but not limited to abatement and
assessment of costs pursuant to chapters 26, 42 and/or 60 of
the city code, as applicable.

Section 311.6 Compliance.

46-7446-76—46-90. Reserved.

ARTICLE VIII. FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS

46-246. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,~---. Permitsrequired-

EFor
o

]
=

~

neotr romguitread Ffar +thea ot araaen v dion ~f .
ot gurroa——otT 1t STOoTrtS Fe— A=
o Elommahl o 11 emiride 1 +he i1l +anlk £ = mat v
k=9 [F I S U R ¥ ) W N S ) .;.A_\:lu.r.uu =y o g L 3 3 ="y [E S v ) e vy AT T T FY93 L= e wy
[] 7 [ r
or —marni e haat+tinmea T ant Brloacco ot~ en I +ha
Yy [ N guun g iy Ny T u\‘_l_.llg tJ_Lu.AL\‘, L 4 g s iy T =" A.LA& 7 —IT ARy



a0
TLIY

131 A ol o
WS Tt

TaL

chiaf

‘F':'V‘

oaf +tha

n

-r

o

nrnanfa
T ioTraT

L
TT

I s s s v T

L

PTit=L

'
Pl oot B BN
[ = =r 3 3 yv g =g o g i

.
=

o
A4

sz vt oo

v

anmt o

Pa

£1ammaklea
O COTOTTCAO DO

q
L g S oy

T

T T Tt

Pepe g =y ey

20 Ao

af neatr mearyea +han

Ty T

TITCIITT OO

o

T It

P

1pidds oaF oS oeyenrd s~
,J...L\.iu_t_uuiug, L= =4

1

TTTANH
T

TT or

I
=

~l oo
gy e g

inog ~f
Lo =y

31

cCOo ity

Pat o
ot o4

Fa

(2N

T v o

=

= F

locat+riana

or othor

LY
TT

.
3

[ ga =y = oy e

[ S W vy e gy v o s e

A=y o o e

T

haY

1

do

103113

1

TT o TTT N

o af ~1l oo

il A Wa St

Qf v e hoanrmA7 4

(3

T

=

B L s e

A= g T TR O

T

I T ity
of 28 ol dlama

TTUTTg Ty

bt Falol ol

mn

13 1 A3 vy

b
Tt

3

ol Y FaleWalal

of 0
T

=
of 660

=g~

25T

[ =i~ === =y ¥ 2

oot —=x5
P\1'\'; 1 f'q

ry

T

rey

ol S e Was Y

=

ik aWa'd

of
T

'
otk oo
(= g v 2

oalloana

=

T

T TSIy

g OiTo

it h

oconnactad

1

T

O3

loco

arllana

o=

3
O

i e
Wil

£yl

o
p=

W C1It

oo TioT

TT

==

=

= =y ey

v iy

o rof g o1 ey

ik Ve s
T Iitgy

Wl A4

g =

b el FaValalolalkilhaVaed

maniifamt e
ittt

The

(AN

B S LT T

T

PTrocesooisy
or TTITTA ]

LR = =y

TIET

a1
Se—aSea—3 1

£
A==

Qv 1o

ide

TS

11

whovra
WItts T

1ds A

T oo O T

Ll a sk

TT
=

T
=

claoo
L v e

o o= =y oy ar 3

T

1loac

L G S we m s g
ot ot

il

Ayt

SR Il otk R et
RS HG

£

faalkilaWo St ol

R aWad nNYroo
PII= R F R ey S e A Y ) eSS

Fhoeo mamigf oty

TTTT

e

=

o T ITY

LAt ot 2L ]
o Tty

1.1
Py

1de 3

3 0313

1

.
r _ocomhbuyoctrailbhl o
HoRSeIore—=3gua3as

T

Qb oy ~E L] ammaln] o
o35t RS

(BN

oY Mmooy o

no

o l’OOO a1l

ol

+ vz

TTOTTOgT T TP oy

Fakal ataWalk]

ot Aracn

Fha +~+51

oI

F333

Fa=30HS
f +anlo

T

|epe g

T

PNV LT R EE AV |
LTV

atthaor

o e e T B N
o T

O TN T Ny

TInetr 1] a4+ 2 ~An
T+HStadaarat+

(e
7

oot

1'/‘]0
=TG5

=

VAT ¥ B A o my oy
~
L= awe

o

e o

vy

TT

S A

10313

1

IT
T

T
=

cl oo
A=y yey

Rl et b alWa'd

cont o

bl avieyraiinA
DT oW I oT

or
o=

oS
+tanl
L Sap v 2 g 4 )

TSR R P R AL |

axllan
o061

2'7'—_\
ranlkc

of
A =

falt FaValalal

m
ey

11 ada
_LJ.\jLA—L\AI—J

it 1Al ner

L= Nu—L_L\.A_I_.\.Lv

1

olaoe
AVRe e gy

T T T
= e

A=z ¥ 2= 7
278 311 an

TRrTTT
=

X

T

Irned Aa
oy g =g ay

T T

g T

~

7

+ v
vV

b

1 dea

oo T

ot o

RN

] A S S o I o B = W o

OX

PRt Nl BEWo TN, Vo ot o

Moy vyarmoa iy

[T A

»r
=

Tt
or TTT

PFPFRY7

A g =

L STy O ) VR W s S v U g g v A S X ¥

EaAS =

Eemey e g o iy 4

TIo O

= S e g oy

d wgit+th ~lace T TT
eSSt Wrer— S 5S——=5—==

DT oWy

11 A oxr halowaraonnd

TCIoTUY T T oo™

Atz

irements.

d tank requ

Special liqui

46-247.

Sec.

4{a) The storage of class I or II flammable or combustible liquids

as

1 and 2,

fire zones

in

hibited

is pro
46-2 of this chapter

boveground tanks

in a

an exception may be made

it

r

.

tion

in sec

defined

d approved by the

ing an

1n wr

f requested

i

at a construction site

fire chief.

+anle
o

Hnrnadoararaund

a3
TLIT

bhallaood 1 mer of

anc~h g e o

TEITOTT

Whan

()

VT

ESAC ESASACEX A

T

=

T TIThno oIty
he AdAanmea Wy

A o

15
ool 1

TY

YVIT

+ha

nlaocdmey o et wnad bl A

a
ottty
Fanl

a1l e

=

a1l
pe =y =

P 2 B e o T T T oW T

A=

g

SOt DY —Pr
oot Aane e o~

=

ot T

fr aac~h

T
cho11

srara o fF cenm oot o

R T W o W, 4

caoant o

a1
T

[= = o ey e W 3 O SR WL & = = BALE A= SR T oT TcroT

oI Ty

=

OISy

ba
T =

ol
T oo

The

ToIrIcy

+he + ol
L

ot
o=

canaetiss

agallanal
T oIS

a0n
[ R =

ot rarma

ocabhleoo
cHo o7

ot o

Y [ = o
numbalxr
o &

=Nvd

mat
o

=3 T

S~ A
SITTITTOT

+onrnl + -~

Tt

cocoura +tha

wototuTTT

~damiatolsy
T AT quuc

Cabhlac

A A
TITCE

o L e

+

1 Oo3Aan

o

+ o
=

1=

T

-7

==

[ 35 S =yt = g g -y 4 2y oy

ch-o11

ot oo

roado

whan oty A
(AT =rya3

mat
Py =

ha
g

tha

(o g 3= gu ===

S St PO
o
P cea=s
1

11

LY g =y =

+hea ot

TIT

A=

Wl TIT B

TITE

O
tanded +a~

T 4
hi
i

na3n
g e
o~z
= gy

3,
A4

A
(=3 a=

Fazae m
Arrtarnt A A At A

4
it

113 Imiam
pIyzecy yy=masae sy

P g g

el

anchaorad
ToFage—ahe

T T

=y

nroner s
F ol o4

“noharoaeces

I

o M g g v v 3 v o e v

Ty
£

rroreTT

oIt o &

CIITT

111 w1+l
oW o — Tt

3
ey

+anl
oS

+ha
e

Frmirm anech ey~ b o
TR CHOFage—witeh

1N

T T T Ot

e m

Pt oVt & o]
LA S~ e

Pt

naot

e
= F

chall
oITICr T

+anks
= o 2 e

n adon Wa. &
.Lu\_j
IS ATATINE. -
~ O
OO0 ~allana

ot
'U\}V 3\.ALJ.VJJL)

= vy

mndoraraiindg
SRS ER= A T P A=y

Tt

for
o
hoco

fodie Bl S atal
(o= =y s e

eont rmine
TP pe
+hanr

{ =0

+ prey
WO

aga3llanca
o7

gt

3060
and 2 1/2

(=

+anlra
[ 6 o

for
ey 1O

L aWal
TTITTT

] 1./2 |
e h—— 315
for +arka

leoco
[ S gy g

dmeheaa £ g
[ SF SRy ¢ & R g m g g

I/

ETITr

2L_A00 +~ 10
J,\JU\J g ==

T TIS

heo
TIOO-—1 O

hilk aWal
o 4




Sec.

(a)

46-281. Location of containers.

Undexrground-—containers for liguefied petroleum gas——shaltl not
Wit its——No liquefied
petroleum gas installation shall be permitted in fire zone
nos. 1 and 2 of the fire district as defined in section 46-2
of this chapter, unless specifically approved by the fire
chief on a temporary basis only or the containers are not
larger than 20 pounds, located outside a building, and are
used for cocking purposes only.

The aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not
exceed 1,000 gallons of water capacity, except that 1in
particular installations this limit may be altered at the
discretion of the chief of the fire prevention bureau after
due consideration of all factors involved. Bulk plants, gas
utility plants, container charging operations, and larger
amounts of storage shall be governed by approved national
standards and state regulations.

Containers and first stage regulating equipment shall be
located outside of buildings, other than buildings especially
provided for this purpose, except that small department of
transportation containers and regulating equipment may be used
indoors under the following conditions:

e e v g 1 +hea oYy ot s 13
= et 1t e Ppofrat =

(1) If temporarily used for demonstration purposes and
the container has a maximum water capacity of 12—20
pounds.

(2) If used with a completely self-contained gas hand
torch or similar equipment and the container has a
maximum water capacity of 2 1/2 pounds.



ot Fha £

+o21laod faor 1o
[ EP Ap QP g WPy 0 G Ry i W 3 [ Sl ga ing TOT A

1o

naot

IT

CSroavramea Af At

{3\
-~

TITIICrT

TIT

1=

[ Y =i o wp o5 e g <

T

TToT
3

e

£
ES

roaogulariana
ST Z AR SRS AT BS e e A T T

+

Sy

v

b ~esroavyrea~ g
=] It

+ k17
[ G 3 O i it vy P g

o TTIT

It e S . W e T

1zad

3

| g s wp e sy > g g g g o 9

13+

oaf +he 1o
1 Il L yrw- g e

+the mram-tono
9 P g

CITTT T

TT

On

roeoal~
P o e g o g =y

Eaor

T

o

hall be located with respect—+o—the

iner s

dual conta

ivi

ind

Each

(d)

r+ 17

Table 6104

1O O

1

ik aVWa S o)

+ ot bhaaa 7 A4
THpoLEtaht

accordance w

code.

ek aWath

nosract
TTCTOIT

in
ire

T~y

jid
3 of the £

B I I

po-ge = pa ngea 2 @ gwy

oIy

[ v

+ o1~
(S5 2 S oS

Lk alad
WIS

£511 a0
R Sep W i g nf

+h
T

ith

1=

S st
oottt

1o
T

TSI

T

oy (Cant o

I

+harn 120

Ilocco
==

TTITITT

e

2_000
Z oo

507
D=~

=

o
=2 =

1o

+oll o+
TSt 1ae3eh

bl aWal

=

R I e W Vet o b ol T o Wl
ittt oot

of -~
[ S e

SOaorongato tradt oy SNy~ g
STt —watoT—CopadtTty

(=R E AN A B

T+ +he~
T

Al ot anman

agallone Ar ograsnt o +he  mamng i

507

cOonollmoy

=
=t

o TTrroe

Trr T It eartT

|- o o

E=

ST Ot

Ay

[ e = v P =gy

=T

TSIt

ey

Sy lay

+ohla
A OT

Ton—of +ha o

o vt

L= S SRS S S e S S

width +Fha oo s g o
Wit

PaVate et Wl RS

=

a7 1]

s 7T PPy oy
YN et o

T OTT P

E=
+hea

T

oY
SoaOgrocgatra oo o tir

(=AS RS ESASAT A= v

wITC I
+ha
=11

} 1£
T3

1Tnox

SayNa e~ b xy

ratrhar +hon
[ S O A W 3 g W vy

Totrta Tt T

TIreT T pTa T Ty o™

CIITIIT

A= = == s 4

ba
T

alh~11
Stict=

31 on

1nrnatallat g
[ S Y S gy Wy G GUE gl ey WP S e S g

oaaoh
LA TT

hat < mada
TT T ESia= = Ay 7

v
3

+ 311 o+
TS to oo

than ona 1o
T oTe

bl
p

m
IIT

Tha
EEy

faoat
[ Sy -y

Bz a2t laaat 28
T AT == L e gy vy LT

I-Oon

+al1lat
[ BN O SN ) WP G R Sy Sy - iy S ey

1 ma

Ll aPataal anoth
O HR—aoc

FaFal oS-t o o |
SCPpaTrat

talled for use shall not be stacked one above

ins

Containers

(e)

the other. Containers of 1,000 gallons or less shall be set on

Concrete

ipping.

to prevent t

icient size

blocks or bricks shall not be used.

Waods

\RJ

concrete pads of suff

ramnoirad
HEehCV

choall bhe
S0

[33 1 Jusy o gn oy v g ng

Ariz ~yvraaoa S cemitiad ] A ol At o] o
LALJ, \.A.L_Y 3.1_(.(\.)\), LA A N ) B N W i W S N Sy ey

. .
withian
Wl Tt

pesy

(£
=+

I-nar

amsz oot o
Gy o taxrieE=

£
+

foaat
-

+an

=

T




S&H
K

(¢f) The minimum separation between liquefied petroleum gas
~ containers and flammable ligquid tanks shall be 20 feet, and
the minimum separation between a container and the centerline

of the dike shall be ten feet.

ARTICLE X. TENTS

Sec. 46-316. Distance.

The distance requirements in Chapter 24—31 of the
International Fire Code may be lowered if approved in advance and
in writing by the fire chief or designee.

Sec. 46-318. Exception to Section 24633103.2.

Section 24033103.2 of the International Fire Code shall-bels
amended to include the following exception, with all other
provisions of said Section remaining the same:

(3) The aggregate area of 10-feet by 10-feet (10’x10") tents,
with or without open sides, in any configuration, not to
exceed 1000 square feet (93 m?) total.

Section 2. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect

as of November 1, 2013, following passage and publication as

provided by law.

FORM APPROVED:

lenna K. Frank
Assistant City Attorney

0



