’t Roll Call Number Agenda Item Number

HIA

Date ___ October 24,2016

WHEREAS, the Police Department requested the Finance Department Procurement
Division to solicit bids for ammunition; and

WHEREAS, the City of Des Moines Finance Department Procurement Division solicited
bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V17-018 to fifteen (15) potential bidders
with six (6) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for items referenced in bold on the attached bid
tabulation form were received from Ultramax Ammunition, 2112 Elk Vale Road, Rapid City, SD
57701, Roger Braunstein, Owner; Williams Shooters Supply, 1813 Quintron Way, Quincy, IL
62305, Kent Williams, President; and Sunset Law Enforcement, 303 Sherman Ave., Ackley, IA
50601, Mike Bright, President; and

WHEREAS, $95,388.83 of the funding is available from PD220352/Personnel &
Training, and $112,207.30 of the funding is available from PD221366/Tactical; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Police Department recommend
approval of the low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED; that the Des Moines City Council hereby
accepts and approves the above referenced low dollar compliant bids for ammunition as
submitted by Ultramax Ammunition, Williams Shooters Supply and Sunset Law Enforcement at
a total cost of $207,596.13.

Moved by to adopt
Approved as to form:
1
ﬁ%ﬁ DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney
COUNCIL ACTION | YEAS | NAYS | PASS | ABSENT CERTIFICATE
COWNIE
COLEMAN ] I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby
GATTO certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,
GRAY among other proceedings the above was adopted.
HENSLEY
MAHAFFEY IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
MOORE above written.
TOTAL
MOTION CARRIED APPROVED
Mayor City Clerk




Bidder
Address
City
Terms
FOB:
Delivery:

ACADEMY AMMO

Practice Pistol Ammunition Clean Fire

2500 - 38 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 158 grain)
132,400 - 9mm Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 147m grain}

92,100 - 40 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 180 grain TMJ)
155,800 - 45 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 230 grain TMJ)

Pistol Duty Ammunition

50 - 22 caliber (CCl Velocitor Gold dot Hollow point 40 grain)
100 - 25 Auto (Gold Dot Hollow Point 35 grain)

100 - 32 Auto (Gold Dot Hollow Point 80 grain)

2000 - 380 Auto (Gold Dot Hollow Point 90 grain)

4000 - 380 Auto Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 90 grain)

200 - 38 caliber (.38+P Speer Gold Hollow Point Duty 135 grain)
11,150 - 9mm (Speer Gold Dot Hollow Paint Duty 147 grain)
7600 - 40 caliber (Speer Gold Dot Hollow Point 180 grain)
13,500 - 45 caliber (Speer Gold Dot Hollow Point Duty 230 grain}

Shotgun

9200 - 00 Buck (12 gauge Federal Tactical, 8 pellets)
6700 - 12 gauge slugs (Federal Tactical 1 oz. low recoil)
1100 - Birdshot (Any brand 12 gauge, 71/2 or 8 shot)

METRO STAR AMMO

Practice Pistol Ammunition Clean Fire

51,000 - 40 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 180 grain TMJ)
30,000 - 45 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 230 grain TMJ)
20,000 - 9mm Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 147 grain)

3000 - 45 GAP (Blazer Cleanfire 200 grain TMJ)

Rifle

140,000 - 556 caliber 55 gr Practice American Eagle

35,000 - 223 caliber Hornady 55gr GMX

21,000 - 308 caliber Hornady 168gr BTHP A-Max Tap Precision Ammo

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Ammunition

Opened: 09/02/16

Ultramax Ammunition
2112 Elk Vale Rd.
Rapid City, SD 57701
Net 30

90 days

$185.40/cs. $463.50

$175.20/cs. $23,196.48
$195.80/cs $18,033.18
$216.40/cs. $33,715.12

$2.85
$53.80
$55.60
$0.3914 $782.80
$0.2544 $1,017.60
$82.60
$0.3040 $3,389.60
$0.3300 $2,508.00
$0.37 $5,035.50
$0.4120 $3,790.40
$0.4540 $3,041.80
$0.2600 $286.00
$0.196 $9,985.80
$0.216 $6,492.00
$0.175 $3,504.00
$0.349 $1,047.00
$0.310 $43,400.00
NO BID
NO BID

Police Department Bid No. V17-018

Opened by: mv

Req. #'s 17902302, 17902304

Ultramax Ammunition Williams Shooters Supply, Inc.

1813 Quintron Way, PO Box 3744
Quincy, IL 62305

Alternate Bid for the Rangemaster

$0.2370
$0.1802
$0.2164
$0.2576

$0.3400
$0.3810
$0.4330

90 days

$592.50

$23,858.48

$19,930.44

$40,134.08

$3,791.00

$2,895.60

$5,845.50
$0.20 $220.00
$0.85 $29,575.00
$0.99 $20,790.00

Kiesler Police Supply
2802 Sable Mill Rd.
Jeffersonville, IN 47130

60 - 365
$267.51 $535.02
$244.58 $32,281.92
$289.14 $26,600.88
$370.37 $57,407.35
NO BID

$301.84 $301.84
$310.11 $310.11
$488.01 $976.02
NO BID

$426.87 $426.87
$426.87 $4,695.57
$459.32 $3,215.24
$503.24 $6,542.12
$143.47 $5,164.92
$152.85 $3,974.10
$58.27 $233.08
$289.14 $14,746.14
$370.37 $11,111.10
$244.56 $4,891.20
$418.93 $1,256.79
$172.44 $48,283.20
NO BID

NO BID

g




CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

PAGE 2 Ammunition

Opened: 09/02/16

Bidder Apple Land Law Enforcement
Address 48524 Appleland Dr.

City Gays Mills, Wl 54631

Terms Net 30

FOB: Des Moines

Delivery: 90 - 120 days

ACADEMY AMMO

Practice Pistol Ammunition Clean Fire

2500 - 38 caliber Cleanfire {Blazer Cleanfire 158 grain)
132,400 - 9mm Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 147m grain)

92,100 - 40 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 180 grain TMJ)
155,800 - 45 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 230 grain TMJ)

Pistol Duty Ammunition

50 - 22 caliber (CCI Velocitor Gold dot Hollow point 40 grain)
100 - 25 Auto (Gold Dot Hollow Point 35 grain)

100 - 32 Auto (Gold Dot Hollow Point 60 grain)

2000 - 380 Auto (Gold Dot Hollow Point 90 grain)

4000 - 380 Auto Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 90 grain)

200 - 38 caliber (.38+P Speer Gold Hollow Point Duty 135 grain)
11,150 - 9mm (Speer Gold Dot Hollow Point Duty 147 grain)
7600 - 40 caliber (Speer Gold Dot Hollow Point 180 grain)
13,500 - 45 caliber (Speer Gold Dot Hollow Point Duty 230 grain)

Shotgun

9200 - 00 Buck (12 gauge Federal Tactical, 8 pellets)
6700 - 12 gauge slugs (Federal Tactical 1 oz. low recoil)
1100 - Birdshot (Any brand 12 gauge, 71/2 or 8 shot)

METRO STAR AMMO

Practice Pistol Ammunition Clean Fire

51,000 - 40 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 180 grain TMJ)
30,000 - 45 caliber Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 230 grain TMJ)
20,000 - 9mm Cleanfire (Blazer Cleanfire 147 grain)

3000 - 45 GAP (Blazer Cleanfire 200 grain TMJ)

Rifle

140,000 - 556 caliber 55 gr Practice American Eagle

35,000 - 223 caliber H ornaday 55gr GMX $960.10 $33,603.50
21,000 - 308 caliber Hornady 168gr BTHP A-Max Tap Precision Ammo $1,006.80 $21,142.80

Police Department

Opened by: mv

Sunset Law Enforcement
303 Sherman Ave.

Acklay, IA 50601
Net 30

30 60 days

$0.214

$802.00
$0.9385

$235.40

$28,070.00
$19,708.50

Bid No. V17-019

Req. #'s 17902302, 17902304

"NO BIDS" FROM:
Lawman's & Shooters Supply
Ray O'Herron Co.

NO RESPONSE FROM:
Brownells Law Enforcement
GT Distributors

Hatcher Gun Company
KEEPRS

Matre Arms & Ammunition

Mile High Shooting Accessories
Simmons Gun Specialties
Streichers

yeh




