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Date December 5, 2016.

WHEREAS, the Fire Department requested the Finance Department Procurement Division to

solicit bids for an annual contract with two (2) additional one year renewal options to furnish firefighting

helmets, hoods, gloves and boots; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to

Bid VI 7-026 to fourteen (14) potential bidders with six (6) proposals received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids for ITEMS 1, 3 and 4 was received from Feld Fire, 113
N. Griffin Road, Carroll, IA 51401, John Feld, Owner; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids for ITEM 2 was received from Municipal Emergency
Services, 1880 East Military Ave., Fremont, NE 68025, Nicole Kingston, Manager; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from FD104113/Operations, for an annual estimated cost of
$66,000.00; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fire Department recommend approval of

multiple awards for firefightmg helmets, hoods, gloves and boots.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and
approves the award to the aforementioned bidders, and further authorizes the Procurement Administrator

to enter into annual agreements renewable for two (2) additional twelve (12) month periods, with price

increases complying with agreement terms.

Approved as to form:

^i/iJcA&z.
Ann DiDonato

Assistant City Attorney
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CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby
certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,
among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
above written.

City Clerk



CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Bidder
Address
City
Terms

FOB:
Delivery:

Annual Agreement for

Firefighting Helmets,
Gloves, Hoods, Boots
Opened: 11/08/16

Kenco Fire Equipment, Inc.

1810 St. Louis St.
Springfield, MO 65802
Net 30
Destination
7-10 days

Fire Department

Opened by: mv

BidNo.V17.026

Req. #'s 17903773,3777
3778,3779

Municipal Emergency Services Alex Air Apparatus, Inc.

1880 East Military Ave. 11897 County Road 87 SE
Fremont, NE 68025 Alexandria. MN 56308

Net 30
Ship pt.

14 days 20 days

Sandry Fire Supply, LLC
618 6th Street
DeWitt, IA 52742
Net 30
Des Moines

21 days

Feld Fire
HSN.Grittith Rd.
Carroll, IA 51401
Net 30
Destination
30 days

Danko

109 Ash Street
Snyder.NE 686640218

ITEM 1—40 - 75 Each - Cairns/MSA 664 Invader Helmet
White #MOD-E4C3A221
Red #MOD-E2C3A221
Yellow SMOD-E5C3A221

ITEM 2—100 Each - Majestic PAC-11 DS Firefighting Hoods

ITEM 4 — 40 Pairs - Haix Leather Fire Boots

Fire Hero Xtreme

Fire Hunter Extreme

NO BID

$28.90/EA
$29.95/EA - 2nd year
$31.95/EA-3rdyear

ITEM 3—75 -125 Pairs - Shelby Flex 24-7 Firefighting Gloves NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

$21.00fEA

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID $187.35/EA S183.00/EA NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$328.75/Pair
$314.25/Pair
(Shipping-$20.00 on 1 pair)

S22.65/EA

$108.10/Pair

NO BID
NO BID

$21.70/EA

$96.50/Pair

$295.00/Pair
$287.00fPair

NO BID

NO BID

$347.00/Pair
$332.00/Pair

NO RESPONSE FROM:
Chief Supply
Clarey's Safety Equipment
Fire Guard

Galls/Allamar
Grainger
Heiman Fire Equipment

The Fire Store
W.S. Dariey & Company
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