
Roll Call Number Agenda Item Number

43 C.

Date .May22,2Q17,

WHEREAS, the Street Maintenance Division of the Public Works Department, along with the City of West
Des Moines, Polk County and 24 other public entities representing the Central Iowa Salt Group (CISG) wished to
solicit joint bids for rock salt for delivery to the Metropolitan Salt Storage Facility, and to individual CISG agencies
storage facilities; and

WHEREAS, the City of West Des Moines through its Public Works Department, on behalf of CISG,
solicited invitation for bids by advertisement and mailing to seven (7) potential bidders with six (6) bids received;
and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for delivery to the metropolitan storage facility was received
from Hutchinson Salt Co., PO Box 346, Paola, KS 66071, Lany Bingham, President, at a unit cost of$53.67/ton, or
$375,690.00 for 7,000 tons; and

WHEREAS, Municipal Code section 2-726(f) authorizes the procurement of goods and/or services from
contracts that have been competitively established through cooperative group contracting consortiums for state
government departments, institutions, agencies and political subdivisions, without conforming to the competitive
bidding requirements of the Procurement Division; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from PW240402/Street Mamtenance for a total cost of $375,690.00; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Public Works Department recommend approval of the
low dollar compliant bid;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves
the low dollar compliant bid for rock salt as submitted by Hutohinson Salt Co. at a total cost of $375,690.00.

Moved by to adopt

Approved as to form:

,.. /'.^ • / •'»

Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney
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CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby
certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,
among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
above written.

City Clerk



2017-18 Granualr Delcer Bid

for Ice Control
CENTRAL IOWA SALT GROUP (CISG)

Administered by the City of West Des Homes

intitv

:ity of Add
0. Box 248

108 N. 5tli Street
Ud.IA 50003

^ity of Ankeny
:)ublic Works Department
[15SW 3rd Street
WMIV, Iowa 50021
:ityofBondurant
106 lA Street
3ondurant,IA 50035
:ity of Carlisle
,95N. I st Street
:arli8lL.,Iowa 50C47
:ity of Clivc
Public Works Department
)289 University Blvd.
:livc.Iowa 50053
Dallas Cty Engineers Office-
1340 250th Street
Ucl. Iowa 50003
^ityofDcsMoines
;16SE 5th Street
3es Moines, la™ 50309
City of Crimes
)00 N. Main Street
crimes. Iowa 50111
Cityuflndianola
Public Works Department
706 N. 6tli Street
jidinnola. Iowa 50125
City ofJohnston
Public Works Department
S400NWBeoverDriv(
folmston. Iowa 50131
CityufKnoxvillc
Public Works Department
i05 S. 3rd Street
Knoxville, Iowa 50138
Mil dis un County
U05ECourtAvenue
Winlerset. Iowa 50273
Marion Cty Engineers Oftictt
402 Wilktts Drive
Knoxville. Iowa 50138
CityofMitchcllvilk
201 CottonAve.
Mitcheltville. IA 50169
City of Newton
Public Works Department
1700 N. 4th Avenue W(
Newion.Iowa5020B-1926
CityofNorwnlk
705 North Avenue
Nonvalkjowd 50021

lid Option I
Post Season

Estimated
Tonniific

Bidders:

0

0

0

50

0

1,200

0

0

100

0

0

300

500

0

u

0

Bid Option I-Post Season

Cost/Ton

:entnlSalt|

S68.63

«67.82

$67.22

M7.32

S68.11

c-a

185.50

187.75

$85.5C

S87.7;

SS3.T.

c.^..

$93.25

$98.06

$!)3.25

$98.06

$89.27

lulehinson

S6L17

SfiO.67

S5'J.67

S62.03

Sfi3.67

Independent

S73.24

$73.30

$66.57

No Bid

t66.54

Murton

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

BltckStnp

168.00

S67.50

t67.0D

S65.50

167.45

Bid Option I - Post Sciuion/Prc-Trcated

Cost/Ton (Optional)

mini Slit

SS9.13

SSV.32

S87.72

S87.ti2

S(i0.fil

Careill

$97.50

$100.00

$07.50

S100.0C

i95.SO

Compna*

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBil

No Bid

Hutchinton

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Independent

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Morion

No Bid

No Bid

Ho Bid

NoBkl

No Bid

BhdtStnp

No Bid

N» Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

lid Option 2
Prc-Scasun

Estimated
Tonnanc

300

1.500

200

100

650

0

0

146

225

550

200

100

700

60

550

500

Bid Option 2 - Pre-Scason
Cost/Ton

:CTtralSall

SS9.23

S55.85

$59.99

$60.78

$55.93

S61.89

t59.88

t55.98

S59.95

$60.23

S57.8G

$61,10

SSS.41

157.27

C;KB;lt

187.75

185.50

(85.50

(85.50

(85.50

M5.5C

(85.5C

185.5C

S83.7;

$87.7f

$83.7;

S85.5(

$83,7;

t85.S(

Jompaai

198,06

(94.60

193.54

193,25

194.60

195.49

N3.25

i94.89

$89.27

$98.06

189.2-;

$92.9£

$91,2f

S94.6C

lutchininn

S57.67

S53.<7

S55.ti7

S57.fi7

S53.67

S53.67

I53.(i7

S53.G7

S62.67

S5(i.03

S62.67

S55.17

$59.67

S53.fi7

ndcpcndent

$74.30

t69.08

$70.85

CT.24

$71.66

171.73

t66.57

S71.15I

S66.54

No Bid

t66.54

$74.00

$73.84

174.26

Morton

No Bid

Nn Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

N» Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

IhckSttBj

$63.90

t64.60

$65.90

363.00

$63.90

it62.00

t62.25

t63.90

$63.90

S6I,5C

S63.SC

$64.9C

S65.9C

163.41

Bid Option 2" Prc-Scason/Prc-Trcittcd

Cosit/Ton (Optional)

cnlral Salt I

S79.73

S7C.35

SW.4 9

Sf(t.2ft

S76.43

$82.3'»

380.38

S76.-18

SW.45

S8U.73

S7i).3(i

S8L(i()

5701

•E77.77

Careill

1100.00

»7.50

$97,50

$97.50

$97.50

H7.50

187.50

t97.50

$95.50

SIOO.OC

S95.50

$97.50

S95.50

$97.50

a.mp...

Na Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBic

[fclchifuot,

No Bid

No Bid

N» Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ND Bid

No Bid

Nn Bid

No Bid

Independent

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ND Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mortw

No Bid

No Bid

No]

No Ejd

No]

_

NoBJdd



2017-18 Granualr Delcer Bid
for Ice Control

CENTRAL IOWA SALT GROUP (CiSG)
Administered by the City of West Des Molnas

..„„„

City ofPullu
Public Works Department

Pdlu.to™ 50219
Cilyaf Perry
1102 WiUisAvc., Suite 300
Penv.Iowa 50220
City at Pleasant Hill
1600 S.Plaumt Hill Blvd
Pleasiint HilL Iowa 50327
City ofPIcnsantvilIe
108 W. Jackson Street
Pleasantvillt:, Iowa 50225
City ufPotk City
Public Works Department
301 Nortluide Drive
Polk Citv, Iowa 50226
CityofUrbnndalc
Public Works Department
9401 Hicbuan Road
Jrbandale, Iowa 50322
Warrun Cty Engineers Office
30 IN. Buxton
[ndianola. Iowa 50125
CityofWaukcc
Public Works Department
1205 6tli Street
Waukee. Iowa 50263
CityufWcstDcsMoincii
Public Works Department
5 60 South 16th Street
West Des Moines. Iowa 50265
City ofWindsor Heights
Public Works Department
1133 66th Street
Windsor Heights. Iowa 5031L
CityofWoodwiird
105 E. 2nd St
Woodward. IA 50276

SUBTOTAL;

Bid Option I
Post Scnson

Eittlmntcd

Bidders:

200

0

0

0

Q

0

500

0

0

0

0

2,850

Bid Option I-Post Season
Coiit/Ton

central Salt |

t68.42

$67.34

CUB.II

$83.75

185.50

&»p...

$88.10

193.25

Hulchumon

Sfil.67

$5.1. CT

Indcpcndcnl

No Bid

366.17

Munon

No Bid

No Bid

BhckStnp

$68.40

S66.90

Bid Option I - Post Seaaon/Prc-Trcatcd

Coit/Ton (Optional)

central Salt

S88.92

$87.84

Cargm

S95.50

$97.50

C.mpr.

No Bid

No Bid

Huldunion

No Bid

No Bid

l.d.pmdx

No Bid

NoBU

Morton

No Bid

No Bid

BhASlmp

No Bid

No Bid

Btd Option 2
Prc-Scnson

Estimated
T.nn.t,

0

200

500

0

250

1,300

500

200

0

200

25

8,956

Bid Option 2 - Prc-Scason

Cost/Ton

:cntnl Soil |

t59.98

C7.27

S59.63

t55.41

S56.43

$59.89

$59.99

$62.75

C«,iU

•87.75

$85,50

185.50

185.50

$85.50

$87.75

S85.50

S87.75

$99.48

$94.60

t»5.49

$94,89

$93.25

$95.49

$94.60

S98.35

Hulchituon

S5/S.03

!E53.ti7

S5(i.U3

S53.ri7

553.67

556.C7

S53.67

SfifU?

Indcpcndcm

$72.95

$71.82

$69.52

$72.29

166.17

$73.07

No Bid

N» Bid

Martun

No Bid

No Bid

N» Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBU

No Bid

SlaebSlraj

$63.90

t64.90

S64.90

i62.9S

$62.95

$64.95

S66.90

367.90

Bid Option 2 " Prc-Scason/Prc-Trciited
Cost/Ton (Optional)

:cntell Salt

S8(U8

S77.77

sna i3

S75.91

S7fi.y3

S8U.39

S8(U(1

SH3.25

C.rtin

$100.00

S97.50

$97.50

$97.50

$97.50

$100.00

t97.50

$100.00

No Bill

No Bid

No Bid

ND Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Hutchinaon

No Bid

No Bid

ND Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

M,.,d,,l

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mortal

i

No Bid

NoBil

-

No Bid

NoBj.

No]

i

No Bid

NoB]d
f

N» Bid

BlackStrap

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Bid Option 3
Pre-Season

Metro Shed
Estimated Tonnaec

72

340

2,200

337

9,949

Bid Ontion_3-Metro Salt Storage Facaity Estimated TonnaKC:| 9W

Seiitrot Sail

$59.72

CnipU

$85.50

Compass

$94.60

H«.l,i.

S53.67

Independent

$71.73

Morton

No Bid

BlnckStrap

$70,90

Total Estimated Tonnage, Bid Options 1,2,3: I 21,755 |
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p


