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Date .June26,.2017,

WHEREAS, the Engineering Department, Traffic & Transportation Division, requested
the Finance Department Procurement Division to solicit bids for various traffic signal equipment

for use by the Signal Shop; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailed

Invitation to Bid VI 7-082 to seven (7) potential bidders with four (4) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the overall low dollar compliant bid was received from General Traffic

Controls, PO Box 1000, Spencer, IA 51301, Alien Glover, President, at a total cost of

$32,020.00; and

WHEREAS, funding is available from C038EG99/TR091; CIP/Traffic Control
Neighborhood Program; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Engineering Department

recommend approval of the aforementioned overall low dollar compliant bid;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby
accepts and approves the overall low dollar compliant bid for various traffic signal equipment

from General Traffic Controls, at a total cost of $32,020.00.

Approved as to form:

4^A/?^/
Ann DiDonato

Assistant City Attorney
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CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH/ City Clerk of said City hereby
certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,
among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
above written.

City Clerk



CITC OF DES WIOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Bidder
Address

City
Terms

FOB:
Delivery:

30 Each - 2010ECIip Signal Monitor

6 Each -1 TOE Signal Controller

6 Each-412C PROM Module

6 Each - 170E Internal Ethernet Communications Module

24 Each - LMD222 Two Channel Loop Monitor

4 Each - Model 2061 High Efficiency Power Supply

GRAND TOTAL

Opened: 06/15/17

Mobo Trex, Inc.
109 W. 55th Street

Davenport, iA 52806
Net 30
Destination

60 days ARO

$790.00 $23,400.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$95.75 $2,298.00

$198.75 $795.00

$26,493.00

T & T Department

Opened by: mv

Traffic Control Corporation

1810 SW White Birch Cir. STE 108
Ankeny, IA 50023
Net 30
Destination

45 days

$790.00

No Bid

$215.00

$390.00

$124.00

$199.00

$23,700.00

$1,290.00

$2,340.00

$2,976.00

$796.00

$31,102.00

No. V17-082

Req.#'s 17909693, 9696, 9698

General Traffic Controls, Inc.
PO Box 1000
Spencer, IA 51301
Net 30
Destination

60 days

$640.00

$1,352.00

$242.00

$148.00

$68.00

$184.00

$19,200.00

$8,112.00

$1,452.00

$888.00

$1,632.00

$736.00

$32,020.00

Bid all or none

Traffic & Transporation Products
23107 Route 2 and 92
Port Byron, IL 81275
Net 30
Origin
60 - 90 days

$626.00

$1,610.00

$340.00

$224.00

$111.00

$322.00

$18,780.00

$9,660.00

$2,040.00

$1,344.00

$2,664.00

$1,288.00

$35,776.00

"NO BID" FROM:
Traffic Parts, Inc.

NO RESPONSE FROM:
Leotek Electronics

Mid American Signal
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