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Date........August 6,2018,

WHEREAS, the Police Department requested the Finance Department Procurement

Division to solicit bids for ammunition; and

WHEREAS, the City ofDes Moines Finance Department Procurement Division solicited
bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V 1 8-028 to fourteen (14) potential bidders
with six (6) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for items referenced in bold on the attached bid
tabulation form were received from Ultramax Ammunition, 2112 Elk Vale Road, Rapid City, SD

57701, Roger Braunstein, Owner; Streicher's Inc., 10911 West Highway 55, Plymouth, MN

55441, Jeremy Jenniges, President; and

WHEREAS, $93,538.19 of the funding is available from PD220352/Personnel &
Training, and $91,4.95.00 of the funding is available from PD221366/Tactical; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Police Department recommend

approval of the low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED; that the Des Moines City Council hereby
accepts and approves the above referenced low dollar compliant bids for ammunition as
submitted by Ultramax Ammunition and Streicher's Inc., at a total cost of $185,033.19.

Approved as to form:

/^V^ t/^/JA^.^
Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney
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CERTIFICATE

I/ DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby
certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines/ held on the above date/
among other proceedings the above w^as adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF/ I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
above written.

_ City Clerk



CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Ammunition

Opened: 0719/18

Police Department

Opened by: mv

BidNo.V19.Q07

Req.#-

Bidder
Address • ' • ' ' •• ,

.CiLy
' Terms

FOB:
Delivery:

ACADEMY ORDER
Practice Pistol Ammunilon Clean Fire
800 - 39 Caliber Cleanflre
204,650 - 9mm Cleanfire
66,750-40 Caliber Cleanfire
70,100-45 Caliber Cleanfire

Frangible Ammunilion- Winchester Sinteriire
22,800 - 9mm Wincherster Centerfire 100 grain
9,300-,'10 Caliber Winchester Cenlerfire 135 grain
10,500- ,'15 Caliber ACP Winchester Centeriire 175 grain

FX Marking Rounds Training Ammunition

5000 - 9mm Speer Force on Force

Pistol Duty Ammunition

50 - 22 caliber
100-25 Auto

100-32 Auto

2000 - 380 Auto
4000 - 380 Auto Cleanfire

22,000 - 9mm
8400-40 Caliber

10,800-45 Caliber

Shotgun
8950-#1 Buck

6,500 -12 Gauge Slugs

UHramax Ammunition

2112 Elk Vale Rd.
Rapid City, SD.57701
Net 30

90 da^s

I0.1S8

$0.1796
$0.221

$0,241

$0.474

¥6.50

50.382

$0.475

$0.319
$0171
$0319
$0352
SO-382

$0-476
$0436

$158.40
$36,755.14
$14,751.75
$16,094.10

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$2,370.00

$6.50
$38,20
$47,50
tG3B.OO

$G84.00
$7,018.00

$2,956.80

$4,125.60

$4,260.20

$2,834.00

Brown el Is, Inc.
3006 Brownells Parkway
Gnnnell, IA 50112

Net 30

2 - 3 days

Slreicherjs, fnc,
10911 West Highway 55
Plymouth, MN 55441
Net 30

90-120 days

Sunset Law Enforcement
303ShermanAve,

Ackley, IA 50601

30 - 90 days

¥23.99

METRO STAR ORDER
Practice Pistol Ammunition Blazer Clean Fire

70.000 - 9mm Cleanfire

10,000-9mm Spear
40 Cleanfire
10,000-.45 Speer Gold Hol Hollow Point 1SOgr.

.45 Clearrfire
10,000 - .45 Speer Gold Dot Hollow Poinl 230 gr

3000 - 45 GAP Blazer Cleanfire 20 gr.

2000 - 45 GAP Speer Gold Dot Hollow Point

FX Marking Rounds Training Ammuntion
7500 - 9mm Speer Force on Force - Blue
7500 - 556 Speer Forca on Force - Red

Rifle
10,000 - 223 Caliber Hornaday 55 gr.

• 67,000 - 556 Caliber X 45mm 55 grain full metal jacket

25,000 -308 Caliber Homaday 168 gr

$0.1796
$0.319

10352

$12,572.00

$3,190.000

$3,520.00

$0-382

$0.326

$0.346

WA74
$0,538

$0.309

$3,820.00
$978.00
1692.00

53,555.00
¥4,036.00

NO BID
$2S,B83.00
NO BID

$7.99
$168-00

$190 80

$8,400.00

NO.giD :.

523,850.00

$0.85
$0.32

$0,9975

$9,50000
$27,640.00

$24,937.50

"NO BIDS FROM.

Williams Shoolers Supply

NO RESPONSE FROM:
Daryl's Gun Shop

Fog Firearms and Ammunition

Gulf States Distribulors
JLM Gun Shop
JT Guns and Supply
Klesler Police Supply
Matre Arms & Ammunition

Ray O'Herron Co.


