
Roll Call Number Agenda Item Number

cl
DATE September 24, 201 8

COMMUNICATION FROM CONTRACTORS
REQUESTING PERMISSION TO SUBLET

CERTAIN ITEMS ON PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS

BE IT RESOLVED, BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DES MODSTES, IOWA: That the attached
communication from each contractor requesting permission to sublet designated items and the attached
Permission to Sublet form, for each project listed below, be and are hereby approved; and each subcontractor is
hereby granted permission to work on said improvement.

Activity ID Project Title Contractor

06-2016-001 E. 42nd Street and Hubbell Avenue Intersection
Improvements

Absolute Concrete Construction, Inc.

Matt Triggs, President
505 1st Avenue
Slater, IA 50244

Moved by

CS"TSF-1945(827)"85-77,UST-006-4(l79)-"4A-77

to adopt.

FORM APPROVED:

^
Kathleen Vanderpool
^eputy City Attorney
^

COUNCIL ACTION |
COWNIE
BOESEN
COLEMAN
GATTO
GRAY
MANDELBAUM
WESTERGAARD
TOTAL

YEAS NAYS PASS ABSENT

MOTION CARRffiD APPROVED

Mayor

I, Diane Rauh, City Clerk of said City Council, hereby
certify that at a meeting of the City Council, held on
the above date, among other proceedings the above

was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above
written.

City Clerk



°1
ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT
CITY OF DES MOINES, IOWA

Activity ID 06-2016-001
Date 9/11/2018

Project

Contractor

PERMISSION TO SUBLET

E. 42nd Street and Hubbell Avenue Intersection Improvements

Absolute Concrete Construction, Inc.

Federal Tax ID 39-1953384

ITEM TO BE SUBLET

ContractNo. 15139 Sublet Request No. 4

ORGANIZATION ,
TO PERFORM

WORK

Grimes Asphalt and Paving
Corporation
5550 NE 22ud Street
DesMoines^IA 50313
(515)266-5173
Federal Tax ID 27-1831755

DBE
Y/N

No

COST OF
SPECIALTY

ITEMS

TOTAL COST
OF WORK
SUBLET

($8,000.00)Millui?

Milling Atnericaa Milling Services, LLC
463 Northland Avenue NE, Suite
203
P.O. Box 10047
Cedar Rapids, IA 52410
Federal Tax ID 46-22951 80

No $8,000.00

Cost of Items Sublet

Cost of Specialty Items Sublet

Cost of Sublet Items Less Speciality Items

Contract Amount

Contract Amount Less Total Specialty Items (d-b)

Percentage of Contract Sublet to Date (c/e)

Previous

Request

$815,098.40

$815,098.40

This
Request

Total
To Date

$815,098.40

$815,098.40

$1,169,224.88

$1,169,224.88

69.71%

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

The prime contractor's request for Permission to Sublet the above items of work is approved with the miderstanding that the
prime contractor shall be held responsible for the subcontractors' fall compliance of all terms of the contract.

AttachBient: Contractor's Letter
Requesting Subletting

FormR-outmg; ProjectEngr. - CityEngr. -

Engr. Admin." City Clerk/City M:anager -

Bngr. Admin. - Distribution

"F^^Bi^A^b^eB—g Original - Project File
':::AL DOCVMSMT" J Copy" Project Engmeer



^
Erickson, Zachary L

From: Eli Hartog <jhartog@absoluteconcreteiowa.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September'H, 2018 1:28 PM

To: ErEckson, Zachary L

Subject RE: American Milling E 42nd

Zach/

Grimes Asphalt told me $8,000.

Thanks/

Eli

From: Erickson/ Zachary L [mailto:ZLErickson@dmgov.org]
Sent: Tuesday/ September 11, 2018 11:38 AM
To: Eli Hartog <Jhartog(S)abso!uteconcreteiowa.com>

Subject: RE: American Milling E 42nd

Eli/
i need to know the amount of the work (cost)? I will be taking this out of Grimes Amount and adding in American Milling
Services..

Thanks/

Zach

From: Eii Hartog fma[ito:ihartoR@abso!uteconcreteiowa.com]

Sent: Tuesday/ September II/ 2018 10:14 AM
To: Erickson, Zachary L. <ZLErickson@dmRov.org>

Subject: FW: American Milling E 42nd

Zach/

Couid we please get American Milling Services added as an approved subcontractor for the E. 42nd and Hubbell project?

information below.

Thank you/

Eli

From: Matt Yonker FmaHto:mdyonker@grimesaspha[t.com]

Sent: Tuesday/ September 11, 2018 10:12 AM
To: Eli Hartog <ihartoR@absoluteconcreteiowa.com>

Subject: American Milling E 42nd

To help mil! we are hiring:

American Milling Services

r" ''"^.^'^G D!



P.O. Box 10047

Cedar RapidsJA 52410
Phone:319-365-8665

Fax:319-393-3880

FEDERAL ID #46-2295180

Let me know if you need additionai information

Thanks

Matt


