
Roll Call Number Agenda Item Number

y/
Date ........February. 1P,.202Q.

An Ordinance entitled, "AN ORDD4ANCE to amend the Municipal Code of the City of Des
Moines, Iowa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5,2000, as heretofore
amended, by amending Sections 26-136, 26-138, 26-142, 26-150, and by repealing and

replacing Article III. Building Code of Chapter 26, Buildings and Building Regulations,
relating to adopting the 2018 editions of the International Building Code; International
Residential Code and International Existing Building Code",

presented.

(Council Communication No. ^O't

Moved by_
considered and given first vote for passage.

that this ordinance be

FORM APPROVED:

l\v<h- lCfa/Jz^^ Y^'^
July K'. Parks-Kruse

A^istant City Attorney

(First of three required readings)

w->-c

COUNCIL ACTION

COWNIE

BOESEN

GATTO

GRAY

MANDELBAUM

voss

WESTERGAARD

TOTAL

YEAS

MOTION CARRIED

NAYS PASS

API

,1

ABSEN':

[OVEB

lay or

CERTIFICATE

I, P. Kay Cmelik, City Clerk of said City hereby
certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said
City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among
other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
above written.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

An Ordinance entitled, " AN ORDINANCE to amend the Municipal Code of the City of Des
Moines, Iowa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5,2000, as heretofore
amended, by amending Sections 26-136, 26-138, 26-142, 26-150, and by repealing and

replacing Article III. Building Code of Chapter 26, Buildings and Building Regulations,
relating to adopting the 2018 editions of the International Building Code; International
Residential Code and International Existing Building Code",

Be It Ordained by the City Council of the City ofDes Moines, Iowa:

Section 1. That the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines, Iowa, 2000, adopted by

Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5, 2000, as heretofore amended, is hereby amended by

amending Sections 26-136, 26-138, 26-142, 26-150, and by repealing and replacing Article HI.

Building Code of Chapter 26, Buildings and Building Regulations, relating to adopting the 2018

editions of the International Building Code; International Residential Code and International

Existing Building Code, as follows:

Sec. 26-136. Issuance of permits.

(a) Except as otherwise provided, a-eontractor as defined in Sections 26 450, 26 550, and 26

670 shall sign all applications for electrical, mechafiical and plumbing permits. The
building official shall issue electrical, mechanical and plumbing permits in the name of the
contractor and the contractor's business, if any. If a contractor becomes associated with a

new firm or corporation, immediate notice must be given by filing the name of such firm

or corporation with the office of the building official.
(b) In cases in which an owner-occupant of a single-family dwelling desires to conduct work

on electrical, mechanical, or plumbing systems in the owner-occupant's single-family

dwelling^ the building official may require the_owner-occupant may appear before the
respective discipline inspecto? to demonstrate that he or she is competent to do the specific

work before issuing the permit.-te be accomplished, and after successful demonstration of

competence as determined by the inspector, may obtain the permit(s) by paying the proper
feer For purposes of this section a single family dwelling unit shall mean a detached
residence designed for or occupied by one family only which is the primary residence of
the owner-occupant with record of homestead and qualifies for the homestead tax

exemption. No refrigeration work requiring the recovery or charging of such systems shall
be conducted by those individuals not having the required certification in accordance with

CFG federal regulations.

(c) A person seeking a permit to construct a swimming pool, spa, or water recreational facility,
or any addition, remodeling or other alteration thereto shall make application to the office

1



of the building official for such permit. The plans and specifications and plot plan, as well
as other pertinent explanatory data, shall be submitted with each application.

(d) A person seeking to erect, alter, relocate or maintain any sign or sign structure, as defined
in section 26-800, shall make application to the zoning enforcement officer for a permit to

conduct such work.

(e) No permit shall be issued to any person who has fees outstanding as required by this article
or any other laws or city ordinances.

Sec. 26-138. Permit fees.

(a) There shall be paid to the community development department for the issuance of each

permit, fees in the amounts set in the schedule of fees adopted by the city council by
resolution. Permit fees shall include but not be limited to fees for plumbing permits,

mechanical permits, electrical permits, building permits, certificates of occupancy,

building plan reviews, engineering reviews, planning reviews, zoning reviews, demolition

permits, energy reviews, handicap reviews, reinspections, signs and billboards, erosion
control inspections, and fees for failure to obtain permits before starting work.

(b) The determination of value or valuation under any of the provisions of the building codes
shall be made by the building official. The valuation to be used in computing the permit
and plan-check fees shall be the total value of all construction work for which the permit

is issued, as well as all finish work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air

conditioning, elevators, fire extinguishing systems and any other permanent work or

permanent equipment.

(c) If a permit is issued for a specific amount of work and, upon inspection, it is determined

that more work was performed than was authorized by the permit, the permittee shall

amend the permit or obtain another permit to include all additional work and shall pay any

fees pursuant to paragraph (a) for the new or amended permit.

(d) If an inspection is requested and performed and the building official determines that the
work was not ready, orjfae inspection fails two or more times, or the penw^-Gard was not
available for sign off, a re-inspection fee may be charged at the discretion of the building

official in the amounts set in the schedule of fees adopted by the city council by resolution.

(e) Inspections may be conducted outside of regular business hours for projects that pay an
overtime inspection fee in the amount set in the schedule of fees adopted by the city council

by resolution.
(f) In addition to other fees required in this section, a fee shall be paid to the building official

for the review of plans and inspection of construction for compliance with the energy code.

The amount of such fee is set in the Schedule of Fees adopted by the city council by
resolution.

(g) In addition to other fees required in this section, a fee shall be paid to the building official
for review of documents (plans, specifications and related documentation) for compliance

with the accessibility provisions of Chapter 11 of the IBC for the City ofDes Moines. The
amount of such fee is set in the Schedule of Fees adopted by the city council by resolution.

(h) Plan-checkingfees. Plan-checking fees shall be as follows:
(1) When a plan is required to be submitted a plan-checking fee in the amount set in

the Schedule of Fees adopted by the City Council by resolution shall be paid to the
building official at the time of submitting plans and specifications for checking.



Exception: The plan-check fee for buildings of one and two family dwelling
occupancies and accessory structures for compliance with the International
Residential Code may be waived by the building official when the plans do not
involve unusual or complex engineering design features.

(2) Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan checking,
an additional plan-check fee shall be charged at the rate set in the Schedule of Fees

adopted by the city council by resolution.

(3) Additional plan checking time may be dedicated to projects that pay an overtime
plan checking fee in the amount set in the Schedule of Fees adopted by the City
Council by resolution.

(4) Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days following the date of
application shall expire by limitation, and plans submitted for checking may
thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official. The
building official may extend the time for action by the applicant for a period not
exceeding 180 days upon written request by the applicant showing that
circumstances beyond the control of the applicant have prevented action from being

taken. In order to renew action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall

resubmit plans and pay a new plan-check fee.

(i) No permit shall be issued to any person or firm that owes the city any outstanding fees or

fines.

Sec. 26-142. Revocation, expiration and extension of permit.

(a) Any permit required by this chapter may be revoked by the building official upon the
violation of any section of this article. In addition to the revocation of a permit a person

shall be guilty of a misdemeanor punishable by fine as provided by section 1-15 of this
Code, or shall be guilty of a municipal infraction punishable by a civil penalty as provided
by section 1-15 of this Code.

(b) A willfully false statement in an application for a permit shall be sufficient cause for
revocation.

(c) Every permit, except a demolition permit, Building, electrical, mechanical and plumbing

germjtsnssued by the building official under the provision of the building codes shall expire
under any one of the following conditions:

(1) Failure to begin work authorized within 180 days after issuance of the permit.
(2) Suspension or abandonment of work for 180 days after commencement of the work.

Time of occurrence of suspension or abandonment of work shall be computed from

the date of the most recent inspection since which no progress has been made.
(3) Failure to complete work on a structure designed for residential uses or a townhouse

structure that is part of a townhouse development of eight (8) or fewer units within

one year after issuance of a permit.
(4) Failure to complete work on a structure designed for commercial uses. industrial

uses, or a townhouse structure that is part of a townhouse development of more than
eight (8) units within two years after issuance of a permit. For permits with a

valuation exceeding $10,000,000.00 work shall be completed within three years

after issuance of a permit.



(d) The building official is authorized to grant one 180-day extension of time for permits set
to expire in one year and up to three 180-day extensions of time for permits set to expire

in more than one year.

(e) Extensions in subsection (d) of this section may be further extended by action of the city
council. An expired permit may not be reissued without a permit fee except by resolution

of the city council.

Sec. 26-150. Inspections.

(a) The person doing any work for which a permit is required shall notify the building official
that the work is ready for inspection. The building official shall perform the required
inspection and, if the work complies with the provisions of the building codes, issue-writtea

verification noting the date and results of the mspection._-Ifthe work does not comply with

the provisions of the building codes, the building official shall post a violation tag in a
conspicuous place on or near the work. The violation tag shall contain the date and results

of the inspection and, when requested, shall note specific violations. No tag shall be

removed by any person other than the building officia-L
(b) When a permit applicant is notified that inspections need to be. scheduled, the a^ijcant

shall schedule such inspections within ten (10) days of notification. If not so made. the

bmldmg official may refuse to issue any other permits to the applicant or for the proEerty

until inspections are scheduled and approved.When the work is completed, the person

doing it shall notify the building official that the work is ready for final inspection.
(c) All construction trades inspectors shall have the right to enter upon any property during

reasonable hours in the discharge of their official duties. They are authorized and directed

to inspect any and all building and environmental support system installations within the

city and order the removal, reconfiguration or other modification, for the protection of the

public health, safety and welfare, of any system or component that is not in compliance
with the provisions of municipal ordinances and construction codes. Such order may

mandate the isolation of affected systems or disconnection of utilities.

(d) Inspections may be conducted outside of regular business hours pending staff availability.

After hours inspections will be charged an afterhours'_ overtime inspection fee in the

amount set in the Schedule of Fees adopted by the City Council by resolution.

ARH€tE HI. BUILDING-GOBE

Division 1. Generally

See. 26 300. Adoptiea-e^feteyftational Codes^

(aj)—The provisions of the International Building Code, 2015 edition, published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Aveeue NW, 6th Floor, Washington, D.C.,

20001 are hereby adopted by reference and subject to the additions, deletions and
fiwdifications hereinafter stated as the geneml-requirements for commercial building

construction in the City efDes Moines.
(b)—The provisions of the International Residential Cede, 2015 editiee-pttblished by the

International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue NW, 6 Floor, Washington, D.C.,



20001, except for Part VI FueUjas, Part VII —Plumbing and Part VIII Electrical; and
with the adoption of appendices G, H, J, K, and M, are hereby adopted by reference and
subject to the additions, deletions and modifications hereinafter stated as the general

requirements for construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair,

equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal, and demolition of detached one and

two family dwellings and multiple single family dwellings (townhouses) not more than
three stories in height with a separate means of egress and their accessory structures in the

City ofDes Moines.

(e)—The-p^e visions of the International Existing Building Code, 2015 edition, published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue NW, 6th Floor, Washington, D.C.

20001 are hereby adopted by reference and subject-te the additions, delet-iees, and

modifications hereinafter regulating the repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition

and relocation of existing buildings, including historic buildings, in the City ofDes Moines.
(d)—This article and-all provisions incorporated in this article, by reference or otherwise, shall

be-ksQvm as the building code. References to section numbers not preceded by "26 " will

be to sections in the International Building Code (IBC), the International Existing Building
€e4e<ffiB€)-w4he International Residential Code (IRC)r
All references to the International Plumbing Code found within the IRC, IBC, and IEBC^

(e-
shall be interpreted to refer to the corresponding provision in the State Plumbing Code.

The following climatic and geographic design criteria shall be applied in the application of
the International Residential Code to structures in the City ofDes Moines.

Wifid

w

WWKl

Topographic

Ne

Wind-

zone

Ne A

Subject To Damage From:

Weatlwfing

©(

w-

Design

e°F

Underlaymen

t

¥w

-F4ee4

Miy-m4 183^

Mean

Temperature

48^^°F

See. 26 30lT-Bttildiag-peFtait-i;equircdT

(a)—Building permits are required as identified in IBC chapter 1, part 2; IRC chapter 1, part 2;
and IEBC Chapter 1, part 2.

(b)—A fee for each building permit shall be paid to the building official in the amount set in the
Schedule of Fees adopted by the city coufieil by resolution. —The fee for a permit to

construct only a foundation for a future building shall be 150 percent of the fee specified

in the Schedule efFees^-with the-value ofthe-foundation for such purpose being ten percent

of the total valuation of the future building and foundation.



Sec. 26-302. Building permit cscmptiefiST

(a)—A building permit shall not be required for the following:
^—One story detached accessory buildings used as teel-ep-storage sheds, playhouses,

pet shelters, and similar uses constructed in accordance with the International

Residential Code, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet in area

and complies with all applicable zoning and planning and design requirements.

Such building must be located at least two feet from any property line and three

feet from any dwelling.
(3)—Chain link or wire fences four feet or less in height and all other fences three feet

or less in height.

(3)—Movable cases, counters, and partitions not over five feet nine inches in height.

(4)—Playground equipment.
(5^—Retaining walls, which are not over four feet in height, measured from the bottom

of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding

flammable liquids.
(6)—Retaining walls which are part of a public improvement project regulated by the

City Engineer.
(?)—Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000

gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed two to one.

(8)—Platforms, walks, and driveways not more than 30 inches above grade and not over

any baseffient or story below.

(9)—Painting, papering, and similar finish work.
(W)—Temporofy motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.
(tf)—Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of one and two family dwellings

and accessory structures to one and two family dwellings when projecting not more

than 5'1 inches.

(13)—Minor maintenance and repair work that is deemed by the building official not te
affect structural strength, safety, fire resistance, or sanitation, provided that no such
work shall be performed in a manner contrary to any prwisiens of the building

code or any other laws.

(fe)—Ufiless othenvise exempted, separate plumbing, electrical and mechanical permits will be

required when appropriate for the exempted items in subsection (a) of this section.

(e)—Exemption from the permit requirements of this section shall not be deemed to grant

authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of the

building code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

Sec. 26-393. Dcmhelitioa-of-buil4i»es-attd-stFuetttt2eSi6'3

(a)—Permit required; expiration. A permit shall be required for demolition of buildings and
structures in accordance with the following:
^r) —— No person shall commence the work of demolishing a-ay building or structure until

a permit authorizing such work has been obtained from the building official. Every

demolition permit issued under the provisions of this section shall expire by
limitation and become null and void if the work authorized by such permit is not



commenced within seven calendar days from the date of issuance, or if the work

authorized by such permit is not completed within 30 calendar days of the date of
issuance, unless, because of the extensiveness of the project, the building official

deems at the time of issuance a longer period for either commencement or

completion should be granted.

(3)—Any permittee holding an unexpired demolition permit may request in writing an
extension of time within which the demolition work may be cemmenced or

completed. If such request contains good and satisfactory reasons showing that

circumstances beyond the cesteel of the permittee have preveffted timely

commencement or completion of the work, the building official may extend the

applicable expiration date.
(3)—Except as provided in this section, a demolition permit that has expired shall be null

and void, and before any demolition work is subsequently commenced a new pepfitft
therefore shall be obtained. The fee for such permit shall be at the some rate as the

original permit.
(4)—If a demolition permit to remove an unsafe building or a building that is the subject

of a public nuisance action has expired, the building official shall order the prompt
removal of such structure, in accordance with all requirements of this article. All of

the costs attendant to this action, including administrative costs, shall be either

assessed against the property or collected from the owner unless otherwise directed

by the city council.

(b)—Application for permit. Application for a permit to demolish a building or stmcture shall
be made to the building offieml. The applicant shall provide the following-informatiefir

<4-)—The name and address of the person in responsible charge of the work.

(3)—The street address and legal description of the property on which the building w
structure is located.

(3-)—The name and address-ofthe owner and, when appropriate, his er her legal agen-t-ifi

responsible charge of the property.
(4)—Overall dimensions, number of stories and-Hiaterials of construction of the building

or struct-ire to be demolished.

(§-)—A plan shewing areas to be-pfetected by fences, barricades, covered walkways, G¥
other protective devices, and details of construction for such devices.

(6)—Location of the site where the demolition debri&4s-to be discarded.

(7)—Approval from other affected city departments or governmental agencies when

deemed necessary by the building official and any special conditions or restrictions

relating thereto.

(8-)—Per demolition by explosives, the applicant shall furnish the information required
in this subsection and shall furnish information regarding the person who will be

conducting the demolition by explosives and shall furnish plans showing how the
building or structure will be prepared for demolition, the type and amount of

explosives to be used, and a detailed plan showing what safety precautiens will be

taken to protect persons and property.
(9)—A permit for the demolition of a building or stmetee-by the use of explosives may

be issued by the city council subject to the following conditions:
a;—Tibe-applicant for a permit must demonstrate to the city council the need fef

demolition by-explosives rather than demolition by conventienal means aad



must demonstrate that demoliticwa by explosives can be safely condueted-at

tfee-specific location requested.
b-. —— The building official, fire chief and pel-ice chief shall review the applicatiea

and submit their opinions to the city council concerning whether or not the

demolition can be safely conducted, together with any recommendations

they may have.
e-. ——— The applicant shall provide a certificate of liability insurance for personal

injuries, death and for property damage in an amount not less than
$1,000,000.00 naming the city as an additional named insured party. Th«
certificate shall provide that the coverage shall not be cancelled or changed

without ten days' prior written notice to the city. The city council may

require additional insurance coverage when the hazard appears greater than

normally expected and may also in sueh instance require the posting of a
bond acceptable to the city in an amount commensurate with the severity of

the hazard. The bond shall provide that the applicant shall well and
satisfactorily perform the demolition. The bond shall be for the benefit of
the city and any person who is injured or damaged by the failure of the
applicant to satisfactorily perform the demolition.

A—The applicant shall agree to indemnify and hold harmless the city from all
losses resulting from damages or injuries caused by the applicant or the

applicant's employees, servants or agents arising out of the use of explosives

in demolition.

e-. —— The applicant shall pay the city in advanee^e^^easonable expenses that will

be incurred by the city in furnishing necessary security and police protection

in the vicinity of the demolition site.
{-. —The applicant shall observe all applicable federal, state and local laws in the

course of the demolition, including but not limited to the following:
4-. ——— The applicable provisions of the city fire prevention code relating to

the storage, transportation and use ofexpkisives.
Or. —The rules and regulations of the United States Environmental

Protection Agency relating to the demolition of btt9dmgs or

structures containing asbestos materials or other hazardous air

pollutants.
^-. ——— The applicant shall meet all other requirements of this article relating to the

demolition of structures or buildings; pi:evided, however, that if a conflict

exists between the provisions of this subsection and other sections of the

city Code, the provisions of this subsection shall be deemed to be

controlling.
h-. ——— The applicant need not obtain an obstruetien permit as provided in section

26 304 of this article to block off portions of public property within an
appropriate distance of the demolitiea site, provided that the obstruction is

for less than a 24 hour period and provided that the obstruction is for

security pui-poses in connection with the use o^-expk>Qives. However, the

applicant shall be required to obtain an obstmction permit to use public
property in the cleanup operations following the detcmation of explosives.



^0



official. The building official may also require the presence of approved
security guards or flag persons. Such barricades, fences, lights, and signs as

may be deemed necessary by the building official for protection of the
public shall be maintained after completion of the demolition work until
such time as the site is cleaned of all debris and all excavations, basements,

and depressions in the ground are restored to grade and rendered harmless.

e-. ——— Adequate precautions shall be taken to ensure that procedures or conditions
relating to the demolition work do not constitute a fire hazard. If, in the

opinion of the fire chief, a fire-hazard exists or is likely to exist, he or she

may order the cessation of work or require that appropriate protective

measures approved by him or her be taken.
4-. —— All streets, alleys, and public ways adjacent to the demolition site shall be

kept free and clear of any rubbish, refuse, and loose material resulting fre»
the demolition work unless an obstruction permit for such space has been

obtained.
e-. ——— Demolition of structures subject to public nuisance action shall include

removal of all footing and foundation materials unless otherwise approved

by the building official.
f-. ———— Upon completion of the demolition work, the site shall be left in a cleaa;

smooth condition. Inorganic building nibble, sand, clean earth, or other

approved fill material may be used to fill excavations, basements, and

depressions, provided that the top 12 inches shall be clean earth or its

equivalent in terms of surface smoothness, free from dust, and cleanliness.

If the surface is to be used for the parking of vehicles, it shall be constructed

as required in chapter 135 of the city-Code pertaining to planning and

(3^—No permit to demolish shall be issued until a grading permit, waiver of grading
permit, or a solid waste disposal site license is obtained for any location within the

city where the demolition debris is to be discarded.

See. 26-^M-^bstpttettefr^eytait,-bead,-attd-i?SUH»€e7

(a)—No person shall use aay portion of public property as described in Section 3308 of the
International Building Code without first obtaining an obstruction permit which shall state
the following:
(1)—The name of the owner of the property abutting the public property to be used.

(3)—The name of the person applying for the obstruction permit.
(^)—All accurate description of the public property to be obstructed or occupied.

(4)—The length of-time such obstruction or occupaaey shall exist.

(5)—An agreement to comply in all respects with the provisions and requirements of the
building code, this article and ether city ordinances relating to the use of streets and

alleys and to indemnify and save and keep harmless the city from any and all co-ste?

expense or liability for damages &r injuries to perscms or property or liability of any

kind whatsoever, arising from or growing out of the use and occupancy of such
street or growing out of the deposit-ef such material or any failure to properly pile,

deposit, guard, light or care for such.

10



(6)—Such additional requirements as may be deemed necessary for the protection of the
city and its inhabitants.

(b)—Before an obstruction pemut shall be issued, there shall be placed on file in the office of

the building official peof of liability insurance and, if required, a surety bond as follows:
<4-)—The amount and type of liability insurance required m each instance shall be

determined by the city's finance director or the finance director's designee. The

insurance requirements are hereby made a part of the permit application form. The
insurance shall remain in full force and effect through the obstruction permit

expiration date or such extended time as may be granted by the city.
(3)—If the city engineer or the city engineer's designee determines in their sole discretion

that an obstruction permit applicant's proposed use of the right of-way poses a risk

of damage to the right-of way, the city engineer or the city engineer's designee may

require such applicant to post a surety bond before the obstruction permit is issued.

Such bond, if required, shall be approved by the city engineer or the city engineer's

designee; shall be in the mmimum amount of $5000.00 or such other araemt

determined by the city engineer or the city engineer's designee to be sufficient to

cover the anticipated cost of damage to the right of way; and shall be ceeditieeed
to ensure removal of the obstruction and restoration of the right of way and all

public improvements thereon by or before the expiration date of such obstruction

permit or such extended time as may be granted by the building official.

(e)—No person shall, under any permit, occupy more area than is stated in the obstruction

(d)—The fee for an obstruction permit shall be as set forth in the Schedule of Fees adopted by
the city council by resolution.

(e)—This section shall not apply to street maintenance and a&tions by the city and its employees

andeontmctors.

See. 26-305; Convet2sieB4e-eotHle»ttiium 0¥-iantttple4»wisffig-eeepeFat¥^

(a)—The conversion of aay residential building or portion thereof to a horizontal property

regime or to a multiple housing cooperative shall be treated as a change of occupancy

classification for the building, notwithstanding anything in the building codes to the
contrary, and shall conform to the International Building Cod®?

(b)—No person shall file OF-rccord a declaration in the office of the county recorder to convert

an existing structure located within the eity to a horizontal property regime unless a

certificate of occupancy for compliance with the current building codes has been issued by
the building official

(e)— No person shall file or record an instrument in the office of the county recorder conveying

an interest in real estate located in the city to a multiple housing cooperative unless a

certificate of occupancy for compliance with the current building codes has been issued by

the building official.
(d)—At least 60 days before being filed or recorded in the office of the county recorder, the

applicant shall file a copy of such declaration or such instrument, together with the

following documents with the permit and development administrator, and shall also pay a
eenversion fee in the amount set in t-he-sebedule of fees adopted by the city cetiacil by

resolution:

11



^ —— Two copies of an as-built plan for the entire structure.

(3)—A building code analysis prepared by a licensed architect or professional engineer

demonstrating that the structure conform-s-with the current building codes, or can

be brought inte conformaaee with the current building codes by planned

improvements to be made to the stmcturer

^ —Two copies of construction plans for planned improvements to be made to the

structure to bring the structure into conformance with the current building codes.

(e)—Upon receipt of the documents and the conversion fee as provided above, the permit and
development administrator or the administrator's designee shall review the building code

analysis and conduct such inspections of the struchire as may be deemed appropriate by

the-administrator to determine whether er not the stracture conforms with the requirements

of paragraph (a) above. If the permit and development center administrator or the
administrator's designee determines that the structure has been shown to be in substantial

compliance with the requirements of-paragraph (a) above, the administrator shall cause a
certificate of occupancy to be issued for the use of the structure as a horizontal property

regime or a multiple housing cooperative. If the structure has not been shown to be in

substantial compliance with the requirements of paragraph (a) above, the administrator

shall give written notice to the applicant of any violations of the applicable code
requirements discovered to exist in the building.

See. 26 30€^P®FmAfi^n4-eeeupa«^y-ef pubUe-pyeperty geaeraUy?

(a)—Ne-part of any structure or any appendage thereto, exeept signs, shall project beyond the

property line of the building site, except as specified in the building code; provided,
however, that a structure or appendage thereto may project beyond the property line of the

building site when the applicant holds a property interest, including but not limited to air
fights, within-the area of the projection suffiewat to establish a legal right to build therein
or thereon.

(b)—Structures or appendages regulated by this section shaU-be const?ete^-edteiaterials as

specified in the building code.
(e)—fhe projection of any structure or appendage shall be the-distance measured horizontally

from the property line to the outermost point of the projection.
(d)—Nothing m the-building code shall prohibit the eonstruction and use of a structure between

buildings and over or under a public way provided the structure complies with all

requirements of the building code.
(e)—No subsection of this section and ne provision of the Building Code shall be construed to

permit the violation of other laws or ordinances regulating the use and occupancy of the

public propertyr

See^6-30^-Shelterfoy-ti?*e»eles^

(a)—As-used in this section, the term "shelter for the homeless" means a building used to previde

primarily short term lodging, or short term lodging and meals, and which may also provide

other services, including counselmg, with or without compensation, to transient individuals

w4e individuals who have no access to traditional-er permanent housing. For purpeses-ef

12



this subsection, short term lodging shall include facilities offering lodging for 30 days or

(b)—Ne-building or portion thereof that is to be used as a shelter for the homeless shall be

occupied as such unless an inspection certificate for such use has been issued by the

bttildmg official or the neighborhood inspection zoning administrator. Such certificate

shall be valid for not more than one year from the date of issuance, and no new certificate

shall be issued until the premises have been reinspected for compliance with applicable

building code, zoning and fire safety requirements. No fee shall be charged for the annual

inspection or certificate of compliance issued under this subsection; provided, however,

that this fee exemption shall not apply to permit fees, when required.

(e)—Facilities which fell under federal, state or other local regulations which require annual
ffispections for building and health safety standards shall be exempted from this section.

See. 26-^08. —Adjusteaent of le^4ines-for building aad fire cede purposes.

(a)—Gembination of adjoining lots. — Adjoining lots, regardless of whether they are under

common ownership or control, may be treated as a single conselidated lot for the limited

purposes of this chapter and Chapter 4 6 when a declaration of covenants in a form approved

by the City legal department and signed by all owners of the included lots is recorded that
binds each of the included lots to the foUewing covenants:

(4-)—AU. existing and future buildings and stmctureo located upon the included lots and
any future alterations and additions thereto shall be considered part of a single

consolidated lot under common ownership for purposes of applying this chapter
and Chapter /\6. Any construction, alteration, addition or demolition of a building

en the included lots shall conform with the provisions of this chapter and Chapter
46 that are applicable to the included lots and each pertron thereof, as a building

tecated on-a single consolidated lot under common ownership. No new building
shall be constructed or placed on the included lots and no existing building on the

included lots shall be demolished, altered or expanded in a manner which weuV
cause another existing building on the included lots to come into violation of this

chapter or Gfeapter 46 when appUed-to all buildings on-the included lots that a^e
considered as a single consolidated lot under common ownership. Each owner of

any portion of the included lots shall maintain its portion of the mcluded lots in
good repair and in conformance with the applicable requirements of this chapter

and Chapter 46r
(3)—If any building on the included lots is affected by casualty loss, demolition,

deterioratien, neglect or any other event that causes the building official to

determine that some portion or portions of the buildings then existing upon the
ifieliide44ete-a¥e unsafe to occupy, the building official; in the proper performance
of the building officials duties may issue such orders as are reasonable and

necessary in accordance with the provisiefi-s-ef this chapter, Chapter 46 and

applicable law, treating all buildings on the included lots as located on a single
consolidated lot under common-ewnership.

^ —— All provisions of the declaration of covenants shall run with the land and shall be

binding upon the owners, and the owners' successers-aad-assigns, for the benefit of

the City, the owners, and the owners' successors and assigns. Each owner of any

13



portion of the included lots shall be given the benefit of the obligations under the
declaration of covenants imposed upon the owners of all other portions of the

included lots, and ffiay enforce such obligations by an action for specific

performance and/or damages.
(4)—The declaration of covenants shall not be amended or terminated without the

written approval of all owners of the included lots, and the prior written consent of

the building official. The building official is authorized to consent to any such
amendment or termination only if appropriate measures have been taken to the

reasonable satisfaction of the building official to remedy any violations of this
chapter and Chapter /16 that weuld otherwise exist upon such amendment or

termination.

(fe)—Use of artificial lot lines. The shared lot line between adjoining lots, regardless of whether
the lots are under common ownership or control, may be relocated within the area of the
combined lots, for the limited purposes of this chapter and Chapter 46 when an easement

er declaration of covenants in a form approved by the City legal department and signed by
all owners of the lots burdened by the artificial lot line is recorded that binds the owners of
each of the burdened lots to the following covenants:

(1-)—For the purposes of these covenants, the following terms shall be defined as

follows:
Q-. ——— A "burdened lot" is any lot which contains an artificial lot line which is

established across the interior ofthe4et for the benefit of the owners of an

adjoining lot.
b-. ——— A "benefitted lot" is any lot which is given the benefit of the use of an

artificial lot line located on an adjoining burdened lot.
e-. —— "Artificial lot line" is a line, the location of which is clearly identified, which

is located within the boundary of a burdened lot for the benefit of an

adjoining benefited lot, and shall serve as the shared lot line between the

burdened and benefitted lots for purposes of applying this chapter and
Chapter 46 to both lots. The location of a proposed ai-tifieiaUot line must

not create a violation of this chapter or Chapter 46, if treated as the shared

let line between the burdened and benefitted leter

(3)—All owners of each burdened lot agree that for the limited purpose of applying this
chapter and Chapter 46: i) the-artificial lot line shall serve as the shared lot line
between the burdened lot and the benefitted lot; ii) any construction, alteration,

addition or demolition of a building on the burdened lot shall conform with the
provisions of this chapter and Chapter 46 when using the artificial line as the shared
let line with the benefitted lot; and, any conQtruction, alteration, addition or

demolition of a building on the benefitted lot shall have the benefit of using the
artificial lot line as the shared lot line with the burdened lot.

(3)—All provisions of the easement or declaration of covenants shall run with the land

and shall be binding upea the owners of the burdened lot, and such owners'

successors and assigns, for the benefit of the City, the owners of the benefitted lot,

afid such owners' BuccessorB and assign&: —Each owner of any portion of the

benefitted lot shall be given the benefit of the obligations under the easement or
declaration of covenants imposed upon the owners of the burdened lot, and may

enforce such obligations by an action for specific performance.

14



(4)—r¥be easement or declaration of covenants shall not be amended or terminated

without the written approval of all owners of the benefitted lot, and the prior written

consent of the building official. The building official is authorized to consent to
any such amendment or termination only if appropriate measures have been takefi
to the reasonable satisfacti-eft-ef the building official to remedy any violations of

this chapter and Chapter 46 that would otherwise exist upon such amendment or

temiination.

Division 2. International Residential Gede

Se€r46-MO—Ge»wafc

The provisions of International Residential Code (IRC), 2015 edition are hereby amended as
follows:

t-. —Delete section R105.2

3-. —Delete section R105.5

3- Delete section R 112

See. 26-311. ExterioF-wdl fire pyeteetieflte

Delete Table 302.1(1) and insert in lieu thereof the following new table: Table 302.1
Table 302.1(1) Exterior Walls
Exterior Wall Element Mmimum —Fire Resistance Minimum —Fffe—Separation

Walls Fire resistance rated 1 hour tested in accordance

\vithASTME119 or UL2 63
with exposure from both sides

Net fire resistance rated
Not allowed

Projections Fire resistance rated 1 hour on the underside "^ ; 2 feet to < A feet

Mot fire resistance rated
Not allowed

Openmgs in walls 25% maximum of wall 3 feet

Unlimited

Penetrations AU Comply with Section R302A

None required

(a)—Roofeave fire resistaHce rating shall be reduced te 0 hours on the underside of the eave if

fireblocldng is provided from the wall top plate to the underside of the roof sheathing.
(b)—Roofeave fire resistaiice rating shall be permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on the underside

ef-the eave provided that gable vent openings are not installed.

Sec. 26.312. Repeated-by^-d^e^45,5^

See. 26-313. Egress-window-^sill height

Section R310.2.2 is amended by-adding the following exeeptieer

15



Exception: A landing may be provided to meet the maximum sill height of forty foui-(44)
inches above the floor or landing provided. The landing shall be not less than thirty six
(36) inches wide, not less than twelve (12) inches out frem the exterior wall, and not more

than twenty four (24) inches in height. The landing shall be permanently affixed to the
floor below or the walkmder the window it serves.

Sec. 26-M4^8«thyee»-veatitettefc

Delete section R303.3 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

R303.3 Bathrooms. Bathrooms, water closet compartments and similar rooms shall be

provided with natural or artificial light and be provided with a mechanical ventilation
system. The minimum ventilation rates shall be 50 cubic feet per minute (2/1 L/s) for
intermittent ventilation or 20 cubic feet per minute (lOL/s) for continuous ventilation.

Ventilation air from the space shall be exhausted directly to the outsider

Sefc-^6-315. StaiH-isei-s.

Section R311.7.5.1 is amended by adding the follcwmg-exeeption.

Exception: 3. The dimension of the top and bottom riser may vary up to 1 inch (25.4 mm)

from the stairway riser dimension. In no case shall the riser height exceed the maximum

height of 7 3AI inches.

See 26-M6. Handrail-eoffti&tHty;

Section R311.7.8.2 is amended by adding the following exception:

3i-. —Handrails shall be-permitted to be interrupted at ofte4ocation-in a straight stair whefi

the rail terminates into a wall or ledge and is offset and immediately continues.

See. 26-317. Automatte-fiye-spritrideF^systcms.

(a)—Delete section R313.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 313.1

Townhomes automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkler

system shall be installed in townkeuscs.

Exceptioa&T

(1)—An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required where

additions or alterations are made to existing townhouscs that do not have an

automatic residential fire sprinkler system installedr

(3)—Townhouse structures that-eentain eight (8) or less dwelling units.
(3-)—Townhouse structures less than eighteen thousand (18,000) square feet floor

space, exclusive of any garages.

(b)—Delete section R313.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

16



R313.2 One and two family dwelling automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic

residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one and two -family dwellings that
contain 8,000 square feet or more floor space, excluding attached garages and other

unenclosed areasr

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required where

additions or alterations are made to existing buildings that are not already provided with

an automatic residential fire sprinkler system.

See. 26-31&.-FoetingiS-fbr accessory struetiK'es?

Amend section R^103.1./l.l by deleting all existing exceptions and inserting in lieu thereof

the following: Exceptron 1. The building official may approve the omission of frost footings under

a one story wood or metal frame building not exceeding 1000 square feet in area used exclusively

for accessory structures in the IRC. Any foundation system shall, however, provide the same

approximate uniform frost protection.

See. 26 319. Altematc design for fouadation afid^t'etainmg waUfc

(a)—Insert the following new section: R/104.1.1.1 Alternate Design for Foundation and

Retaining Wall&r
(4^ —— Scope. Foundation retaining walls for One and Two Family Dwelling occupancies

ef type V construction may-be constmcted in accordance with this section, provided

that use or building site conditions affecting such walls are within the limitations
specified in this section.

(3)—Specifications. General specifications for such foundation retaining walls shall be

as^bllows:
Sb -—— The maximum height of the foundation wall shall be seven feet eight inches

measured between the foimdation plate afid a cencrete floor slab haviftg-a
minimum thickness of 31/2 inches. If such floor slab is not provided, a

specially designed means-e^-providing lateral supperi; at the bottom-ef-Ae

wall shall be required.
b-. ——— The foundation plate shall be attached to the wall with one half inch steel

bolts as prescribed in of the International Residential code.

e-. ——— Material used fer backfilling shall be carefully placed gmnular soil of

average or high permeability and shall be drained with an approved drainage
system. The height of finish grade requirements of Section R40/1.1.6 of the
International Residential code shall be observed at all times.

4-. ——— Where soils containing a high percentage of clay, fine silt or similar
materials of low permeability or expansive soils are encountered or where

bacldlll materials are not drained or an unusually high surcharge is to be

placed adjacent to the wall, a specially designed wall shall be required.

(5)—Hollow coiicrctc masonry foundation walls. Specifications for hollow concrete
masonry foundation walls shall be as follow&r
Or. ——— Hollow concrete masonry units shall be set in type M or type S mertapr

17



b-. ——— All footings shall be of cast in place concrete having a minimum

compressive strength of 3,000 pounds per square inch at 28 days, and shall
be reinforced longitudinally with not less than No 4 steel rebar deformed
AST1VI A615 grade •/10 for one story construction, or two No i\ steel rebars

deformed ASTM A615 grade /10 for two story construction. Footing

reinforcement shall be symmetrically placed and so located as to ensure no
less than three inches of concrete cover on all sides.

e^—Foundation walls having a nominal thickness of not less than 12 inches may

be unreinforced. Other foundatiofi-wralls shall comply with the following

requirements:

i-. ——— The nominal thickness of concrete masom'y units shall not be less

than eight inches.

3r. —— When a foundation wall has a horizontal clear span of more than 12

feet between supporting cross walls or comers, fully granted vertical
reinforcing shall be provided in the center of such wall in the amount

ef 0.075 square inch ofASTM A615 grade 40 steel per lineal foot
of wall. All reinforcing steel shall be deformed bars spaced no more

than eight feet zero inches on center. All grout shall comply with

section R606 of the International Residential code.

4-. —Cast-in-placc plain concrete foundation walls. Cast in place plain concrete

foundation walls constructed under this subsectiofi shall be of concrete

having a minimum compressive strength in 28 days of not less than 3,000

pounds per square inch. All materials, proportioning, and placing shall
conform to the requirements of chapter 4 of the International Residential

Code. In addition:

i-. —— The minimum thickness of wall shall be 7 1/2 inches.

2-. ——— Walls shall be reinforced with no less than three one half inch

diameter deformed ASTM A615 grade 40 steel bars placed
horizontally at the center of the wall, with one bar located near the

top, one bar located near the bottom, and one bar located near mid

height of the wall. Reinforcing bars and methods-ef placement shall
be in accordance with chapter 16 or 19 of the building code.

Sec. 26-320. Fouttdfftte»s-f8i'-sted-b caring waUs?

Amend section R403.1.1, Minimum width, by addifig a new sentence following this

section: The minimum width for all footings shall be 16 inches.

Seer-26-321. Ice daai-pFeteetiefe

Amend section R905.1.2 by adding the following exceptions:-

Exceptions:

(4-)—Detached-aecessory Gtmctures not cont-aining conditioned floor area.

(3)—The building is constructed with the following components:
&-. —— A raised heel tmss or similar design, and

18



b-. ——— A minimum of R 3-8-attic insulation exteflds across the top plate to a poirrt

aligning with the exterior sheathing, and
e,—The plans for the alternative design described in this section are submitted

and approved at the time the building permit is issued.

See. 26 322. Due^-msteUatiea.

(a)—Delete section M1601.4 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: M1601.4
Installation. Duct installation shall comply with Sections M4-601.4.1 tbrough M4601.4.11-7

(fe)—Insert the following new section: M1601.4.11. Air plenum and duct separation. Air
plenums and ducts located in the floor- and wall cavities shall be separated from

unconditioned spaces by construction with sufficient insulation to meet energy code

requirements. The areas include but are not limited to exterior walls, cantilevered floors,

and floors above garages.

Sec. 26 323 324. ReswveA

Division 3. International Building Code

See. 26 325. General.

The provisions of the International Building-Code (IBC), 2015 edition, are amended with
the revision of the following text as stated:

(^—Delete section 105.2.
<3)—Delete section 105.5.

^) — Delete section 110.3.5.
<4)—Delete section 113.

See 26 Sl^T-Day-eftfe-eeeupafteies?

(a)—Delete section 303.6.^1-and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 308.6./1 Eight

er fewer persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above withifi-a

dwelling unit and having eight or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified

as a Group R 3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code.
(b)—Delete section 310.5 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 310.5 Residential

Group R 3-. — Residential Group R 3 occupancies where the occupants are primarily

permanent in nature and not classified as Group R 1, R 2, R A or I, including:

Buildings that do not contain more than two dwelling units.

Boarding houses (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants.
Soarding houses (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants.
Care facilities as identified in Sections 308.3.1 —or 308.4.2 that provide

accommodations for five or fewer persons receiving care.
Day care facilities as identified in section 308.6r44ocated within single family

dwellings with 8 or fewer persons receiving custodial care.

19



CD
(p

os

t̂f

tin

?t?
t4-

(8

to
0

(^
tk>

^

t-frt

t-B

^

(̂16

to

tt~<
-t-1

crt
rt+?

ITt$
OP

(t-
j^

(D

ite'

h>

-1-1 ^

-$
ft

<t
ft

^3

4!
-$
ft 1^

^-

CP
tfi
<t>
(p
>+l

^6
y*
<t)

(t>
®

4:
<R
<t

!¥

<t>

<s

S
(t>

tfe'
(ID

'̂-I"

(̂t>

tp
a-

<s
(h

(10
®
®
EJS

*?

^

^

I

I

t
(jc
(t)
f-H-

$
^

t3

CD

afe

<D
(6

^ ^
!&-°*~

»5 ^)

!PS

<£
tt>

^

i



See. 26 329^GTOiffid-Snew^eaA

Delete subsection 1608.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

1608.2 Ground Sfiow Load. The ground snow load to be used in determining the design

snow load for roofs is hereby established at 30 pounds per square foot. Subsequent
increases or decreases shall be allowed as otherwise previded in the building code or ASCE
?-40T

Sefc-S6-330. Pcaetertiofis-efA-c ratcd-waU^wtth-eoiliftg-everiiead-fiFe-doei-s?

Add the following new section: 71'1.3.1.3. Penetrations for the operation of rolling fire

doors. One open ended 1/4" electrical metallic tubing (EMT) conduit shall be allowed for each

rolling overhead fire door to allow the installation of fusible link4iardware. The conduit shall be
fire stopped where penetrating the walHfi accordance with section 714,, but the ends shall remain

open to allow proper function of the fusible link.

Sec. 26-331. FH'e-spwHldey-risey-FeeiH^equircmcB-tfc

Add the following new section: 901.9 Fire Sprinkler Riser Room. A fire sprinkler riser
room shall be separated from the electrical room. The riser room shall have no electrical panels,

devices, er apparatus inside the room other than the outlets or support equipment (lighting, air

eempressor, and heater) required for the use of the fire sprinkler system and/or the fire alarm panel.
The sprinkler riser room shall not be accessed from the electrical room, but the electrical room

may be accessed from the fire riser room.

Sec 26-332. Basemeat-spriaklcr rcquife»eHte^

Delete section 903.2.11.1.3 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

903.2,11.1.3 Basements. Where any portion of a basement is located-^ae^e than 75 feet (22 860

mm) from openings required by Section 903.2.11.1, the basement shall be equipped throughout
I»-iytT-</^ii<<?/~7 /^-t /^/"t-i/t/t/^^-f*/^ nTtT/'-/7/iZr7/^-»/< n-i 10 •/•/->

Seer-26-333. Fire-sprifildey-alftyta-exterie^-signatei

Delete section 903.1.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 903.4r3

Alarms. An approved weather proof audible device stiitablc for outdoor use with 110 candela

visual signal shall be connected to every automatic sprinkler system. Such sprinkler water flow
alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the
smallest orifice size installed in the system. Alarm devices shall be pfovided on the exterior of the

building in an approved location. Wheve a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic

sprinkler systcni-shall actuate the building fire alarm system.

21



See. 26 334,-Stendpipe reqiHpemeBte-^or large-wea-bwldiHgfc

Insert the following new section-905.3.9 Building Footprint and Access. Where the-^eest

remote portion of a floor or stoiy is more than /100-feet from a hose connection or fire department

aecess road the fire code official is authorized to require standpipes to be provided in approved

locations. Class I manual standpipes shall be allowed.

See. 26-335^-FiFe-alwm-eofitfel-paaete^

Insert the following new section: 907.1.4 Fire Alarm Control Panels (FACP). Each building
shall have no more than one Fire Alarm Control Panel. Installation of fire alarm control panel shall

not exceed six feet in height measured from the floor to the top of the control panel.

Exception: Suppression system releasing panels are not required to meet the height

requirement or the limitation in the number of panels.

See. 26-336-Fiye-ftlarm systeffl^»efitteriBgT

Delete section 907.6.6 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 907.6.6

Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the International Fire Code shall be
monitored by a central station approved and listed under UL 827 in accordance with NFPA 72.

Exception: Monitoring is not required for automatic sprinkler aad fire alarm systems m

one and two family dwellings.

Sec. 26-337. Smoke-att4-hea^E€fite

Delete section 910.2.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 910.2.1 Group

F -1 orS 1. Smoke and heat vents installed in accordance with Section 910.3 or a mechanical smoke

removal system installed in accordance with Section 910.4 shall be installed in buildings and

portions thereof used as a Group F 1 or S 1 occupancy having more than 30,000 square feet (2787

ffl3)-ofundmded area. In occupied portions of a building equipped throughout with an automatic

sprinkler system in accordance with 903.3.1.1, where the upper surface of the story is^ot a roof
assembly, a mechanical smoke removal system in accordance with Section 910.4 shall be installed.

Exception: Group S 1 aircraft repair hangers.

See. 26-338. Emesygency-pwvw-ahifiHBatiwk

(a)—Delete sectien 1008.3.1 and insert in lieu thereof the follewing new section: 1008.3.1-

General. In the event of the power supply failure in rooms and spaces 400 square feet OF

greater an emergeney electrical system shall automatically ilteuaate all of the followmg

{^—Aisks.
^ —— Corridors.

(5-)—Exit access stairways aad ramps.

22



(b)—Delete section 1008.3.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 1008.3.2

Buildings. In the event of the power supply failure in rooms and spaces /100 square-fee^er

greater an emergency electrical system shall automatically iUuminate all o^4he following

(4-) —— Interier exit access stairways and ramps-.

(3)—Interior and exterior exit stairways and ramps.

(3-)—Exit Passages ays.
(4)—Vestibules and areas on the level of exit dischaFgc used for exit discharge in

accordance with Section 1028. L

{§)—Exterior landings as required by Section 1010.1.6 for exit doorways that lead

dffectly to the exit discharge.

Seer-36-339. AeeessiMe^aea»s-e^egi'ess-ee»»penentfc

Section 1009.2 is amended by adding the following to the list of accessible components.

11. Components of exterior walking surfaces shall be concrete, asphalt, or other approved hard

surface.

Sefc-26-S4A.-fcafidi»g*est-p¥ote€tieni

Insert the following new section: 1010.1.6.1 Landing Frost Protection. For landings

required by Section 1010.1.5 to be at the same elevation on each side of the door, exterior landings

at doors shall be provided with frost proteetionT

See^6-34UBa^igas.

(a)—Insert the following new section: 1013.1.1 Additional exit signs. Exit signs may be required

at the discretion of the building official to clarify an exit or exit access.
(b)—Delete section 1013.3 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 1013.3 Exit sign

illumination. Exit signs shall use a Light Emitting Diode (LED) lighting system and be
illuminated internally. Exit signs are required to have battery backup unless an onsite

generator-is used. Lumnance OH-fee face efan exit sign shall have an intensity of not less
than 5 foot-candles (53.82 lux). Exception: Tactile signs required by Section 1013.4 need

Htet-be provided with illumination.

(e)—Delete section 1013.5.
(d)—Delete section 1013.6, including Gections 1013.6.1, 1013.6.2, and 1013.6^

Sec. 26-342. Exit dfeebwgc surfeeesr

Insert the following new section: 1028.5.1. Exterior walking surfaces. Coffiponents of

exterior walking surfaces shall be concrete, asphalt, or other approved hard surfaces.

See. 26-343. Wiadew-weU-drauiage.

Insert the following new section: 1030.5.3 Window well drainage. All window wells shall

be provided with approved drainage.

23



Seer46-344r-^entilatien.

Delete section 1203-.-1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 1203.1 General.

Buildings shall be provided with mechanical ventilation in accordance with the State Mechanical
€ede. Where the air infiltratiefi rate in a dwelling unit is less than 5 air changes per hour when

tested with a blower door at a pressure 0.2 inch w.c. in accordance with Section R/102.1.1.2 of the
International Energy Conservation Code —Residential Provisions, the dwelling unit shall be

ventilated by mechanical means in accordance with section 103 of the State Mechanical Code.

Ambulatory care facilities and Group 1-2 occupancies shall be ventilated by mechanical means in

accordance with 407 of the State Mechanical Code.

Division 4. International Existing Butkiing Code

Sefc36-345. GcncraUyr

The provisions of Internat-ieaal Existing Building Code (IEBC), 2015 edition-are hereby
amended as follows:

^ — Delete section 103.

<3)—Delete section 105.2.

(3)—Delete section 105.5.

(4^—Delete section 109.3.5.
(5)—Delete section 112.

(6)—Delete Gection 115.

Division 5. Swimming Pools

See. 26-346. Adoptiea-ef-Swim»Hag-poeI-eedei

The provisions of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2015 edition, published
by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue NW, 6th-Heer, Washington, D.Gr

20001 are hereby adopted by reference and subject to the additions, deletions, and modifications

hereinafter regulating the design, construction, alteration, movement, reHovation, replacement?

repair and maintenance of swimming pools, spas, hot tubs, aquatic facilities and related equipment
in the Gity ofDes Momesr

Note: The Iowa Department of Public Health regulates swimming pools, spas, wading pools, water

slides, wave pools, spray pads, and bathhouses connected to swimming pools owned or operated
by local or state government, or commercial interests or private entities including, but not limited

to, public or private school corporations, hotels, motels, camps, apartments, condominiums, health
clubs, and country clubs. Please see https://idpliTiewa.gov/swimn"iingpool5andspas for further

details.

24



See. 26 347. Betetiom.

:Fhe following are deleted from the swimming pool code and are of no force or effect in this

(4-)—Delete section 105.

(3)—Delete section 1067
(^—Delete section 107.
<4)—Delete section 108.

(5)—Delete the last sentence in section 301.1.

(6)—Delete sectiono 302 through 30^1, 305.5, and 306 through 323.
^ —Delete Chapter 4.

^—Delete Chapter 5.

(9)—Delete Chapter 6r
(4^)—Delete Chapter 7.
<44-)—Delete Chapter 8r

(13)—Delete Chapter 9r
(^)—eelete-Chapter 10.

See-26-348.-z^»ett4flftefiteT

(a)—The remaining sections in this article are and represent amendments and additions to the

requirements contained in the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code (ISPSC) and
where their requirements conflict with those of the ISPSC the requirements of this article

shall prevail.
(b)—The following sections of this article shall be construed in the context of the enumerated

chapter of the ISPSC.

SeeT46-349^efim4ie»s.

-fe&ert-a new definition in Chapter 2, "Swimming pool" is defined as any structure intended

for swimming or recreational bathing capable ofcentaining water more than 24 inches deep. This

includes in-grouad, abeve ground, and oa-ground Gwiffltfflmg pools, hot tubs, and spa&r

Division 6. Skywalk System

Seer^-SSOr-Seepe-of-Bmsiett;

Notwithstanding anything contained in this chapter and chapter 46 of the Municipal Code,
the provisions of this division also shall be part of the building code and fire prevention code
requirements for the skywalk system and shall take precedeece over anything in conflict with this

division.

Sec. 26 351. Dcfmitiettfc

The definitions for the terms "skywalk system," "skywalk corridor," and "skywalk bridge"

as used in this divisiefi shall be the same as in-article IV of chapter 102 of the city Center

25



to
a\

4?-
^s

(10
CD
^

(tt)

^ 1 ^

c4- (

ati

^1-

tij 3
<y\

fl^
'r|j

A
^^
d;"
(t>

I

ycjr^i
$

^

<̂1B

ĈP

(̂p
<t>

yi rt^ rti
ctr'

0(1
CE
d;
ft>
(4-

$-

V-
<ti"
(ID

crt)
V-

(p
ffi
1}^
$*l

Cjfc*
(Jft
yn

'^
lf>

(p
-s
%.

^
ft
?^

0
(jl.

c4-
I"
fft)

tt-> St:

ffft

Eg
ys

(rt)

$- ^

^ s
oft

t
t-^

^ ^
<t> 9S
^ih

t ^

it" ff)

.^-
' (p

%
a?

I
!fr-

<1 tt)

K
(0
(D
$

ti

oft

w

(rfc

at?

at

^ .^

' #

Ri

$ tS $

CD
^

$•&

S-'O^l

^ ^ ifb ^

41-
.ff
tt5.'

as ^ "£

d

©tp

TH
fp.

Ch
CD do
®
{^
(10

±1
$' ^-?

N^o<

^w
CD

fffr

•^

fffe

^- rL ^. & 37- ^-

(b
4i- ^

^ f

(T> crt?

fffe
9^
<D
1-

<D
^

>4i
(D

$
do
^I

CK

fffr

a;

ân
crt?

' (6
$
<c
Et)

^' I I ^
rfS S-

^
^
I-

Cf^

?F
D?

^-
EC

!?
<p

(^

^ s' ^

?(3

<p

^ ^

id

¥• ^

®̂

tjd

(t^-s

db ^
<t>
4^
(6

ati
t
$

I

0^

^
i-1

yi
?
TO
tp
^
Ôft

t^

(t>
4>
ri-f.
^
?
rt^H-*

ft

$

ffft

^^
(t>
s>

fffr

I ^-^

^^
w
(D
y
Ctl

fll
FP

4^

t U
d^ Jt

n^
^N

>rb ±-

ft
-"hd$

<I>
w(p
(Ti

fr
(8>

crft
^

$
ct>
sfr-
(16

(Tl
®

B £

f̂li
(p

tp-ffti

J-< ff
y.

V̂.

-I

^1
tp.cp

CD
>ft>

3h (Q
^

0->
tp

sfe
$
^
do
ffi
(fr.

(rfc

Vl
ffi
fli

^̂
(}k»
1'Jft
fr>

dc
4!

I*
»t»-
<s

Ĥ^
Ml*
as



See. 26 3567-A!eteeVofi-^f-opetHHgs-ento4he-sfcywalk-system^wM€h-^^

of property liae?

Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in the International Building Code,
openings o»to the skywaUc system which are located within 25 feet of the property line shall be
protected as follows:

<4-)—If two buildings are joined by a skywalk corridor constructed between such

buildings:L6^

Q-. ——— The centerline of the Gkywalk corridor easement shall be deemed the

property line, and no opening shall be permitted in any wall of such skywalk
corridor which is less than seven feet from the property line;

b-. ——— Such skywalk corridor shall be protected by an approved automatie

sprinkler system;
G-. ——— Any wall of the skywalk corridor which is less than seven feet from the

adjacent property liae shall be of at least two hour fire resistive

construction; and
4-. —— Any openings in the skywalk corridor walls shall be either:

i-. ——— Of approved opening protective set in metal frames in accordance

with the International Building Code, provided a draft curtain of at
least one hour fire resistive construction and not less than 12 inches

in height shall be provided to protect the skywalk corridor from the
adjacent building area, which draft curtain shall be located above the
glass and ex-tend a minimum of 12 inches below the lowest finished

ceiling of either such adjacent building area or the skywalk corridor,

or, if the fmished ceiling is not a fire rated assembly, the draft

eurtain shall extend from the opening protective to a rated ceiling or

floor assembly; of
'3-. —— Protected in the following manner:

k —The adjacent building area onto whicb-syeh opening occurs

is protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system;
»-. -—— A draft curtain of at least one hour fire resiotive coHstmction

and not less than 12 inches in height and including an
approved water curtain of sprinkler heads six feet on center

immediately adjacent to such draft curtain and above the

opening within the building arca shall be provided to protect
the skywalk corridor from the adjacent building area, which
draft curtain shall be located above the opening and shall
extend a minimum of 12 inches below the lowest finished

ceiling area of either such adjacent building area or the

skywalk corridor or, if such finished ceiling is not a fire
rated assembly, the draft curtain shall extend from the

opening to a rated ceiling or floor assembly; and

w-. ——— Either (i) the ceiling, walls and floor of the adjacent building

area onto which such opening occurs shall be separated from

the rest of such building by at least two hour fire resistive
construction and all duct penetrations in such building area

27



shall be protected with fire dampers in accordance the

International Building Code, or (ii) the entire story is
protected by an approved automatic sprinkler.

(3)—If a skywalk corridor is constmcted exterior to and attached to any one building,

but is not between two or mere buildings, and such-skywalk corridor extends over-

the adjacent property line related to such building:
Q-. ——— The centerline of the skywalk corridor easement shall be deemed the

property line, and no opening shall be permitted in any wall of such skywalk
corridor which is less than seven feet from the property line; and

b-. —— i-. ——— If the adjacent building is protected or is required to be protected by

an appreved automatic sprinkler system, such skywalk corridor shall

be protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system; or
Or. ——— If the adjacent building dees not have and is not required to be

protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system, such skywalk

eerridor aeed not be provided with an approved automatic sprinkler

system at the time of construction, provided that the property owners
and/or lessees who are responsible for such skywalk comde^-tiBdef

a skywalk agreement with the city shall also agree in such skywalk

agreement to provide an approved automatic sprinkler system if a
second building is constructed within ten feet of such skywalk

corridor; and
e,—Any wall of the skywalk corridor which is less than seven feet from the

adjacent property line shall be of at least two hour fire resistive

eonstruction;

4-. ——— Any openings from such skywalk corridor into the adjacent building shall

be in accordance with subsection (l)d of this section; and
e-. ——— Any windows in the wall of such skywalk corridor opposite the building to

which it is adjacent either:
i-. ——— Shall be of approved opening protective set in metal frames in

accordance with section 716 of the International Building Code; or

3r. —— May be of other glass, provided thafr-tfee property owne?&-afid/ef
lessees who are responsible for such skywalk corridor under a

skywalk agreement with the city shall also agree in such skywalk
agreement to:

^—Replace such glass with approved opening pretective set in
metal frames in accordance with the International Building

Code if any building subsequeatfy-is constructed which is

within ten feet, but not attached to, such skywalk corrider

wall; and
»r. —— Pay the equivalent of the cost of providing such approved

opening protective towards the cost of reconstructing all
openings in such skywalk corridor wall in accordance with

subsection (l)d of this section if any building subsequently
is constructed which is attached to such skywalk corridor

(^)—Two buildings may be joined by a wall opening, provided:

28



rfc—The wall opening shall be protected by a fire assembly having at least a 1

1/2-hour fire protection rating; or
b-. —— The wall opening may be unprotected if the entire building on both sides-ef

wall opening are protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system; and
e^—In either case, there is a draft cui-tam of at least two hour fire resistive

construction and not less than 12 inches in height, which draft curtain shall

be located above the opening and shall extend a minimum of 12 inches

below the lowest finished ceiling on either side of the wall opening, or, if
the-fettshed ceiling is not a fire rated assembly on either side, the draft

curtain shall extend from the opening to a rated ceiling or floor assembly on

such side of the opening.

(A) —— If two buildings are comiected by a skywalk bridge:
Q-. ——— If such skywalk bridge is not conn.ected to a skywalk corridor which is

exterior to any building to which such skywalk bridge is connected, it shall
be sufficient if the opening at one end of such skywalk bridge is proteeted
by approved fire assemblies having at least a 1 1/2 hour fire protection

mting with gasketed frames, and the remaining construction-where such end

of the skywalk bridge penetrates the adjacent building is of at least two-how
fire rating construction; or

b-. ——— If such skywalk bridge is connected to a skywalk corridor which is exterior

to any building to which such skywalk bridge is connected, all openings
from such skywalk bridge into the adjacent buildings shall conform to the
requirements ofs-ubsection (1) of this sectiofir

Division 7. Plumbing Fixture Count,•&
•y

Sefc~36-3WrPhHHbing-Syste»s-Seep^

-Delete section 2901.1 of the 2015 iHternational-Building Code and insert in lieu thereeftbe

following new section:

S901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the State Plumbing Code as

adopted by Sec. 26 601 and the State Plumbing and Mechani&al Systems Board
shall govern the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement,
addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems. Toilet and
bathing rooms shall be constructed in accordance with Section 1210. Plumbing

systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed and maintained in accordance

with the State Plumbing Code.

See^3€ 371. Scpayatc Facilittefc

Delete section 2902.2 of the 2015 International Building Code and insert in lieu thereof the
following new section:

QQ02.2 Separate Facilities. Separate toilet fecilities shall be provided for each sexr

29



Exceptions:

<4-)—Residential installations.

(3)—In occupancies with a total occupant load of 10 or less, including

customers and employees, one toilet facility, designed for use by no

fflore than one person at a time, shall be permitted for use by both

(^—far business and mercantile occupancies with a total occupant load

of 50 or less including customers and employees, one toilet facility,

designed for use by no more than one person at a time, shall be

permitted for use by both sexes.

See. 26-372. Drittlemg Fomrtaias-fw-SfflaU-Oeettpaaeies

Delete section 2902.6 of the 2015 International Building Code and insert in lieu thereof
the following new section:

2902.6 Small Occupancies. Drinking fountains shall not be required for an

occupant load of 30 or less.

See. 26-373. DriftlaBg-Fettatain-Altet'»atives

Insert the following new section 2902.7 to the 2015 International Building Coder

2902.7 Drinking Fountain Alternatives. Where food is consumed indoors, water

stations shall be permitted to be substituted for drinking fountains. Bottle filling
stations shall be permitted to be substituted for drinking fountains up to 50 percent
of the requirements for drinking fountains.

III.

Division. ]. Generally

See. 26-300. Adoption oflnternatioaal C-odes.

ia^__^^^^^^^^ the International Building Code, 2018 edition, published by the

International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue NW, 6th Floor, Washington, D.C.,

20001 are hereby adopted by reference and subject to the additions, deletions and

modifications hereinafter stated as the general requirements for_^

construction in the City ofDes Moines.
{b)_ The provisions of the International Residential Code, 2018 edition published by the

International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue NW, 6 Floor, Washington,D.C,,
20001, except for Part VI -Fuel Gas, Part VII - Plumbing and Part Ym-mectric^^and

with the_adoEtion of appendices G, H, J, K, and M, are hereby adopted by reference, and

subiect to the additions, deletions and modifications hereinafter stated as the general

rcguirements for construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair,

30



eciuj]3ment_use and occupancy, location, removal, and demolition of detached one-and

two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not m_ore_than
three stories in height with a separate means ofegress and their accessory structures in the

City ofDesMoines.
(c) TheproYisionsofthe International Existing Building Code, 2018 edition, published by the

International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue. NW, 6th Floor, Washington, D.C.

20001 are hereby adopted by reference and subject to the additions, deletions_and

modifications hereinafter regulating the repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition
and relocation of existing buildings, mdudmghjstQric buildings, in the City ol'Des Momes^

(d) This _article_and all provisions incorporated in this article, by reference or otherwise, shall

b^Jmown as the building code. References to section numbers not preceded by 26- will
be to sections in the International Building Code (IBC), the International Existing Building

Code (IEBC) or the International Residential CodelIRC),
All references to the International Plumbing Code found within the IRC, IBC.^ andJEBC{el

m_

shall be interpreted to refer to the corresponding provision in the State Plumbing_Code^

_The following climatic and geographic design criteria shall be applied in the afiElication_of

the International Residential Code to structures in the City ot'Des Moines.

Ground

Snow
Load

30 psl'

Wind

Spee
d

115
mjA

Wind
Design

Toposraphic
effects

None

Special

wind
resion

No

Wind-

borne

debris

zone

No

Seismic
Design

Category

SySuect.J'o.Dam'tge^rom:

Weatherina

Severe

Frost

Line

Eeelh

42"

Termite

Moderate
to Heavv

Decay

Slight to
Moderate

Winter
Design

Temp

0°F

Ice Shield
Underlavmen

Required

Yes

Flood
Hazard

MaM984

Air

Freezins
Index

1833

Mean

Annual

Temfieratyre

4S.6°F

Elevation

965'

Cooling
Temperatur

e

Difference

Latitud
e

42°

Wind
Velocitv
Heatina

Winter

Heatin

g

-?°

Wind
Velocity
cooling

Manua

Summer

Cooling

90°

Coinciden
t wet bulb

75"

i J Design Criteria

Altitude
correctio

n factor

1.0

Daily
Range

M

Indoor

Design

Temperatiir

e

70°

Winter
humidity

Design
Temperatur

e Cooling

75°
Summer

huiniditv

Heating

tem.£eratur

e

difference

31



See. 26^

{a) Building permits are required as identified in IBC chapter 1, part 2; IRC chapter 1, part_2^

and lEBCChaEter 1, part 2,
(b) A fee for each building permit shall be paid to the building official in the amount set in the

Schedule of Fees adopted by the city council by resolution. The fee for a genmtjo

construct only a foundation for a future, building shalLte^^^^^ percent of the fee specified

in the Schedule of Fees, with the value of the foundation for such purpose bejng ten percent

of the total valuation of the future building and foundation^

Sec. 26-302. Building exemptions.

(a) A building permit shall not be required for the following:

{1) One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool or storage sheds, playhouses,
oet shelters, and similar uses constructed in accordance with the International

Residential Code, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square. feet in area

and complies with all applicable zoning requirements. Such building must be

located at least two feet from any proEertyjmeaiTd three feet from any dwelling^
(2) Chain link or wire fences four feetorjess in height and all other fences three feet

or less in height.
Movable cases, counters, and partitions not over five^ feet nine inches in height

Playground equipment.

Retaining walls, which are not over four feet in height, measured from.the _bottom

ofthe_footing to the tQsoithe_w^_w^^ supporting a surcharge or impounding

flammable liquids.

{6) Retaining walls which are part of a public, improvement project regulatedjn_the

City Engineer.

(7) Tanks supported directly upon_grad^^^^^^^ does not exceed 5,000_gaUons

andthejatioofhe^^^^^^^^ or width does not exceed two to one.

(8) Platforms, walks, and driveways not more than 30 inches above grade and not over

any basement or story below.

(9) Painting, papering, and similar finjsh work,

(10) Temporarv motion pictw'^tGlevMQIi and theater stage sets and scenery,
('11) Window awnings sii2EOrted_bv an exterior wall of one and two family dwellings

and_accessory structures to one and two family dwellings when projecting not more

than 54 inches.
(12) Minor maintenance and repair work thatjs_deemed by the building official not to

affect structural stten^.saf^^&eTesjsiaiicG, or sanitation, provided that no such
•work_sha]l be peTformedJn_ajilianner contrary to any provisions of the building

code or any other laws.

j 13) Installation, alteration or repair of generation, transmission, distribution or metering

or other related equipment th^^^^^^ and control of public service

agencies by established right,

(l^)^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ ^ plumbing, electrical and mechanical permits willjbe

reguired when appropriate for the exempted items in subsection (a) of this sectjoiL

32



{c)___^xem]3tion from the permit requirements of this section shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in any manner in Yiolatio^^^ of the

building code or any other laws or ordmaricesofihis^^^^^

Sec. 26-303. of buiIdingsAnilAtluctuj^^

(a) Permit required; expiration. A permit shall be required for dem_o]rtioii_o£j3uildm2^_^^

structures in accordance with the follQwing:

{JJ___J'.foj)erson_shall commence the. work of demolishing any building or structure until

a permit mihQnzmgsud'i_\WTk has been obtained from the building official. Every

demolition permk issued under the provisions of this section shall expire by

limitation and become null and void if the work authorized by such permit is not

commenced within thirty (30).calendar _daYS_from the date of issuance, or if the
work authorized bv suchj3ermMs_not completed within ninety (90) calendar days

of the date of issuance, unless, because of the extensiveness of the_proiect,_^

building official deems at the time of issuance a longer^ penod_forN
commencement or completion should be granted.

(31__AliI_E£t™ittee may request in writing an extension of time within which the
demolition work may be commenced or completed. If such request contains good

and satisfactory reasons showing that circumstances beyond the _ control _of_the

penTiittee_h^^ timely commencement or completion of the work, the

building official may extend the applicable exRiration_date^

(b) Application for permit. Application for a permit to demolish a building or stmctyre_shall

be made to the building officiaj^^^^^T^^^^ the following information:
(I) The name^ and_address_of the person in responsible charge of the work.

(2)__^^^^^^^^^^ and legal description of the property on which the building or

structure is located.

(3) The name and address of the owner and, when appropriate, his or her legal agentjn

responsible charge of the property.

(4) Overall dimensions, number of stories and materials of construction of the building

or structure to be demolished.

plan showing areas to be protected, by Jences,_b^^^^^ walkways, or

other protective devices, and details^ for such devices.

(6) Location of the site where the demolition debris is to be discarded,

(7) Approyal jrom_oth^ city departments or governmental age.ncjes__when

deemed necessary by the building official and any special conditions or restrictions

relating thereto.

(8) For demolition by ex]^osiyes^thG_aBBlJ£^ shall furnish the. information required

in this subsection and shall furnish information regarding the person whQ_w^^^^^^^

condyctii^^^ and shall furnish plans showing how the
building or structure will be preipared_&)T_d^^^ the lype and amount_of

explosives to be used, and a detailed j3lan_ showing what safety precautions will be

takenjoj)rotect persons and ixogerty,
j9)___ A permit for the demolition of a building or structure by the use of exglosrvesjnay

be issued bv the city council subject to the following conditions,:

33



a;_The applicant for a permit must demonstrate to the city council the need for
demolition by explosives rather than demolition by_convei'itioir<i\ means and

must demonstrate that demolition by explosives can be safely conducted at

the sEecific location requested.
K_The building official, fire chief and police chief shall review the application

and submit their opinions to the city cpuncil concemmg_whether or not the

demolition can be safely conducted, together with any recommendations

they maY_haye,

c_ The applicant shall provide a certificate of liability insurance forj)ersonal

injuries, death and for property damage in an amount not less than
$1,000,000.00 naming the city as an additional named insured party. The
certificate shall provide that the coverage shall not be. cancelled or changed

without ten_daYS^^^^^^^ wittenjwtice to the city. The city council may

regmrcAdditional insurance coverage when the hazard appears greater than
normally expected and may also in such instance require the postiny of a

bond acceptable to the city in an amount commensurate with the severity of

the hazard. The bond shall provide that the applicant shall weU_and
satisfactorily perform the demolition,__The bond shall be for the benefit of

the city and any person who is injured or damaged by the failure ofjhe

applicant to satisfactorily perform the demolition.

d. The applicant shall agree to indemnifyandjiold harmless the city from all

losses resulting from, damagesor injynes caused by the applicant or the

afipljcant's employees, servants or agents arising out of the use of explosives

in demolition.

e;_The applicant shall pay the city in advance for reasonable expenses that will
be incurred by the city in furnishing necessary security and police protection

in the vicinity of the demolition site.

f,_The applicant sliall observe all applicable federal, state and local laws in the

course of the demolition, including but not limited to the following:

L_ The applicable provisions of the. city fire prevention code relating_to

the storage, transportation and use of explosives,

2. The_jy]es__an d regulations of the United States Environmental
Protection Agency relating to the demolition of buildings or

structures containing asbestos materials or other hazardous air

pollutants.

ie applicant shallmeet all other requirements of this article relating to the
demolition of structures or buildings; provided, however, that if a conflict

exists between the provisions of this subsection and other sections oJLthe
city Code. the provisions of this subsection shall be deemed to be

controlling.

The applicant need not obtain an obstruction permit as provided in section

26-304 of this article to block off portions of public property within_an

appropriate distance of the demolition site, provided that the obstruction is

for less than a 24-hour period and provided that the obstruction is for

security purpose^ connection vvith_tlie_use of explosiYes. However, the

34



airplicant shall be required to obtain an obstruction permit to_Lise_]3ublic
y-operty in the cleanup operations fQ]lo\\vigShQjietonatwn. of explosives.

i. The. city council shall at any_trmehaye_ihe authority to impose additional

recjuircments and safety precautions in the interest of the publicjiealth,

safety and welfare.

(JO) Such other information as shall be reasonably required by the building official or
community development director, including alj m necessary to conduct

historic review pui\suant to chapter j 8^^^
(c) Disconnection of sewer and water. No permit to demolish shall be issued until it has been

established that existing sewer and/or water services have been properly disconnected_and

approved.

(d) Bond required.
(1) Before a permit is issued to remoyeAbmldmg which has been ordered removed_as

a pubUc nuisance and which penod of time granted by the city or by the courts for

removal or other remedial action by the applicant or other party of mteresj_has

expn^cL_the_agplicant may be required to post a cash bond equal to the estimated
costs of the removal of the building and the.djsconnection of the existing utility

services. If the applicant does not remove the building at the time the permit expires

at a time specified by the buildmg official, such bond shall be forfeited and used

towardihe costs of the city to remove it.
[2)___ If the building is removed by the applicant prior to the time the permit expires, such

bond shall be. returned to the applicant, Aje1xirii_of the bond does not exempt the.

applicant from further assessments lojte^^^^^^^^ estate for costs that have occurred

t3rior_to_the issuance ofthej3ermrL

(e) General reciuiremenls.

(1) The building official shall have the authority to impose at any time reasonable

requirement's and safety precautions jnjhe^ of public health, safety, and

welfare which, in his or heropmion,_ar^^^^ with the severity of hazard

either_detnonstrated or anticipated, provided that such requirements may_be

agpealed to and reviewed by the board of appeals at the request of thejaflected

party.

(2) In addition, the following shall be met
a.^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ discharging,^_^ dumping of building materials from any

bujldmg shall be accomplished in such manner as to minimize the. creation

of dust and scattering of debris. Materials shalLnol_be_c|ropgedJ)y_gr^

to any point lying outside the building wa]ls_exceEtJhrough_jmj;^^
chute. unless such materials are dust free and the height of drop_is_at least

equal to the horizontal^ to the nearest property or barricade line.
Where_such horizontal distance is not available and practical necessity

dictates the dropping of relatively large masses of materials, th_ej)uildmg

official may approve appropriate protective measures designed to Erovjde
protection from danger egyiyalent to that afforded by the otherwise required

horizontal setbaclc: provided, however, that in all cases such materials shall

be handled in a manner approved by the air_Eollytion control division of the

county health department.

35



b__ When necessary to protect the public health, safety^jx_jvelfarc_eYery

demolition proiect shall be barricaded, fencedjigh^ and signed with

wammg. and/or directional signs in a manner approved by the building

official. The building officiaLm^^^ require the presence of ajjgroved
secmty-guards or flag persons. Such barricades, fences, lights, and signs as

may be deemed necessary by the building, official for protection of the
)ublic shall be maintained after com^Gtwriof_the demolition work until

such time as the site is cleanedof al] d^^^^^ excavations, basements,

and depressions in the groyndjircrcstored to grade and rendered harmless.

c. Adequate precautions shall be taken to ensure that procedures or conditions

relating to the demolition work do not constitute a fire hazard. If, in the

OEinion of the fire chief, a fire hazard exists or is likely to exist, hej3i_she

may order the cessation of work or require that appropriate protective

measures aoproved bv him or her be taken.

d.^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ A^^^^^ streets, alleys, and_pyblic_ways adjacent to the demolition site shall be

keptfree and_clear_ot^^ refuse, and loose material resulting from

the demolition work unless an obstruction pemiitjoi^uch space has been

obtained.

e;_Demolition of structures subject to public nuisance action shall include

removal of all footing and foundation materials unless otherwise approved

bv the building official.

f._Upon completion of the demolition work, the site shall be left in a clean,

smooth condition. Inorganic biuldmg_^^^ sand, clean earth, or other

approved fi 11 material may be used to fill excavations, basements, and

depressiom,_MQ^M^^^ the top 12 inches shall be clean earth or its
efliuvalent in terms of surface, smoothness, free from dust, and cleanliness

If the. surface is to be used for the parking of vehicles, it shall be constructed

asjequired in chapter 1,3 4 of the city Code pertaining to zoning^

(3') No nermit to d emolish shall be issued until a grading permit, waiver of grading
)ermit, or a solid waste disposal site license is obtained for any location within the

citv where the. demolition debris is to be discarded.

Sec. 26-304. bond, and insuranee^.

{al_ No person shall use any portion of public property as described in Section 3308 of the

International Building Code without first obtaining an obstruction permit which shall state

the following:
(' 1) The name of the owner of the property abutting the public property to be used.

(2) The name of th e person applying for the obstruction permit.

[3^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ property to be obstructed or occupied.

The length of time such obstruction or occupancy shall exist.

Aliagrcement to comply in all respects with the provisions and requirements ofthe

building code. this article_and_otiiCT^^^^ relating to the use of streets and

alleys and to indemnify and save and keep harmless the city from aiTy_andjalLcosts,

expense or liability for damages or injuries to persons or property or Hability_olanv
kind whatsoever, arisinp from or growing out of the use and occupancy of_sych

36



street or growing out of the deposit of such material or any failure to properly pile,
deposit, guard, light or care for such.

(6) .Such additional rcgyireme^^^ for the protection of the
city and its inhabitants.

(V]___ Before an obstruction permit shall be issued, there shall be placed on file in the office of

the building official proof of liability insurance and, if required, a syrctY_bo^^^

(1) The amount and type of liability insurance reqyi^^^^^^^^ shall be

determined by Jhe_^ designee. The
msuranceje(|yirements are hereby made a part of the permit application form. The
insurance shall remain in full force and effect through the obstructionpermit

expiration date or such extended time as may be grantedby_thecit.y,^
(2) If the city engineer or the city engineer's desis^Gedeteimmesmthevs(Aedj^^^

that an obstryction penTiit^ right-of-way poses a risk

of'damage to the ^ right-of-waY, the city engineer or the city en.eineers designee_mav

rcguire_such applicant to post a surety bond before the obstruction permit is issued.

Such bond, if required, shall be approved by the city engineer or thecity_engjnee^s
designee; shall be in the minimum amount of $5000.00 or such other amount

determined by the city engineer OT to be sufficient to
cover the anticipated cost of damage to the right-of-way; and shall be conditioned

to ensure removal of the obstruction and restoration of the right-of-way and all

public improvements thereon by or before the expiration date of su^

permit or such extended time as may be granted by the building official.

(c) No person shall, under any permit^ stated in the obstruction

)ermit.

(d]_ The fee for an obstruction permit shall be as set forth in the Schedule of Fees adopted by

the city council by resolution.
(e) This section shall not apply to street ma^ntenmw^^^^m city and its employees

and contractors.

Sec. 26-305. Conversion to or eooperative.

(a) The conversion of any residential building or portion thereof to a horizontal property

rcgime_OT shall be treated as a change of occupancY

classification for the building, notwithstanding anything in the building codes to the

contrary, and shall conform to the International Building Code.

(b) No person shall file or record a declaration in the office of,^^

an existing structure located within the city to a horizontal property regime unless a

certificate^^ the. current building codes has been issuedjjy

ihe_builcyji£j3J^^
{c[__Ngj)erson shall file or record an instrument in the office of the county recorder conveying

an interest in real estate located in the city to a multiple housing cooperative unless a

certificate of OCCUSMCI^^^^ building codes has been issuecTby
the bmldmgoffi

{d)_____AtJeast 60 days before being filed or recorded in the office of the county recorder, the
applicant shall file a copy of such declaration or such instrument, together with the

following documents withlhe.Ee^ administrator, and shall also pay a

37



conversion fee in the amount set in the schedule of fees adopted by the city council by

resolution:

(1) Two copies of an as-built plan for the entire structure.

(2)_ _^^_^^^^^^^^^^ code analysis pre]3ared_bY^ architect or professional engineer

demonstrating that the structure conforms with the current building codes, or can

be brought into conformance with the current^buildmg_ codes by planned
improvements to be made to the structure,

(3) Two copies of construction plansfor sianned^mjyroyemenis to be made to the

structure to bring the structure into conformance with the current building_codes^

(e.) Upon receipt of the doc.uments and the conversion fee as provided above, the permit and
development administrator or the administrator's designee shall review the building code

analysis and conduct such inspections of the structure as may be deemed appropriate by

the administrator to determine whether or not the structure conforms with the requirements

of paragrai)h_(a) above. If thepenTijl__and__ development center administrator or the

administrator's designee determines that the structure has been shown to be in substantia]

conyiUaiicejvith the requirements of paragraph (a) above, the administrator shall cause a

certificate of occupancy to be issued for the use ofjhe_structwe as a horizontal projoerty

regime or a multiple housing cooperative.If the_stmcture_ has not been shown to be in

substantial compliance with the requirements of paragraph (a) above, the administrator

shal\_^G_w!itt^ any violations of the applicable_code

rcciuirements discovered to exist, in the building^

Sec. 26-306. occupancy of generally.

(a) No part. of any structure or any appendage thereto, except signs, shall project beyond the
property line of the building site, except as specified mjhe_bi^ code; provided,

however, that a structure or appendage thereto may project beyond the property line of the

building,s|te_when the applicant holdsAi?ropCT^ including but not limited to air
rights, within the area of the projection sufficient to establish a legal right JX)J)uUdJherem

or thereon.

(b) Structures or appendages regulated by this seclion_s^^^^^ of matena}s_as

specified in the building code.

(c) The j)rQ]Gc^ons^ a^ M^uc^^^^ shall, be the distance measured horizontaHy

from the property line to the outermost point of the projection.
fd) Nothing in the building code shall prohibit the construction and use of a structure between

buildings and over or under a public wav provided the structure complies with all

requirements of the building code.
(e) No subsection_ofthis section and no provision of the Building Code shall be construed to

permit the violation of other laws or ordinances regulating the use and occii];)anc^_of_the

public property.

Sec. 26-307. for the

_As_used in this section, the term "shelter for the homeless" means a building used to provide

primarily short term lodging, or short term. lodging andmeals^and which may also provide

other services, including counseling, with or without compensation, to transient indiyiduals

38



or to individuals who have no acrc^^^^ or pernianent housing. For purposes of

this subsection, short term lodging shall include facilities offering lodging for J0_days_or

less.

No byildin^^^^^^^ that is to be used as a shelter for the homeless shall be
occujjjed as such unless an inspection certificate for such use has been issuedjoyj^he

neighborhood inspection zoning administrator. Such certificate shall be valid for not more

than one year from the date of issuance, and no new certificate shall be issued _until_te

Eremjsesjiave been reinspected for compliance with applicable building code, zonmg_and
fire safety requirements. No fee shall be charged for the annual inspection or certificate_of

compliance issued under this subsection; provided, however, that this fee exem]3tion_shall

not apply to permit fees, when rcguired.

j^'acilities which fall under federal, state or other local regulations which regu ire annual

inspections for byildingjmd health safety standards shall be exempted from this section.

Sec. 26-308. - of lot for code pyrposes.

(a)__ Combination of adjo ining lots. Adjoining lots, regardless of whe1iier_^he}_jirejjnder
common ownership or control, may be treated as a single consolidated lot for thejjmited

purposes ofthiscliaptCT^ Chapter 46 when a declaration of covenants in a form approved
by • th e_CitYiegal_ department and signed by all owners of the included lots is recorded that

binds each of the included lots to the following covenants:
(']) All existing and future buildings and structures located upon the included lots and

anv future, alterations and additions thereto shall be considered part of a single

consolidated lot under common ownership for purposes of applying this chapter

and Chapter 46. Any constry^ alteration, additign_oniemolition of a building

on the included lots^ shaU_conform with the_E)ro visions of this chapter and Chapter
46 that are applicable to the included lots and each portion thereof, as a building

located on a single consolidated lot under common ownership. No new building

shall be constructed or placed on the included lots andno_existing building on the
included lots shall be demolished, altered or expanded in a manner which would

cause another existing building on the included lots to come into vio]ation_of^

cha]5ter_or_ Chapter 46 when applied to all buildings on the included lotsjhat_arc

considered as a single consolidated lot under common ownership. Each owner of

an¥_portion of the included lots shall maintain its portion of the included lots in

good repair and in conformance with the applicable requirements of this chapter

and Chapter 46.
(2) If any bm\dm&_on_the_ included lots is affected by casualty loss, demolition,

deterioration, neglect or any other event that causes the building official to

determine that some portion or portions of the buildings^ existing upon the

included lots are unsatejo_occu£y, the biuldmgofficial^m_the proper performance
of the building official's duties may issue such orders as are reasonable and

necessary in accordance with the provisions of this chapter. Chapter 46 and
a]3plicab}e_law^ treating all buildings on the included lots as located on a single

consolidated lot under co'mmon ownership,

{j) All provisions of the declaration of covenants shall run with the land and shaU_be
binding uponthe_owners, and the owners' successors and assigns, for the benefit of

39



the City, the owners, and the owners' successors and assigns. Each ownei_of_any

porlxm_of_the included lots shall be. given the benefit of the obligations under the

declaration of covenants imposed upon the owners of all other portions_of_the

included lots, and may enforce such obligations by an actiQn_for_s]Xicjfic

performance and/or damages.

(4) The declaration of covenants shall not be amended or terminated without the

written approval of all owners^rf^ lots, and the prior written consent of

the building official. The building official is authorized to^ consent to an

amendment or termination only if appropriate measyr^ taken to the

reasonable satisfaction of the building official to remedy any violations of this

chapter and Chapter 46 that_wouM^^^^^^^^^^^ upon such amendment or

termination.

(b) Use of 'artificial [loi FImeA',_Jhe^i^^ line between adjoining lots, regardless ofwhether

the lots are under common ownership or control, may be relocated within the area of the

combined lots, for the limited purposes of this di.a^ter and_C^^ an easement

oi_declaration of covenants in a form approved by the City legal department and signajby
all owners of the lots burdened by Jheartifi lot line is recorded that binds the owners of

each of the burdened lots to the following covenants:

(1) ^^^^^^^^^^^^_^^^^^^^^^^ these covenants, the following terms shall be defined as

follows:
a. A "burdened lot" is any lot which contains an artificial lot line which is

established across the interior of the lot for the benefit of the owners of an

adjoining lot.
b. A "benefitte.d lot" is any lot which is given Jhe_^^

artificial lot line located on an adjoining burdened lot.
c. "Artificial lot line" is a line, the location of which is clearly identified, which

is located within the boundary of a burdened lot for the benefit of an

adioinine benefited lot. and shall serve as the shared lot line between the

burdened and benefitted lots for purposes of applying this chapter and

Chapter 46 to both lots, ^ artificial lot line must

not create, a violation of this chapter or Chapter 46, if treated as the shared
lot line between the burdened and benefitted lots.

(2) All owners of each burdened lot agree that for the limited purpose of applying this

chapter and Chapter 46: i) the artificial lot, Ime^shalLserye as the shared lot line
between the burdened lot and the benefitted lot; ii) any construction, alteration,

addition or demolition of a building on the burdened lot shall conform with the

provisions of this chapter and Chapter 46 when using the artificial line as the shared

lot line with the benefitted lot: and, any construction, alteration, addition or

demolition of a building on the benefitted lot shall have the benefit of using the

artificial lot line, as the shared lot line with the burdened lot.

(3) All j}royisionsM_^_^s^me^^ declaration of covenants shall run with the land
and shall be binding upon the owners of the burdened lot, and such owners'

successors and assigns, for the benefit of the City, the owners of the benefitted lot,

and such owners' successors and assigns. Each owner of any portion of the

benefitted lot shall be. given the. benefit of the obligations under the easement or

40



declara-tian of covenants imposed upon the owners of the burdened lot_andjnay

enforce such obligations by an action for specific performance.

[4}_ The easement or declaration of covenants shall not be amended or terminated

wjthoutthe, written approval of all owners of the benefitted lot, and the gnor_wntten
consent of the building official. The buildin.s official is authorized to consent to

any such amendment or termination only if appropriate measures have beenjaken
to the reasonable satisfaction of the building official remedy any violations of

this chapter and Chaster^^^^ exist upon such amendment or

termination.

Division 2. International Residential Code

Sec. 26-310.

The provisions o'nnternationai Residential Code (IRQ. 2018 edition are hereby amended as

follows:
(a) Delete, section Rl 05.2

^ Delete section R 105.5
Delete section R112

Sec,_26-310.1. Scope,

Delete section R101.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

RIO 1.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the construction, alteratjorL

movement, enlargement, re.placement,_repair, equipment,^^^ occupancy, location,

removal and demolition of the following:

1. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhoysesnotjnore than three

stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and their

accessory structures not more than three stories above grade plane mjiejght

2. Owner-occupied lodging hoyses with five or fewer guestrooms.

3. Detached one- and two-familv dwellings and townliouses that contain offices of up

to20 ^ percent_pf the dwelling unit area.

4. Live/work units within detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses

that compl-y• with the requirements of Section 419 of the International Building

Code.

5. Care facilities within detached one- and two-familv dwellings and townhouses with

eight_orfewerj)ersons receivins; care who have the ability to respond to emergency

situations and evacuate.

6. In-home child care facilities within detached one- and two-family dvvellings_aiid

townhouses where in-home child care is provided to no more than eight chiklrejz
and of these eight children no more than six are five years old or younger, no more

41



than four are twentv-four months old or younger, and no more thaiiJlii:ee^^^^^a^^

eighteen months old or vounger.

7_ In-home child care facilities that provide custodial care for 16 or fewer gersonsjn

detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses that were registered with

the_State_of_Iowa Department of Human Services as child development homes and

haYe_held such registration continyoyslYJn_^^^ since on or before

January I,2017.

8. Care facilities within detached one- and two-familv dwellings and townhouses that

are provided with a residential fire sprinkler system complying with Section P2904

or NFPA 13D with eight or fewer persons receiving care who have im2amnents

that prevent them from responding to emergency situations and evacuating.

See. 26-310.2. JLxten^^^^ protection.

DejeteJ^ble 302.1(1) and insert in lieu thereof the following new table: Table 302.1 (1)

Table 3 02. KU
Exterior Wall Element

Walls

Projections

Openings in walls

Penetrations

Exterior Walls

Fire-resistance rated

Not-fire resistance rated

Not allowed
Fire-resistance rated

Not-fire resistance rated

Not allowed

25% maximum of wall
area

Unlimited
All

Minimum Fire-Resistance

Rating
1 hour-tested in accordance

with ASTM E 119 or UL263
with exposure from both sjdes
0 hours

N/A
1 hour on the ynderside a'b

0 hours

N/A
0 hours

Qhours
Comply vYittLSectipn R302.4
None required

Minimum Fire Separation

Distance

< 5 feet

> 5 feet

< 2 feet
> 2 feet to < 4 feet
>4 feet
< 3 feet

3 feet

5 feet
< 3 feet

3 feet

Roofeave fire-resistance rating shall be reduced to 0 hours on the underside of the eave if

(M_

fireblocking is provided from the wall top plate to the underside of the roofsheathing.

Roofeavefu-^rc^^^ rating shall be permittedlo^berc to 0 hours on the utidersjde

ofthe_eave provided that gable vent openings are not installed,

Sec. 26-310.3. Bathroom ventilation.

Delete section R303.3 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

R303.3 Bathrooms. Bathrooms, water closet com^artments_aiid_^imi].ar rooms shall be

provided \\^^^ or artificial light and be provided with a mechanical ventilation

system. The minimum ventilation rates shall be 50 cubic feet per minute (24 L/s) for

mtermittent ventilation or 20 cubic feet per minute (IQL/s) for continuous ventilatjorL

Ventilation air from the space shall be exhausted directly to the outside

42



Sec±^6r3]JI-4--X£!'^ssjviii^^

Section R310.2.2 is amended by addin.e the following exception.

Exception: AJandmg may be provided to meet the maximum sill height of forty-four (44)

inches above the floor or landing provided. The landing_shaU_ be not less than thirty^slx

C36) inches wide, not less than twelve (12) inches out from the exterior wall, and not more

than twenty-four (2.4]_mches^heiej\t. The landing shall be permanently affixed _tojhe

floor below or the wall under the. window it serves.

Sec. 26-310.5. Emereencv escape windows under porches.

Delete section R310.2.4 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section.

Section R310.2.4 Emergency esca and porches. Emergency esc.ai)e

and rescue opemnKsmstalledunder_^ shall be fully openable and provide
a path not less than 36 inches ('914mm) in heipht to a yard or court. Cantilever areas of all

construction elements shall be regulated in accordance with this section.

Sec. 26-310.6. risers.

Section R311.7.5.1 is amended by adding the following.exception,

Exception: 3. The dimension of the top and bottom riser may vary up to 1 inch (25.4 mmj
from the stairway riser dimension. In no case shall the riser height exceed the maximum

height of 7-3/4 inches.

Sec. 26-310.7. Floor elevations at other

Delete the section R311.3.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section.

R311.3.2 Floor elevations at other exterior doors. Doors other than the required egress door

shall be provided with landings or floors^iio^ than 7-3/4 inches (196 mm) below the

top of the threshold.

Exception: A top landing is not required where a stairway of not more than four risers js

located on the exterior side of the door, pro^ does not swing over the

stairway.

Sec 26-310.8. continuity.

Section R311.7.8.2 is amended by adding the following exception:

3. Handrails shall be permitted to be interrupted at one location in a straight stair when

the rail terminates into a wall or ledge andjs offset_and_mimediately continues,

43



Se^26-3lM..Gwids.

Delete section R312.1.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section,,

R312.1.1 Where required. Guards shall be provided for those portions of open-sided

walking surfaces, including stairs, ramps and landings, driyewaY^^^^^^^^^ patios^and

decks that are located more than 30 inches ('762 mm) measured vertically to the floor or

grade below at any point within 36 inches (914 mm) horizontal ly to the edge of the open

sjde. Insect screening shall not be considered as a guard.

Exception: Portions of retaining wall where the^ honzonMdist^ between the edge of

the walking surface _and the face ofthe wa^is_g^ than 36-inches,

Sec. 26-310.10. Automatic fire sprinkler systems.

/a) Delete section R313.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 313.1

Townhomes automatic fire sprinkler SYstems,__ An _ automatic residential fire sprinkler

system shall be installed in townhouses,

(1) An automatic residential fire si^irMer_system_shal} not be required where additions
or alterations are made to existing townl'wuses that do not have an automatic

residential fire sprinkler system installed

('2) Townhouse structures that contain eight (8) or less dwelling units.

(3) Townhouse structures less than eighteen thousand (18,000) square feet^ floor_s£ace,

exclysiYeotanY garages,

(b) Delete sectwn_R3]^'2 and insert jn _Heu thereof the following new section:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwelling automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic
residential fire sprinkler system shall be installer ^ two-family dwellings that

contain S,000_sguare feet or more floor space, excluding attached garages and other

unenclosed areas.

Excegtjon: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be. required_where

additions or alterations are made to existing buildings that are not already provided wrth

an automatic residential fire sprinkler system,

See, OJl,F:ootmg..Slze.

Delete section R403.1.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

R4QlAA_MJI]ilIMILf^^ width for all footings shall be 16 inches
The footing width shall be based on the load-bearmg yalyejrfthe soil in accordance with

Table R401.4.1. Footing projections, P,shall be_nat_iess than 2 indies (51 mm.) and shall
noj_exceed the thickness of the footing. Footing thickness and projection for firej)laces_shaU

44



be in accordance with Section Rl 001.2. The size of footings supporting piers and columns
shall be based on the tributary load and allowable sojl pressLy-^jn accordance with_Table

R401.4.1. Footings for wood foundations shall be in accordance with the details set forth

in Section R403.2, and Figures R403.1 (2) and R403.1 (3). Footings for precast foundations

shall be in accordance with the details set forth in Section R403.4, Table R403.4, and

Figures R403.4Q) and R403.4(12). Residential conventional footings are allowed in Table

403.5 based on the followin.n dimensions and soil bearing pressure.

Exception: Detached accessgrv_^ not required to have minimum 16inch_wjde

footings.

Table 403.5 Residential Conventional Footing Dimensions

Soil Bearing
Pressure

(pounds per
square toot)

2,000 psf
1,850 psf
1,500 psf

l,250psf

LOOOpsf

Conventional Footing

Dimension

Thickness

(inchesl

8
9

10
11
12

Width
(inches)

16
20
20
28
32

Required Reinforcement '*•

(All reinforcing bars shall

2-Nbars

^-#4bars

2_-_#5,bars

3 - #5 bars

3 - #5 bars

a. The minimum yield strength ofreinforcin.s steel shall be 40,000 psi.
b. All reinforcement shall be installed in the middle third of the footing and in accordance

c.

with R4031.3.5.3.
Residential conventional footings shown in Table 403.5 are only allowed for

conventionally designed one or two-family dwelling structures not exceeding two stones
in height, intended to be constructed on undisturbed, non-expansive soils. Townhouse

structures are not allowed to utilize this table.

26-310.12. for accessory

Amend section R403.1.4.1 by deletiiig exception^ in lieu thereof the

following

Exception:

1. Detached garages of lightJTam^ with an area of 1024 square

feet_or_less may be provided with a floating slab; where all the following

conditions are met:

1.1 The bottom portion of the thickeneds\ab_area. shall be twelve (12) by twelve

{12)_mches with one (1) number four (4) bar placed near the top and bottom

of the edge.

1,2,The slab floor shall be not less than four (4) inches thick with_oneJJL}

number four (4) bar placed every two (2) feet on center or in a 6 by 6 mesh.

j .3 The slab pour shall M^^^^

45



Sec. 26-310.13. Alternate for foundation walls.

1.3.2.3 Walls for Conventional Light Frame Wood

Construction. Concrete and masonry foundation walls shall be permitted to be
designed in accordance with the following Table "Foundation Walls for

Conventional Light Frame Construction' may be used:

Table R404.1.3.2.3 - 'Foundation Walls for Conventional Light Frame Construction

I4ei2ht^^^^^^^^^^^^^^_^^^^^^^ _

Foundation __Wa[l

fN et m easiired from

top of basement slab

Thickness of Foundation

Walls

Unit

ReiQ.ioi'(-;.6i!ienJ_tyE>6

and _Eiacement

within Foyndatjon
Wall**

Reinforcement type and

placement within

Foundation Wall**

(maximum 12' ^^^^ ^

between corners and|

supportine cross walls.)

Type QfMortar

Gross Net Concrete Masonrv Concrete Masonrv IMasonry

7' 8" 7 ;/2" 8" '/2"horizontal bars,

placement in the

0.075 square inch bar 8'

o.c. vertically in fullv

middle, and near the

top & bottom - '/2''

bars (Si, 6' max.

vertical Iv

granted cells. If block is!
12" nominal thickness.l

may be unreinforced.

Ty]3e_M_oi_S,

Grout_&_Mortar

shall__

provisions of

Chapter 21 IBC

8' 8" See__J3iai)ter

MJBC
10 9~ 8" See Chapter

18 IBC

',2" bars 2' o.c.

horizontally & 20"
vertically o.c.

(5/8" bars 2' o.c.

horizontally & 30"
vertically o.c.)

See Chapter 18 I BC Same as abgye

See Chapter 18 IBC Same as above

*Concrete floor slab to be nominal 4". If such floor slab is not provided prior to backfill. provide l)_36'LYeili^

embedded in the tbotins Qv, maximum 7' O.C. spacing -and/or- 2) full depth nominal 2" depth x 4"width kevway [^^^^

** All steel reinforcement bars shall meet ASTM A6175 .grade 40 iTijnimum and be defoi-med.fjaceinent of bars shalLbejn
center of wall and ineet the provisions of chapters 18, 19,and21ofthe^^h^^^^^^^^ Building Code,

NQTE^ Cast in place concrete shall have a compressive strength of 3.000 Ibs @ 28 days. Footings shall contain continuous
remforcement of minimum 2 - ''A"' diameter rebar throughout. Placement of reinforcement and conc;r^_shall_nieet_the

reciujrements of Chapter 19 of the International Buildin^_Code;

NOTE: Material used for backfilline shall be carefully placed eranular soil of average or his.h pei-ineabilitY and,,^

drained with an approved drainage system as prescribed in Section 1805.4 of the International Building Code. Wlierejipjls
containing a high percentage of clay. fine silt or similar materials of low permeability or expansive soils are encountered_or

where backfill materials are not drained or an unusuallv high surcharge is to be placed adjacent to the wall, a specialjv

designed wall sballj)e_reflyireci

Note: Foundation plate or sill anchorage shall be installed in accordance with the respective codes_as_aj3]3Hcable

Sec. 26-310.14. in rooms.

Delete section Ml 305.1.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

46



M1305.1.1 in rooms. Appliances installed in a basement or similar

space shall be accessed by an opemng_or door and an unobstructed passageway

measuring not less than 24 inches (610 mm) wide and large enough to allovYjemoval

of the largest awJ^yicz'^ space, p.rovided there is a level service_SEace_o_fnot,

less than 30 inches (762 mm) deep and the height of the aypliance, but not less than

30 inches (762 mm), at the front or service side of the uppliance with the door opeix

Sec. 26-310.15. Appliances in closets, alcoves, or spaces.

Delete section Ml 305.1.1.1 and insert in lieu diereofthe following new section.

MllS-^-'lJ-^iTi)!iailci^--in—£los^^
Appliances installed within a closet, alcove or compartment, such space shall measure
no less than 30 inches wide and the opening into such space shall also be no less Itian

30 inches wide.

See. 26-310.16.

Delete section Ml 502.4.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section.

M1502A2 Exhaust ducts shall be supported at intervals not to exceed

4_feet^(36^jTim) and shall be secured in place. The. insert end of the duct shall extend

into the adjoining duct or fittmg_m_ihe_dj^c^oYiM_a^ Exhaust duct joints shall be
sealed in accordance with Section Ml 601.4.1 and shall be mechanically fastened. Ducts

shall not be joined with screws or similar fasteners. Where dryer exhaust ducts are.

enclosed in wall or ceiling cavities, such cavities shall be of sufficient size to allow the

installation of the duct, without changing the configuration of the duct.

Excefition: Dryer duct sections that are longer than 4 feet shall be supported minimally

everyAfeet,^

Sec.26-310.17 Whole Ventilation.

Delete section Ml 505.4.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section.

M1505,4.1 The whole-house yentilation__SYstem_sha}l consist,of one olr

more outside air sypMYAlld exhaust fans with the associated ducts and controls. Local

exhaysj_and supply fans are permitted to serve as such a sy stein. Outdoor air ducts

connected to the return side of an air handler shall be considered as providing supplY

ventilation.

See. 26-310.18.

Amend section Ml 601.3 by inserting_te

5. The use of air-inflated/encapsulated duct wrap to achieve required R-values shall be

prohibited,

47



Sec. 26-310.19 Air.

Amend section Ml 602.2 by inserting the following:

5. Return air openings shall be a located a minimum of four feet away from supply air

opemn.gs.

Sec. 26-311.

Care facility. A building or structure where care is provided to persons who need some level of

assistance or supervision,

l]l^wjne_(Mld_ccire. A dwelling where care is provided to children by a person other thanjhe

child's parent, guardian, or custodian for periods of less than twenty-four lioursj3er_dayj)er_d3Jld

on a regular basis.

Division 3. International Building Code

Se€_,26-325,_<^_eraj.,

The provisionsof thejnternat'ional Building Code (IBC), 2.018 edition, are amended with

the revision of the following text as stated:

(1) Delete section 105,2,

(2) Delete section_105,5,
(3) Delete section 11 0.3.5.

f4) Delete section 113.

j_5) Delete chapter 29.

Sec 26-325.1. Day occupancies.

(a) Delete, section 308.5.4 and insert in lieu thereof the following new sectiorL

l!l§i^_^i£i!ti>lJ^werJlerso!!s^^

Eersons_receiving care in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a dwejlmg

unit and having eight or fewer persons receiving czistodial care shall be classified as a

group R-3 occupancy or shall c.omply_WTthJheJnternational Residential Code.

Day care facilities that provide custodial care for 1 6 or fewer persons for less

than 24-hours per day in a single-family dwelling, and where registered with the State of

48



Iowa Department of Human Services^ as_child development homes on or before January

1^2017, are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code.'

{b) Delete section 31 0.4.1. and insert in lieu thereof the following new section.

310^.1_^ within a dwelling.^

308.5.4.

See. 26-325.2. rise fire requirements.

Delete section 403.3.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 403.3.2 Water

Required fire pumps shall be supplied by comiectioas_to_a minimum of two water mains

jocatecHn different streets. Separate supply piping shall be provided between each

connection to the water main and the pumps. Each connection and the su]3gly_jij]:)mg
between the connection and the pumps shall be sized to supply the flow and pressure

required for thepumps to operate.

Exception: Two connections to the samG_mam_s\ml}^ provided the main is

valved sychjhat an interruption_can^ so that the water supply will continue

without interruption through at least one of the connections

See. 26-325.3. Live/ work

(a) Delete section 419.1 and insert in lieu thereof thee following new section,

419.1 A l.ive/work unit shall comply with Sections 419.1 through 419.9

Exceptions:
1. Dwellmg_pr sl eepine units that include an office that is less than 10 percent of the

arca_ofJhe_Af'eZZmj? unit are permitted to be classified as dwelling units with accessory

wxugancjesjn accordance with Section 508.2

2. Detached one- and two-family dwellingsand towiib^^^ that include an office that
is less than 20 percent of the area of the dwelling unit and constructed in accordamxwth
the International Residential Code are not required to comply with Sections 419.1 through

419.9.

(b) Delete 419.1,1, item #3, and insert lieu thereof the following new item #3.

3. The nonre.sidential area function shall be limited to floors of the live/work unit with exit

at the 1 story or a basement walkout of the live/work unit.

(c) Add the following exception _to 419,2,

49



The nonresidential area function shall be limited to floors of the /h'cyi-i^or/c »/?^Lwith_e^^^^^^^^

the I51 story or a basement walkout of the liveA'vork unit.

Sec. 26-325.4. shelters_for_edu^^

Delete section 423.4 including subsections 423.4.1 and 423.4.2 and insert in lieu thereof

the following new section.

423.4 Group E occupaney. In areas where the shelter design wind speed for tornadoes
in 250 mph in accordance with Figure 304.2 (1) of ICC 500, all Group E occupancies

with a program occupant load of 50 or more shall have a storm shelter constructed in
accordance with Chapters 1 through 5 & 8 ofICC 500.

The installation of portable buildings for u^^^^^^^ or site. for educational

purposes is considered new^construction a^ Group E occut)ancjes^

Exceptionsi

1 Group E day care facilities.

2. Group E occupancies accessory to place of religious^worship,

3. Buildings meeting the requirements for shelter design in ICC 500.

4. Accessory structures to existing group E sites where the occupancy

classification of said structures are classified as Groups A-5 and U

423.4.1 Required Occupant Capacity. The required occupant capaci^Q^^^^^^^

shelter shall include all buildings classified as a Group E occyt3ancY_on_the campus or site

(whichever is larger) and shall be the greater of the followmg;

1. The total occupant load of the classrooms, vocational rooms and offices in the

Group E occupancy.

2. The occupant load of any indoor assembly space that is associated with the Grou]

E occupancy.

Exceptions:

1. Where a new building is being.added^M^^^^^^^^ E site, and where

the new building is not rf^ the required occupant

capacity of the stormy for all of the buildings on-site. the storm shelter

shall at a minimum accommodate the required capacity forthe newbyildm^

2. Where approved by the code official, the required occupant capacity of the

shelter shall be permitted to be reduced by the occupant capacity of any existing

stormjAelters on the camj)us_oi_sjte^

423A2JLoca^^ the. buildings the^_serve_or

shall be located where the maximum distance of travel from not fewer than one

exterior door of each building to a door of the shelter serving that building does not

exceed 1,000 feet.

50



Sec. 26-325.5 Address

Delete section 502,1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 502J_Address

identification.

New and existing buildings shall have approved address numbers, building numbers
or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly legible and

visible from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall be black or
white and shall contrast with their background. Where required by the fire code

offjcjal,_^ shall be provided in greater dimension or additional

ayproved locations to facilitate emergency response. Address numbers shall be. Arabic

numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers and letters shall be a minimum height and a

minimum stroke width as dictated by Table 505.1. Where access is by means_o^a

private road and ^e}jw\^m&_cwm3t be viewed from the public wav, a monument.

pole or other sjgn ^^ be used to identify the structure. Address numbers

shall be maintained.

Table502,l
Stroke Widtha b

Distance

centerline

from the

of the Public
Way (ft)

Less than 100

100

200

199

299

For each additional 100

Minimum

Height

(ml
4

6

8

Increase
9

Minimum

Stroke
Width ('in'

1/2

3/4

1

Increase

HI

a Exterior suite identification, minimum height^shallb^^^ and stroke
width shall be '/z inch. b Interior suite identification, minimum height shall

be 2 inches and stroke width shall be 1/» inch.

Sec. 26-325.6.

Add the following new section 713.3.1

71j_j^J__jyiour fire-rated shaft enclosure in Type III, IV and V construction. Shaft

enclosures that are required tojiav^^^^^^^^^ rating of 2 hours or more serving

mtenoi^exrt_stairs or interior exit ramps in buildings of type III, IV, and V construction
type slia]] te or masonry. All other shafts that are recjuired to

have a fire resistance rating of 2 hours or more shall be constructed of materials permitted

by the building type of construction,

51



Add the following new section; 714.3.1.3. Penetrations for the operation of roUmg_[rre

doj?l^_^liej:)Een_^^^ tubing (EMT) conduit shall be allowed for each
rolling overhead fire door to allow the installation offusible link hardware. The conduit shall be

fire stopped where penetrating the wall in accordance with section 714, but the ends shall remain

open to allow proper function of th fusible link.

Sec. 26-325.8. Fire sprinkler riser requirements.

Add the following new section: 901.9 Fire Sprinkler Riser Room. A fire sprinkler riser

room shall be separated from the electrical room. The riser room shall hweno_GiGC^

devices, or apparatus inside the room other than the outlets or support equipment (lighting, air
compressor, and heater) required for the use of the fire sprinkler system and/or the fire alarm panel.

The sprinkler riser room shall not be accessed from the electrical room, but the electrical room

may be accessed from the fire. riser room.

See. 26-325.9.,Ay

a) Insert the following new section:

903.1.2 Existing For other than new construction or where cuiTent^c

contams jetroactiv^_^^

)ursuant to the provisions of the. International Existing Building Code.

b) Delete, section 903.2.1.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 903.2.1.1

Group.A-l. An^^^a^

Group A-l occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-l occupancy to and

including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following

conditions exists:

I. The fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (1115 m2).

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire. area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving'

such occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a myltiple-theater complex.

903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-

2 occupaiicYto and i^^

.one of the following conditions exists:

]. The fire area exceeds 1,500 square feet (1115 m2).
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more.

3. The fire area is located ona floor pther than a level of exit discharge serying

sych_occyBancies,

4^JTieJlr^jirea_coiT^^ a multiple-theater comglex^

52



d) Delete section 903.2.1 .3 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

90^2_lJ)_Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the GrouE

A-3 occupancy to and including the leyels,^^^ serving that occupan_cy

where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (1115 m2).
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more,

The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such

occupancies

e) Delete section 903.2.1.4 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

903.2.1.4 Cjroup A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout

stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Groug

A-4 __occui)ancY_tp and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy

where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (1115 mZj,

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300^^^^^^

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serYing

such occupancies.

f) Delete section 903.2.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

903.2.2 B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
byjl^ B occupancy where one of the following conditions

exists:

1. A Group B fire [ are a_ exceeds _6S)00 square feet ('557.5 m2).

2. A Group B fire area js locate than three stories above .grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group B fire areas on all floors, including any

mezzanines, exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115_m2),

gUnsert the following new section 903.2.2.1
Ainbulatorv_care An automatic spnnkler system shall^ be installed

throughgyt ]heGnlire_ floor containing an ambulatoi'v care facility where either of
the following conditions exist at any time:

1. Four or more carejecijnwts^e incapable ofself-preservation.

2. One or more care. recipients that are incapable of selj-preserYation are located at

other than the level of exit discharge serving such a facility^

In buildings where_ambu\aioTy_car^ is provided on levels other than the level of exit

discharge, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the entire floor

as well as all floors below where such care is provided, and all floors between the level

gfajTibjjlatorY care and the nearest level of exit: discharge, the level of exit discjiarge^

and all floors below the level of exit discharw.

53



Exception: Floors classified as an open parking_garage are not required to_be

sprinldered.
hl_Delete section 903.2.3 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section^

903.2.3 Cirroup E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stones

containing Group E occupancies and throyghout_jill stories from the Group E

occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where

one. of the following conditions exists:

]. The. fire area exceeds 1,500 square feet (iii:>_mT),

2. The fire area has an occupant. load of 50 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge, serving

i) Delete section 903.2.4 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

903.2.4 Group F-l. An automatic sprinkler system, shall be provided throughout
al 1 bui 1dmKS_CQTitaminfi a Group F-l occupancy where one of the following

conditions exists:

l_A_Group F-l fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (557.5 m2)_,
2. A Group F-l fire area is located more than three stones above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-l fire areas on all floors, including any

mezzanines, exceeds 12,000 sciyareje^^^^^^

4_A_Group F-l occupancy used for the manufacture ofupholstercdj^urnjture

or mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).

i) Delete section 903,2,7 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

J)03JJ_Group M.. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings containing a Group M occupancy where oneofthefollowiiig conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (557.5jn2}^

2. A Group Mfire^ area is located more. than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combi nec! _ area of all GroupM^^^^^^^^^^^^ floors, including any

mezzanines, exceeds 12,000 square feet (2230 m2).
4. A Group M occupancy used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture

or mattresses exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).

kjDelete section 903.2.9 and insert in lieu thereof the following new sectiojr
903.2.9 Group S-l. An aulomafic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout

all buildings containing a Group S-l occupancy where one of the foViowmg

conditions exists:
1, A Group S-l fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (557.5 m2).
2. A Group S-l ffre area is locatedmorcjhanlhi'ee_stories above grade plane.

3. The. combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors,_jncludm^_any

mezzanines, exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m2).
4. A Group S-l fire area used for the storage. ofcommerciahnotor vehicles where the

fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2),

54



5. A Group S-l occupancy used for the storage of upholstered furniture or

mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).
6. A Group S-1 occupancy used for Self-Service Storage Facility (mini-storage)

exceeds 6,0 00 square feet (557 m2).

1) Delete section 903.2.9.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new^ section;

903.2.9.1 garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provide4_througJTOut

all buildings used as repair_garages in accordance_wit^ 406.8 of the

International Buildins Code, as shown:

. Buildings hay mgjwo or more stories above grade plane, including basements. with a

fire area containing a repair garage exceeding 10.000 square feet (929_mT^

2. Buildings not more than one story above grade plane, with a fire area containing

a repair^garage exceedin.e 3,500 square. feet (325 m2^

3. Buildings with repair fwaKes_SGrvKm.fi vehicles parked in basements.

4. A Group S-l fire area used for the repair of commercial motor vehicles where the

fire area exceeds 3.500 square feet (325 m2).

Sec 26-325.10. sprinkler requirements.

Delete section 903.2.11.1.3 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

903.2.11.1.3 Basements. Where any portion of a basement is located more than 75 feet (22

860 mm) from openings required by Section 903.2J,1,1,^ be equipped

throughout with an approved €iii[oim]ticsjyinklery^^^

See. 1.

Delete section 903.3.1.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

9(B^J_2_NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R and I
occupancies uj)to^a^ four stories in height in buildings not exceeding 60 feet
(18 288 mm) in height above grade plane shall be installed throughout in accordance with

NFPA 13, unless allowed to be sprinklered in accordance with NFPA 13D by the

International BiiiUUnf, Code, The number of stories of Group R occupancies constructed

in accordance with Sections 510.2 and 510.4 of the International Bui.ldins Code shall be

measured from the horizontal assembly creating separate buildings.

Sec. 26-325.12. Fire exterior signals.

Delete section 903.4.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 903.4.2

Alarms. An approved weather proof audible device s'uituble for outdoor use with 110 candela

visual signal shall be connected to every autqmul.ic sprinMer_sysiem_,^\ich sprinkler wate.r-flow

alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of_the

smallest orifice size installed in the system. Alarm devices shall be provided on the exterior of the

bujldmg in an apfjrQvedloC(^m^Where_a fire alarm system is installed, actyation of the automatic

sjrnnkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.

55



See. 26-325.13. requirements for large

Insert the. following new section: 905.3.9 Building Footprint and Access,_W
remote portion of a floor or story is more than 400 feet from a _ hose connection or fire department

access road the fire code official is a.uthorized to regmrc _standi3ipes to be provided in tMJrovecj

locations. ClassJ manual standpipes shall be _allowed.

Sec. 26-325.14. Fire alarm control

Insert the following new section: 907.1.4 Fire^ Alarm Contra Panels (FACP). Eachbjjjkjmg

shall have no more than one Fire Alarm Control Panel. Installation of fire alarm control panel shall

not exceed six feet in height measured from the floor to the top of the control panel.

Exception: Suppression system releasing panels are not required to meet the height

requirement or the limitation in the number of panels.

Sec. 26-32iJ5^ system momtormg^^^

Delete section 907.6.6 and insert in lieu thereof the followinp new section: 907.6.6

Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter o^^ Fire Code_shaU_be

monitored ]rvace^ai_st^ approvedand ]isted_under_[JL 827 in accordance with NFPA 72.

Excej3tion: Monitoring is not required for automatic sprinkler and fire alanii_systemsm

one- and two-familv dwellings.

Sec. 26-325.16. vents.

Delete section 910.2.1 and insert in lieu thereof the foliowing new section: 910.2.1 Group

F-l or S-l.Smoke and heat vents installed in accordance with Section 910.3 or a mechanical smoke

removal system installed in accordance with Section 910.4 shall be installed in buildings and

j)ortiQns_there(y[usedas^a having more than 30,000 square feet (2787

m2}_of_Lindivided area. In occupied portions of a building equipped throughout with an automatic

sprinkler system in accordance with 903.3.1.1, where the upRer surface_ofthe story is not a roof

assembly, a mechanical smoke removal system in accordance with Section 910.4 shall be installed.

Exception; Group S-i^ repair hangers.,

Sec. 26-325.17. Center.

Delete section 911.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 911.1 General

Where regu|redbv_othCT sections^rf^ 911.1 and in buildings classified as high-rise

bwldmgsby_tbiscode, a fire command center for fire department operations shall be provided and

^a^LcomBly' with Sections 911.1.1 through 911.1^6,

ll^ertjiew section Table 911.1 with the following_language:

56



Table 911.1
Fire Command Center Thresholds

OccuiiancvAyI'oiii)

A
E, H, 1-2,1-3, M:

F^S
R-l

Threshold Requiring a Fire Command Center

1,000 occupants

100,000 square feet (gross)

200,000 square feet (gross)

Greater^ thaij 200 dwd^^^^ or sl eeping u ni ts

Sec. 26-325 J.8. Landing frosiii^

Insert the following new section: 1010.1.6.1 Landing Frost Protection,_^

required by Section 1010.1.5 to be at the same elevation on each s'ide rf^

at doors shall be provided with frost prgtectiQn,

Exception:^ built without frost depth footings^

Sec.

Insert New Section 1014.4 item #6 with the following language:

6. Handrails within a dwelling unit or serving an individual dwelling unit of groupsj?_^2

and R-3 shall be permitted to be interrupted at oneio^^^^ when the rail
terminates into a wall or ledge and is offset and immediately continues.

Sec. 26-325.20. Walking surfaces.

Insert the followinp new section:

1015.9 Walking surfaces. A guard shall be provided along retaining walls where a

finished walking surface such as sidewalks, patios, dTwewa^7s,j)arkms]Qts^^^^^^

located on the top side of a retaining wall. The guard shall be installed along any portion
of the wall measuring 30 inches or greater in height measured at any point within 36

inches honzontaljYjo_^^^^ A guard shall not be required along

^orti(msof_tJKTeta^^ where the horizontal distance between the edge of the
finished walking surface and the. face of the wall is greater than 72 inches.

Sec. 26-325.21. Window well drainage.

l]]sertihe_[onovnngj]ew^ 1030.5.3 Window well drainage. All window wells shall

be provided with approved drainage.

57



Sec. Ventilation.

Delete section 1203.1 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section: 1203.1 General.

BuikHngs_shall be provided with mechanical ventilation in accordance with the International
Mechanical Code. Where the air infiltration rate in a dwelling unit is less than 5 air changes per

hour when tested with a blower door at a pressure 0.2 inch w.c. in accordancewith Section

R402.1.1.2 of the International Energy Consen^ation Code -
unit shall be ventilated by mechanical means in accordance with section 403 of the State

Mechanical Code. Ambulatory care facilities and Group 1-2 occupancies shall be ventilated by

mechanical means in accordance with 407 of the State Mechanical Code.

Sec. 26-325.23. Ground Snow Load.

Delete subsection 1608.2 and insert in lieu thereof the following new section:

1608.2 Ground Snow Load. The ground snow load to be used in determining the design

snow load for roofs is hereby established at 30 pounds per sguarc^^
increases or decreases shall be allowed as otherwise provided in the building code , except

that the minimum allowable flat roof snow load may be reduced to not less than 80 percent

of the ground snow load.

Division 4,Intemational Ex isting_^

The provisions of International Existing Building ClodeCffi

amended as follows:

(2L
01
(4X
01
(61_

/eie.rc

Delete

Delete

Delete

_Delete

Delete

section

section

section

section

section

section

;J

105
105
109
112
115

.2.

.5.

.3.5.

Sec. 26-345.1 Fire Protection in

_AnY_jefercnce^^^^ to be provided per the

International Buildin.e Code shall comply with the 2018 International Building Code published by

the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue NW, 6* Floor, Washington. D.C., 20001.

For the purposes of this code, no local amendments to the aittomat^

in the 2018 International Building Code, other than the amendments to section 903.2.11.1.3, shall

Sec. 26-345.2. Fire Protection for.R-2 Occupancies

Insert the following new section.

58



Section 302.7 Fire Protection. Existing buildings containing R-2 occupancies shall be made

to comply with the International Building Code section 903.2.8 within two (2) years of any

of the following situations:

1. Fire. damage to three or more dwelling units, notinc[udmgsmok^^^^^^^^

or other damage fo
2. Issuance of a building permit for a Level III alteration as identified in Chapter 6 of

the International Existing Building Code.

Sec. 26-345.3. in Existing E0ccupane|es

Delete section 1106 including subsection 1106.1, 1106.1.1. and 1106.1.2 and insert in

lieu thereof the following new section.

1106

See|ionJJj)6J_AddJtIo^n^^^^^^^^^^

Group E occupancy located in an area where the shelter design wind speed for tornadoes in 250
mph in accordance with Figure 304.2. (1) ofICC 500 and the occupant load of the additionisjiQ

or more, the addition shall have. a storm shelter constructed in accordance wi^

5 & 8 of ICC 500.

For the purposes of this section the installation of portable buildings for utilization on the campus

orjHteJor_educational purposes shall be considered as an addition.

Exceptions:

1. Group E day care facilities.

2. Group E occupancies accessory toj)] ace ofreligioysw^

3. Additions meeting the requirements for shelter design in ICC 500.

4. Accessory structures and additions to existing group E sites where the
occupancy classification of said structures are classified as Groups A-5 and U

The aggregate area of all additions within a 10 (ten) year period shall be factored when_detenmning

the requirements of this section.

1106.1.2 Occupant capacity. The required occupant capacitY of theM^

include all byiM^
and shall be the greater of the following:

1. The total occupant load of the classrooms, vocational rooms and offices in the Group E

occupancy.

1 T^o^ with the Grouo_E

occupancy.

Exceptions:

59



]_ Where an addition is being added on an existing Group E site, and wherejhe

addition is not of sufficient size to accommodate the required occupant capacity

of the storm shelter for all of the buildings on-site, the storm_sheit^_sh^^^^^^^^

minimum accommodate^thejeg]medc^<^^
1 Where^ w^ the required occupant capacity of the

shelter shall be permitted to be reduced by the occupant capacity of any existing

storm shelters on the campus or site.

1106.1.3 Location. Storm shelters shall be located within the buildings they serve or shall be

located where the maximum distance of travel from not fewer than one exterior door of each

building to a door of the shelter serving that building does not exceed 1,000 feet.

Division 5. Swimming Pools

Sec.26-346. of pool code.

Thej)r(wjsiQns_^t^ and Spa Code, 2018 edition, published

by the International Code Council. 500 New Jersey Avenue NW, 6' Floor, Washington, D.C.

20001 are hereby adopted by reference and subiect to the additions, deletions, an^
hereinafter regulating the design, constiziction. alteration, mov

repair and maintenance of swimming pools, spas, hot tubs, aquatic facilities and related equipment
in the City ofDes Moines.

Note: The Iowa Department of Public. Health regulates swimmmgsoois,s^as^w

slides, wave pools, spray pads,.and.bathhouses connected to svvimjrimgjxx)ls_owne^^

by local or sja^^^^^^^^^^^ or private entities including, but not limited

to, public or private school corporations, hotels, motels, camps, apartments, condominiums, health

clubs, and country clubs. Please see https://idphjowa.gov/swimmingpoolsand^

details.

Sec,26-347,_D^d^^

The following are deleted from the swimming pool code midareof_Tm^^^^

article:

(1) Delete section 105,

(21 _

(5) Delete the last sentence in section 301.1.

(6) Delete sections 302 through 304, 305.5, and 306 through 323.

(7) Delete Chapter 4.

(8) Delete Chapter 5.

(9) Delete Chapter 6,
(10) Delete Chapter 7.
CH) Delete Chapter 8.

(12) Delete Chapter 9.

60



C13) Delete Chapter 10.

Sec 26-348.

(a) The remain^ represent amendments and additions to_the
recyjirements contained in the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code fISPSC) and

where their requirements conflict with those oftlie ISPSC the requirements of this article

shall prevail.
(b) . The following sections of this article shall be construed in the context of the enumerated

chapter of the ISPSC.

Sec. 26-349.

Insert a new definitioni^ pool" is defined as any structure intended

for swimming orrccreatK)nal_bathing capable of containing water more than 24 inches deep. This

includes in-ground, above-ground, and on-ground swimming pools, hot ti^s,and^^s^^

Division 6. Skywalk System

Sec. 26-350. Scope of Division.

Notwithstanding anything contained in this chapter_and_chapter,46 of the Municipal Code^

the provisions of this division also shall be j^a^^ code and fire prevention code

requirements for the skywdlksYste^^ over anything in conflict with this

division.

Sec. 26-351. Definitions.

The definitions for the terms "skvwalk system," "skywalk corridor," and^ "skYwalk_bridge"

as used in this division shall be the same as in article IV of chapter 102 of the city code.

Sec. 26-352. Skywalk exceptions.

Skvvi'alk system. Notwithstanding the provisions of Chapter 32 of the International Building

Code, the structures of a duly authorized portion of the public skywalk system may project into an

alleyjojhejsxtent authorized by the city council pursuant to article IV of chapter 102 of the cjty

code.

Sec. 26-353. for skywalk corridor prior to permitjssyanc^^^^

_Where a skywalk corridor is shown on an approved site plan for a proposed develojxnent

no building permit shall be issued for that proposed development until the city council has accepted

ajjght to an easement for such skywalk corridor.

61



Sec. 26-354. Exit requirements from skvwalksystem.

fa) There must be two means of egress, as described in this section, from any pomtjn the

skywalk system during the hours that the portion of such skywalk SYsteni^^^^^^^

fiojnt is open in accordance with article IV of chapter 102 of the Municipal Code.

(b) In addition to those exits defmedm^^ Building Code, any fire

door assemblies in a skywalk bridge may constitute an exit from the skywalk_system_withm
the meaning of such chapter 1 0, provided that there is a continuous and unobstrycted means
ofegress from such fire doors assemblies in the direction of exit t^^^

ground level and provided, further, that ^^^ passage through

one or more skywalk bnd^s,_Qneor_mo^ of one or more

buildings, and such skvwalk bridges, skywalk con'idors or portions of buildings need not

satjsfyjhe requirements for corridors or exit passageways contained in such chapter 10.

{cl_ Doors or other barriers may be locked so as to block passage through a portion of the
skywalk system during the hours such portion of the skywalk system is not required to be

open in accordance with article IV chapter 102 of the Municipal Code. Any such door or

other barrier e shall have a readily visible, durable_sign_on_or
adjacent totheAQor_OLPlhCT barrier stating "this door to remain unlocked during skywalk

system hours." The sign shall be in letters not less than one iiich high on^^_^^^

background.

(d) When a portion of the. system is do^ that is open shall

be sg^^^^^^ in either direction from any point in the system to an
exit. except for dead ends not exceeding 20 feet in length within a building, or 50 feet in

length within a sprinklered building.

Sec. 26-355. of construction for $kywalk corridors.

(a) The materials of construction for skywalk bridges and skywalk coiTi^

shall be noncombustible.

(b) The materials of construction,^ to and structurally supported

by_anYb^^^^^^^^ and (2), shall be as rec[uircd_bvjhe

most restrictive type of construction for the building.

See. 26-356. Protection of the are 25

of property

Notwithstanding anything to the contrarv contained in the International Building Code,

openings onto the skvwalk system which are located within 25 feet of tlie E^^^^

protected as follows:

{T[__JfJwo_J)ujldmgs are joined by a skywalk corridor constructed between such
buildings:
a. The centerline of the skywalk corridor easement shall_^

property line, and no opening shall be permitted in any wall of such skywalk
corridor which is less than seven feet from the property line;

b. Such skywalk corridor shall be protected by an approved automatic

sprinkler system;

62



c. Any wall of the skv'walk corridor which is less than seven feet from the

adjacent property line shall be of at least two-hour fire resistive
construction; and

d. Any openings in the skywalkconid(yrwal\s_shaj]_be_e^^

1. Of approved opening protective set in metal 'frames in accordance
with the International Building Code, provided a draft curtain of at

least one-hour fire resistive construction and not less than 12 inches

in height shall be provided to protect the skvwal^^^^^
adiacent building area,wj^chdrafis^urta^^ be located above the

glass and extendA.minJm?^m of 12 inches below the lowest finished
ceilm^o^^^^^^ adjacent building area or the skywalk corridor,

or, if the finished ceiling is not a fire-rated assembly, the draft

curtain shall extend from the opening protective to a rated ceiline or

floor assembly; or

2. Protected in the following manner:

L__^^^^^^^^^ which such opening_occurs

is protected by an approved automatic sprinkler SYstem;
ii. A draft curtain of at least one-hour fire resistive construction

and not less than 12 inches in height and including an

ajjproved water curtain of sprinkler heads six feet on center
immediately adjacent to such draft curtain and above the

opening within the building area sliall be provided to nrotect

the skywalk corridor from the adjacent bmldmgarea,_wju^

draft curtain shall be located above the opening and shall
extend a minimum of 12 inches below the lowest finished

ceiling area of either such adjacent building area o^^^^^^^^^^

skywalk corridor or, if such fimshed_CGi\mQ^
rated assembly, the draft curtain shall extend from the

opening to a rated ceiling or floor assembly: and
iii. Either (!) the ceiling, walls and floor of the adiacent bmlding

area onto which such opening occurs shall be.separated from

the rest of such building bv at least_two-houLfa

consti-yction ^ building area

sb^_be_j)rotec^ dampers in accordance the

International Building Code, or (ii) the entire story is

protected by an approved automatic sprinkler.

(2) If a skywalk corridor is constructed exterior to and attached to any one buijdjng^
but is not between twoormQrGbwldmss,_a^ extends over

the ad j acent ]3roBcrt^_]merdatG^i^^^^^^^^

a. The centerline of the skvwalk corridor easement shall be deemed the

property line, and no opening shall be permitted in any wall of such skywalk

corridor which is less than seven feet_fromthe_Bro]3ertY^

K_1. If the adjacent building is protected or is required to be protected by

m approved automatic sprinkler system, such skywalk corridor shaU

be protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system; or

63



2. If the adiacent building does not have and is not required to be

protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system, such skywajk
corridor need not be provided with an approved automatic sprinkler

system at the time of construction, provided that the property owners
and/or lessees who are responsible for such skvwalk corridor under

a sk.ywalk agreement with the city shall also agree in such skywalk

agreement io_Mffyide^ approved automatic sprinkler system if a

secondjjyjjxlm^_j^ within ten feet of such skywalk

corridor; and
c. Any wall of the skywalk corridor which is less than seven feet from the

adiacent propertv line shall be of at least tvvo-hour fire resistive

construction;

d. Any openings from such skywalk comdor into the adjacent building shall

be in accordance with subsection (l)d of this section; and

e. Any windows in the wall of such skywalk corridor opposite the building to
which it is adiacent either:

L__^^^^^^^^^^^ opening protective set in metal frames in

accordance with section 716 of the International Building Code; or

2. May be of other glass, provided that the property owners and/or
lessees who are responsible for such skywalk corridor under a

skywalk a.greement with the city shall also agree in such skywalk

agreement to:

L_Replace such glass with approved opening protective set in
metal" frames in accordance with the International BuHdmg

Code if any building subsequently is constructed which is

within ten feet, but not attached to, such skywalk corridor
wall; and

ii. Pay the equivalent of the cost of providing such approved

opening protective towards the cost of reconstructing all
openings in such skywalk corridor wall in accordance with

subsection 11M^^

is_c(ynstrw^d_which^^

wall.

(3) Two buildings may be joined by a wall opening, provided:

a. The wall opening shall be protected by a fh'e assembly having at least a 1
l/2-hourfirej)rote^

b. The wall opening may be unprotected if the entire building on both sides of
wall opening are protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system; and

c. In either case, there is a draft curtain of at least two-hour fire resistive

construction and not less than 12 inches in height, which draft curtain shall

be. located above the opening and shall extend a minimum of 12 inches

below the lowest finished ceiling on either side ofJhejvaU_02ennTg^_or^
the finished ceiling is not a fire-rated assembly on either side, the draft

curtain shall extend from the opening to a rated ceiling or floor assembly on

such_side_rf^

(4) If two buildings are connected by a skywalk bridge:

64



a,_Hsuch skywalk bridge Js_not connected Jo a skywalk corridor which is
exterior to any building to which such skvwalk bridge is connected, it shall

be_sufficient if the opening at one end of such skywalk bridge is protected
by approved fire assemblies having at least a 1 1/2-hour fire protection

rating with gasketed frames, and the remaminH construction where such end

ofthe skywalk bridge penetrates the adjacent building is of at least two-hour

fire rating construction; or

K_If such skywalk bridge is connected to a skywalk corridor which is exterior

to any building to which such skywalk bridge is connected, al] openings

from such skywalk bridgejinto the adiacent buildings shall conform_to the

requirements of subsection fl) of this sectiorL

Section 2. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and

publication as provided by law.

FORM APPROVED:

/)
/V- f-^M.^t.

Juf^y ^.. Parks-Kruse

Assistant City Attorney

65


