*RO" Call Number Agenda Item Number

|15

DATE July 19, 2021

COMMUNICATION FROM CONTRACTORS
REQUESTING PERMISSION TO SUBLET
CERTAIN ITEMS ON PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS

BE IT RESOLVED, BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DES MOINES, IOWA: That the attached
communication from each contractor requesting permission to sublet designated items and the attached
Permission to Sublet form, for each project listed below, be and are hereby approved; and each subcontractor is
hereby granted permission to work on said improvement.

Activity ID Project Title Contractor

062020008 2020 HMA Resurfacing Program Contract 2 Grimes Asphalt and Paving Corporation
Timothy Mallicoat, President
5550 NE 22nd Street
Des Moines, IA 50313

Moved by to adopt.

FORM APPROVED:

slkathleen Vanderpool

Kathleen Vanderpool '

Deputy City Attorney

s"j‘ﬁ COUNCIL ACTION YEAS NAYS PASS | ABSENT I, P. Kay Cmelik, City Clerk of said City

COWNIE Council, hereby certify that at a meeting of the
WESTERGAARD City Council, held on the above date, among
CRAY other proceedings the above was adopted.
BOESEN IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set
VOSS my hand and affixed my seal the day and year
MANDELBAUM first above written.

GATTO

TOTAL

MOTION CARRIED APPROVED

Mayor City Clerk



Clp

ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT Activity ID 062020008
CITY OF DES MOINES, IOWA Date 6/22/2021 l
PERMISSION TO SUBLET
Project 2020 HMA Resurfacing Program Contract 2
Contractor Grimes Asphalt and Paving Corporation
2
Federal Tax ID 271831755 Contract No. 15379 Sublet Request No.
ORGANIZATION COST OF
TO PERFORM DBE SPECIALTY TOTAL COST OF

ITEM TO BE SUBLET WORK Y/N ITEMS WORK SUBLET
Removal of Sub for Epoxy Iowa Plains Signing, Inc. No $(62,000.00)
Pavement Markings P.O. Box 654

1110 W. 6th Avenue

Slater, IA 50244

(515) 685-3536

Federal Tax ID 421501734
Epoxy Pavement Markings Advanced Traffic Control Yes $62,000.00

Inc. '

P.O. Box 8958

Cedar Rapids, IA 52408

(319) 396-5269

Federal Tax ID 454101181

Previous This Total
Request Request To Date

Cost of Items Sublet $240,946.00 $240,946.00 (a)
Cost of Specialty Items Sublet (b)
Cost of Sublet Items Less Speciality Items $240,946.00 (c)
Contract Amount $450,118.75 (d)
Contract Amount Less Total Specialty Items (d- $450,118.75 (e)
Percentage of Contract Sublet to Date (c/e) 53.53%

The prime contractor's request for Permission to Sublet the above items of work is approved with the
understanding that the prime contractor shall be held responsible for the subcontractors' full compliance of all

terms of the contract.

Attachment: Contractor's Letter
Requesting Subletting

Form Routing: Project Engr. - City Engr. -
Engr. Admin. - City Clerk/City Manager -
Engr. Admin. - Distribution

Form Distribution Original - Project File
Copy - Project Engineer
Copy - Prime Contractor

e =

Walos

Roll Call No.

Date



Becker, Matthew D.

From: Matt Yonker <mdyonker@grimesasphalt.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 22, 2021 9:29 AM

To: Becker, Matthew D.

Cc: vmiller@advanced-traffic.com

Subject: FW: Photos

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Matt

lowa Plains would like to add Advanced Traffic Control as a sub to the 2020 HMA Resurfacing Contract 2 project. They
will be installing the epoxy markings for them

PO Box 8958

Cedar Rapids, IA 52408

$62,000

Vaugn, Could you send me your Fed ID #
Thanks

Matt

From: Jason Baker <jbaker@iowaplains.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 22, 2021 7:58 AM

To: Becker, Matthew D. <MDBecker@dmgov.org>; Matt Yonker <mdyonker@grimesasphalt.com>
Subject: RE: Photos

It would be on the 9 intersections that we have done the epoxy on, that | was seeing if we could take a price deduct
. We plan on fixing and doing all the tape on Cherry.

Matt Younker, please get Advanced Traffic Control approved. Not sure if we are renting the truck yet or if they will
provide a couple people to run it. But rather be ready either way.

Thanks,
Jason

From: Becker, Matthew D. <MDBecker@dmgov.org>
Sent: Tuesday, June 22, 2021 7:13 AM

To: Jason Baker <jbaker@iowaplains.com>

Subject: RE: Photos

In most cases we would want them redone, it would have to be very extreme to not redo it.
Thanks -
Matt




