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DATE September 12, 2022

COMMUNICATION FROM CONTRACTORS
REQUESTING PERMISSION TO SUBLET

CERTAIN ITEMS ON PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS

BE IT RESOLVED, BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DES MOINES, IOWA: That the attached
communication from each contractor requesting permission to sublet designated items and the attached
Permission to Sublet form, for each project listed below, be and are hereby approved; and each subcontractor is
hereby granted permission to work on said improvement.

Activity ID Project Title Contractor

062022014 2022 HMA Residential Paving Program
Contract 2 - LOSST

InRoads, LLC
Joseph J. Manatt, CEO
4224 Hubbell Avenue
DesMoines,IA 50317

Moved by to adopt. Second by

FORM APPROVED:

s^,
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Kathleen Vandeqiool

Deputy City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION

COWNIE

BOESEN

GATTO

MANDELBAUM

SHEUMAKER

voss

WESTERGAARD

TOTAL

MOTION CARRIED

YEAS^ NAYS PASS ABSENT

APPROVED

I, Laura Baumgartner, City Clerk of said City
Council, hereby certify that at a meeting of the
City Council, held on the above date, among
other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set
my hand and affixed my seal the day and year
first above written.

City Clerk



ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT
CITY OF DES MOINES, IOWA

Activity ID 062022014

Date 9/1/2022

^/w^

)^

Project

Contractor

Federal Tax ID

PERMISSION TO SUBLET

2022 HMA Residential Paving Program Contract 2 - LOSST

InRoads, LLC

821949617 Contract No. 15975

ITEM TO BE SUBLET

Flaggers

ORGANIZATION
TO PERFORM DBE

WORK Y/N

Sublet Request No.

COST OF
SPECIALTY TOTAL COST OF

ITEMS WORK SUBLET

Flagger Pros USA
403 Whitney Avenue
Ames,IA 50010
(515)233-5975
Federal Tax ID 454124468

No $2,000.00

Cost of Items Sublet

Cost of Specialty Items Sublet

Cost of Sublet Items Less Speciality Items

Contract Amount

Contract Amount Less Total Specialty Items (d-

Percentage of Contract Sublet to Date (c/e)

Previous

Request

$449,517.16

This
Request

$2,000.00

Total
To Date

$451,517.16 (a)

(b)

(c)

$1,552,295.60 (d)

$1,552,295.60 (e)

29.09%

The prime contractor's request for Permission to Sublet the above items of work is approved with the

understanding that the prime contractor shall be held responsible for the subcontractors' full compliance of all

terms of the contract.

Attachment; Contractor's Letter

Requesting Subletting

Form Routing: Project Engr. - City Engr. -
Engr. Admin. - City Clerk/City Manager -

Engr. Admin. - Distribution

Fomi Distribution Original - Project File
Copy - Project Engineer
Copy - Prime Contractor <=%?- ^Roll Call No, Date
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From:Julie BenKjulie@inroadspaving.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 1,2022 9:07 AM
To: Eddy, Joseph A. <JAEddy@clmRov.orR>

Cc: Bruce Jorgensen <bruce@inroadspavinR.com>

Subject: RE: 2022 HMA Paving Contract 2 - Garden Road Flaggers Added

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless

you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Here is the information requested.

Thank You
Julie

From: Eddy, Joseph A. <JAEddy@dmRov.orR>
Sent: Thursday, September 1,2022 8:55 AM

To: Julie BenKiulie@inroadspaving.com>
Subject: RE: 2022 HMA Paving Contract 2 - Garden Road Flaggers Added

Julie,

Yes please send me their information and I'll get it goingthrough the system.

Thanks.

JOSEPH EDDY, P.E. | CITY OF DES MOINES
Civil Engineerll | Engineering Department
0: (515) 283-4034 I M: (515)238-0958
iaeddv@idmaov.ora [ 400 Robert D. Ray Drive] DesMoines, Iowa 50309-1891

From:Julie BenKjulie@inroadspaving.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 31,2022 9:30 AM
To: Eddy, Joseph A. <JAEddy@)dmgov.orR>
Subject: FW: 2022 HMA Paving Contract 2 - Garden Road Flaggers Added

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless

you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Joseph,

Do we need to submit Flagger Pros info to have them added to this project?

From: "Eddy, Joseph A." <JAEddy@dmRov,org>

Date: August 30, 2022 at 1:41:16 PMCDT
To: BruceJorgensen <bhiorg4352(5)Rmail,com>, bruce@inroadspavinR.com, "Bill Rosener

(bill@inroadspavinR.com)" <bill@inroadspaving.com>

Subject: 2022 H MA Paving Contract 2 - Garden Road Flaggers Added

Bruceand Bill,
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